
From: Karyna Shuliak  
To: Bella Klein <l 

Cc: Richard Kahn <I 

Subject: Re: Nangsal 
Date: Fri, 14 Jun 2019 23:13:58 +0000 

Thank you. I will send a group email including her and ask her to speak with you if she has questions about 
payment. 

On Jun 14, 2019, at 11:23 PM, Bella Klein < > wrote: 

I told same to Merwin 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

On Jun 14, 2019, at 5:00 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

Not so sure she needs to be paid for trial. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 
Phone
Fax 
Cell 

On Jun 14, 2019, at 1:15 PM, Bella Klein < > wrote: 

Hi Karyna, 
I was not aware that she worked on May 19th and 20th. Was she promised a certain hourly or daily rate, 
please let me know and we will reimburse her. I know that her official start date was June 3rd. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

On Jun 14, 2019, at 2:47 PM, Karyna Shuliak < > wrote: 
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Hi Bella, 
I received the email below from Nangsal. Please advice. 
Thank you, 
Karyna 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Nang sal
Date: June 14, 2019 at 3:15:14 PM GMT+2 
To: Karyna Shuliak
Subject: Try out pay 

Good morning Karyna, 
I would like to know how I am getting paid for the 2 days I worked in 301 ( May 19 and 20). Bella wants 
you to approve it first before I get paid. Thank you 
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