
From: Richard Kahn <E lle 
To: Stephen Bastone <EIMINI M> 

Cc: ICatyna Shuliak 

Subject: Re: 9 E. 71st St. 
Date: Tue, 18 Jun 2019 19:53:34 +0000 

thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 
tel 
fax
cell

> On Jun 18, 2019, at 2:46 PM, Stephen Bastone <EIMINI > wrote: 

> Thank you for the billing info Budd woodworking has everything ready but they are waiting on the required 
metal door closer he can get started right away with the Installation of millwork Which will take two days but 
needs that piece that's not in his control he's trying to find out how much longer It will take he Will get back to 
me by today or latest by the morning I'll let you know as soon as I hear from him 
> Best 
> Stephen 

>> On Jun 18, 2019, at 2:02 PM, Richard Kahn <M ila> wrote: 
>> 
» Stephen 
>> 
» Please address all invoices for 71st street to NES LLC 
>> 
>> Any items related to St Thomas can be billed to LSJE LLC 
>> 
>> It would be great if you can have 6th floor door installed before Mr Epstein returns next week... 
>> Is installation 1 day or multiple days.. 
>> 
» Please advise 
» Thank you 

» Richard Kahn 
» HBRK Associates Inc. 
>> 575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
»New York NY 10022 
» tel 
» faa 
» cell 

EFTA00555547



» 
» 
» 
» 
» 
» 
>>> On Jun 17, 2019, at 10:30 AM, Stephen Bastone a wrote: 
>» 
>>> Good morning Richard,I will be meeting with several vendors at 71st St. later this morning concerning 
selections Mr. Epstein made Friday evening on carpets fabric and furniture, would you like me to have estimates 
and invoices addressed to Mr. Epstein at 71st St. or do you prefer another name such as a company ,the 
wallpaper I ordered from Paris was addressed to Karyna and sent to Palm Beach, also I spoke with Caamano 
today from Bud woodworking and all his millwork is done and ready to go he is only waiting on a Metal 
mechanism concerning the fireproof door he will install as soon as he receives it which I hope will be soon 
>» Best 
>» STEPHEN BASTONE 
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