
From: ion nicola < 
To: 

Subject: RE: Ion 
Date: Sat, 01 Dec 2012 00:58:50 +0000 

Importance 
Normal 

hi sarah, 
sorry, i worked 6 days and a half (nov 20 to nov 24, nov 26, and nov 27 until 2pm) 

at the begining of the 3M project , sue asked me an estimate and i told her it would be around $2,000, and it would take 
like a week..but i was not sure exactly how many days.. 
and then i asked michael how much he charged for the apartments, and he said $2,000 for apts and $1,500 for studios.. 
.. should i talk to rich kahn? 

ps. I'm not going to work tomorrow(saturday), i will continue monday with the venetian plaster 

Subject: Fwd: Ion 
From: 
Date: Fri 30 Nov 2012 17:57:56 -0500 
To: 

Hi Ion. Did you work all 8 days during this period on 3M? 
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