
From: 

To: 

Subject: Re: motorcycles 

Date: Mon, 28 Jan 2013 14:16:30 +0000 

Importance: high 

I spoke to and Chris and have a plan. It will be delivered tomorrow - Chris is a little behind today. Just let me know where 
he wants the key left (in the condo or where). 

Hope you guys are having fun! 

Office/Admin. Manager 

Offices of 
Requiro Scientia LLC / Scio Verum Corporation / Requiro Terra LLC 
Office " Fax * Cell 

This message is directed to and is for the use of the above-noted addressee only, and its contents may be legally privileged or confidential. If the reader 
of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any distribution, dissemination, or copy of this message is strictly prohibited. If 
you have received this message in error. please delete it immediately and notify the sender. This message is not intended to be an electronic signature 
nor to constitute an agreement of any kind under applicable law unless otherwise expressly indicated hereon. 

From: 
Date: Sunday, January 27, 2013 9:11 PM 
To: 
Subject: Fwd: motorcycles 

Hi ! Did you touch base with concierge about the delivery of the motorcycle tomorrow, or would you like me to? 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: January 25, 2013, 6:37:59 PM MST 
To: 
Cc: 
Subject: Re: motorcycles 

a 
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If he can. Looks like we may not be there now but would be nice to have it when I get back. You or can ask the concierge 
to show them where to put it next to the other bike. Which is right behind our elevator bank. The elevator bank that goes to 
our unit. The concierge can hold the keys or put them in the unit. 

Thanks, 

This message is directed to and is for the use of the above-noted addressee only, and its contents may be legally privileged or 
confidential. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any distribution, 
dissemination, or copy of this message is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please delete it 
immediately and notify the sender. This message is not intended to be an electronic signature nor to constitute an agreement 
of any kind under applicable law unless otherwise expressly indicated hereon. 

On Jan 25, 2013, at 10:07 AM, " wrote: 

Chris emailed me that you wanted the bike delivered on the 28th. Is this correct? 

Regards, 

Office/Admin. Manager 

Offices of 
Requiro Scientia LLC / Scro Verum Corporation / Requiro Terra LLC 
Office-' Fax-' Cell 

This message Is directed to and is for the use of the above-noted addressee only, and its contents may be legally privileged or confidential. If the 
reader of this message Is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any distribution, dissemination, or copy of this message is strictly 
prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please delete It immediately and notify the sender. This message Is not intended to be an 
electronic signature nor to constitute an agreement of any kind under applicable law unless otherwise expressly indicated hereon. 

From: 
Date: Thursday, January 24, 2013 6:56 PM 
To: 
Subject: Re: motorcycles 

< 

It looks correct other than I thought the 600 Miles services was under warranty? I know the kickstand should be. The 
windscreen and the pips are correct. The oil is as well so long as all of that wasn't included in the 600 miles service 
warranty? I honestly don't know and trust chris but it could have been an oversight on his part. 

Thanks, 

EFTA00558035



This message is directed to and is for the use of the above-noted addressee only, and its contents may be legally privileged or confidential. If the reader of this 
message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any distribution. dissemination. or copy of this message is strictly prohibited. If you have 
received this message in error. please delete it immediately and notify the sender. This message is not intended to be an electronic signature nor to constitute 
an agreement of any kind under applicable law unless otherwise expressly indicated hereon. 

On Jan 24, 2013, at 4:00 PM, wrote: 

They took off the remaining credit from Atlantic. I have attached the invoice. I assume it's correct-let me know. 

Regards. 

Office/Admin. Manager 

Offices of 
Requiro Scientia LLC / Scro Verum Corporation / Requiro Terra LLC 
Office • Fax • Cell 

This message Is directed to and is for the use of the above-noted addressee only, and its contents may be legally privileged or confidential. If the 
reader of this message Is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any distribution, dissemination, or copy of this message is strictly 
prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please delete it immediately and notify the sender. This message is not intended to be an 
electronic signature nor to constitute an agreement of any kind under applicable law unless otherwise expressly indicated hereon. 

<Inv  2200 from Moto Corse  Pe[3].pdf> 
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