
From: Adri Gangotena  

To: 

Cc: 'Marguerite Jamesley' <I 

Subject: RE: New Order.. 

Date: Wed, 09 Jan 2013 19:42:57 +0000 

Attachments: InvoicePDF-

Inline-Images: image001.jpg 

Sure 
Please see revised invoice 
Thank you 

Adri 

Adri Gangotcna 
Senior Account Re 

Pr 

move 

Tel: x 211 
Fax: 
Email: 
Website: www.nobilis. 

Nopf91 11 S 

From: [mallto 
Sent: Wednesday, January 09, 2013 8:45 AM 
To: Adri Gangotena 
Cc: 'Marguerite Jamesley' 
Subject: Re: New Order.. 

Can you please add on another 5 yards of this to the order for a total of 25 yards. Thank you 

On Jan 8, 2013, at 3:26 PM, Adri Gangotena < 

Dear 
Thank you for being so understanding. 
Attached please find the invoice and our cc form 
Thanks 

Adri 

Adri Gangotcna 
aSenior Account Re csent tive 

Tel: x 211 
Fax: 
Email: 
Website: www.nobtlesirr, 

wrote: 
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From: {mato: 
Sent: Tuesday, January 08, 2013 11:01 AM 
To: Adri Gangotena 
Cc: 'Marguerite Jamesley' 
Subject: Re: New Order.. 

Hi Adri. I understand. We've had some issues with a few other things lately shipping there. You can send it to 
Tropical Shipping in Florida. It should be addressed to: 

Brice Gordon/LSJ/St.Thomas 
Tropical Shippin 

Thank you. 

On Jan 8, 2013, at 9:35 AM, Adri Gangotena < > wrote: 

Dear 
Marguerite has forwarded the ship to address in St Thomas, USVI for your reserve. 

Unfortunately, due to previous problems we are no longer able to ship directly to the Islands. 
Please proved an address of a broker or consolidator within the continental US, who can make the shipping arrangements 
for your parcel. 

I apologize for this inconvenience 
Thank you very much 

Add 

Adri Gangotena 
IScnior Account Rc cult ative 

Tcl: x 211 
Fax: 
Email: 
Website: www.nobilis. r 

<image001.jpg> 

From: Marguerite Jamesley (malt° 
Sent Monday, January 07, 2013 4:13 PM 
To: =It 'Adri Gangotena' 
Subject: FW: New Order.. 

Hi and Adri, 
Happy New Year! 
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Adri, can you please make the revisions on account and place the order for 20 yards of Koala 49517. The fabric will 
be sent to St Thomas. 

we have plenty of stock and the cost is $126/yard 
Thank you for your business. 
Best, 

:Marguerite 
MargucntcJamcsIcy 
Showroom Manager 

Nobilis 

10022 
Tcl: 
Fax: 
Email: 
Wcbsile: www.nobilith 
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Front: frnaitto 
Sent: Monday, January 07, 2013 3:23 PM 
To: 
Subject: New Order.. 

Hi Marguerite! Happy New Year! 
I would like to place an order for 20 yards of this fabric to be sent to: 

C 

Also, I have changed my business from a sole proprietorship to an LLC, so have a new EIN number for my 
resale certificate which is: 

Thank you! 
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