
From: 
To: Story Cowles 

Subject: Re: Re: 
Date: Fri, 19 Nov 2010 22:58:06 +0000 

nope. I said I was out of the apt by Aug. 15; the last bill I ever received was for $166 which I payed last month 
and I would contact the owner and have them deal with it. 
We told wally the had to take over the cable bills, so it wasn't like we didn't remind them 

On Nov 19, 2010, at 5:29 PM, Story Cowles wrote: 

> Ugh. Did you pay? 

> Sent from Story's iPhone 

> On Nov 19, 2010, at 5:28 PM, wrote: 

>> called comcast 
>> there is an outstanding balance of 279.29 and then they stopped service because of non payment. they said 
someone needs to return the 3 boxes, or schedule comcast to come collect the boxes to properly terminate the 
service. I told them I called in august to stop service as the boxes were already there and I was just assuming 
payment for the year I rented, etc.. 
>> anyways.. basically the boxes either need to be dropped off by Troy or he can schedule comcast to come pick 
them up.. 
>> On Nov 19, 2010, at 5:03 PM, Story Cowles wrote: 

>>> We need to take care of that! We need to pay Comcast and be reimbursed. Don't want this to do anything to 
your credit. 
>» 
>>> Sent from Story's iPhone 
>» 
>>> On Nov 19, 2010, at 5:01 PM, ale wrote: 
>» 
>>» btw.. 
>>>> got a call from a recovery company on behalf of comcast to see how they can recover the 3 cable boxes 
from everglade.. 

EFTA00559719


