
From: 

To: C> 
Subject: Re: Leah 

Date: Mon, 22 Nov 2010 00:02:47 +0000 

got it.. will do.. 
btw, is coming tomorrow to stt.. I tried to get in touch with her all day, and of course had to finally go to her 
apt to track her down only for her to tell me she got my email with flight info, but just didn't bother to respond„ 
so frustrating, 

On Nov 21, 2010, at 4:56 PM, wrote: 

> Hi =, I asked Je about the lamps that will be ready to be collected from Leah tomorrow and he said it 
would be best if you do it. It is two lamps and two painting lights, I will send you pictures. They are paid for I 
gave her a check of 5000 and a check if 15 000 and the tax in cash which was 1775. I think you will need MN to 
help you. I really hope all goes smoothly. Let me know if you need her telephone numbers. 

> Sent from my iPhone 

EFTA00559753


