
From: Sarah K  

To: Alain 
Subject: Re: 

Date: Mon, 28 Feb 2011 16:11:00 +0000 

Hello Alain, 
I have just noticed a second charge from your company in the amount of $249.95. I have not bought anything else 
from you since my initial purchase attached. Can you please explain why I was charged an additional amount and 
refund this to my account? thank you, Sarah 
I have copied the below from my online statement.. 

01/26/2011 Purchase PURCHASE LUXE CABLE AND LIG 01/25 $249.95 

On Dec 16, 2010, at 2:26 PM, Alain wrote: 

Attached is you Invoice Sarah. 
Please send me Address to be shipped to and your full name. 
I will forward a Credit Card Form Shortly.. 

Alain Farah 
LUXE cable + light 
1 NE 40th Street 
Miami, FL 33137 

305.576.6647 fx 
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