From: Sarah K q~_‘»‘
To: Diane Breslow {—
Subject: Fwd: Global Chair
Date: Wed, 22 Jun 2011 18:43:47 +0000
Inline-Images: image001 . jpg

Hi Dhane,

I've emailed Sean twice now and left him a voicemail, but have gotten no response. My client wants to use
Edelman Leather Royal Suede in color Chocolate RS13 for this chair. What is the procedure in order to confirm
if they are able to use this material or not?

Thank you for your help.

Sarah

Begin forwarded message:

From: Sean Lachance <
Date: June 20, 2011 11:19:29 AM EDT
To: Sarah K <
Cc:
Subject: RE: Global Chair

Diane

Can you let Sarah know the required yardage for the 3766 chair. Can you also email me the COM sample and
authorization form for Sarah to fill out. The original fabric chosen is on back order until late September.

Thanks for your help

Sean LaChance

2099 W, Atlantic Blvd

Pompano Beach, FL 33065
P:
F:

From: Sarah K [mailto: || G

Sent: Monday, June 20, 2011 10:45 AM
To: Sean Lachance
Subject: Re: Global Chair

Hi Sean,
Can you please let me know how many vards of fabric is required for this chair? I'm sourcing another fabric,
but don't know how much we need. thanks..

sarah

On Jun 15, 2011, at 11:01 AM, Sean Lachance wrote:

EFTA00562528



I have your authorization form,
We receive acknowledgement from Global, that the fabric is on back order and they won't have the chair until
September.

Do you want to choose another fabric?
Let me know Thanks

Sean LaChance
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2099 W. Atlantic Blvd
Pompano Beach, FL 33065

P:
F:

From: Sarah K [mailto: || G

Sent: Tuesday, June 14, 2011 10:25 AM
To: Sean Lachance
Subject: Re: Global Chair

I just faxed vou the credit card authorization form. can you pls confirm yvou received it? Also, if yvou can please
let me know the lead time on this and approximately when it might ship out?
Thank vou..

Sarah

On Jun 10, 2011, at 4:56 PM. Sean Lachance wrote:

Here you go.

Sean LaChance
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2099 W. Atlantic Blvd
Pompano Beach, FL 33065

From: Sarah K [mailto: || G

Sent: Friday, June 10, 2011 1:46 PM
To: Sean Lachance
Subject: Re: Global Chair

OK, thank you. Can you please send an invoice and I will send you the credit card info after? Thanks..

On Jun 10, 2011, at 12:57 PM, Sean Lachance wrote:

EFTA00562529



Also let me know when we can expect payment.

I've attached a credit card authorization form.
Thanks again,
Sean LaChance
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Pompano Beach, FL 33069
P:
F:

From: Sarah K [mailto: || G

Sent: Friday, June 10, 2011 10:16 AM
To: Sean Lachance
Subject: Re: Global Chair

Here is my Certificate of Authority. I would like to pay the taxed though please, so please include them in your

invoice. Thank you..

<OFW Crdit card Authorization.pdf=

<PEACHW - OFW Invoice.pdf 65674 .pdf>
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