
From: Richard Kahn ffi . 
To: Daphne Wallace 
Cc: Karyna Shuliak ffi , Bella Klein 

Subject: Re: Outdoor furniture order 
Date: Wed, 14 Mar 2018 13:48:21 4.0000 

thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York. NY 10022 

On Mar 14, 2018, at 9:34 AM, Daphne Wallace wrote: 

Greetings Rich, 

Carmen estimates 50 days production time fmm receipt of deposit. You arc sending that today 3/14, so we could estimate for this order 514/18 for leaving China. 

On Wed, Mar 14. 2018 at 8:07 AM, Richard Kahn ffi - wrote: 
thank you 
hoping vendor would update for us.. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York,n 1022 

On Mar 14, 2018, at 9:05 AM, Daphne Wallace •;: > wrote: 

Greetings Rich, 

The last estimate shipping dates from the vendors are March 20th and April 2018: 

Mar 6 (8 days ago) 
to me. 

Hi, Dear Mr. Daphne 

How are you? 

Thank you for your Email! 

We are making the order now. We just come back working. We will start to ship it next month. Thank you! 

Best regards 
Andy Ho 

Heshan Ruihui Furniture Co.,Ltd 

Websitela 

EFTA00563440



Klko Thou a Mar 5 (9 days ago) 
to me. 

Dear Daphne 
we are producing your order now, once we finish some will show you , 
it will get ready to ship about 20th March pls note. 

thanks & have good thy. 
Kiko (project Manager) 
Foshan Shunde Mange Furniture Co.,Ltd 
Foshan Momoda furnishing Co.,Ltd 
M: 

E: 

On Wed, Max 14, 2018 at 7:57 AM. Richard Kahn wrote: 
thank you 
we will send 30% deposit this morning 
any shipping updates on previous orders? 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
I IBRK Associates Inc. 
57S I r4ing t on Avenue 4th Floor 

On Mar 14, 2018, at 2:39 AM, Carmen Zhang < > wrote: 

HI Karyna, 

For your order,' already asked our production manager.the production time will be about 45days after we receive the deposit. 

Thanks 
Carmen 

• If you want more fast reply, please kindly add my Whatsapp/wechat 

2018ffin 141:1 13:59 
et*x: Carmen Zhang Bella Klein .". >; Daphne Wallace 

Wia: Richard Kahn 
Outdoor fumiturc order 

Hello Carmen, Bella, Daphne and Rich! 

I would like to connect you through this email, so that we all are on the same page with this order. 
Attached below is the invoice with the payment instructions from Carmen. Bella. could you please organize the payment of the requested deposit and send a bank receipt when it is ready? 
Daphne, could you please kindly provide the shipping instructions to Carmen. 
Carmen, arc we still looking into 50 days production time as you mentioned to me earlier? 

Thank you very much! 

Karyna 
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