
From:  1). 
To: "Laurence, Lisa"  

Subject: Re: 
Date: Tue, 02 Aug 2011 11:26:20 +0000 

Thank you. I have faxed the filled in form to 212-755-3314 if you could please confirm receipt of it. Thanks. 
On Aug 1, 2011, at 6:27 PM, Laurence, Lisa wrote: 

You may... here's the credit card form 

From: [mailto: 
Sent: Monday, August 01, 2011 2:26 PM 
To: Laurence, Lisa 
Subject: Re: 

May I pay for this with a credit card? do you have a credit card authorization form you can send me, or should I 
call to give you my credit card number? I'm out of the country for the next 2 weeks and it would be the only 
way I can pay for it. thanks. 

On Jul 29, 2011, at 2:59 PM, Laurence, Lisa wrote: 

Here's your revised proforma 

From: [mato: 
Sent: Friday, July 29, 2011 2:50 PM 
To: Laurence, Lisa 
Subject: Re: IN 

Sorry, it might be  better just to have it shipped to New York then to: 

9 E 7Ist St 
New York, NY 10021 
Thanks 

On Jul 29, 2011, at 2:44 PM, "Laurence, Lisa"   wrote: 

Here's the proforma. The freight charges to St. Thomas is just an estimate. We have no 
way of knowing what the duty will be. 
Lisa 

From: [man° 
Sent: Friday, July 29, 2011 1:58 PM 
To: Laurence, Lisa 
Subject: Re: 
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Thanks.. I do not need to see a cutting. I would like to order this please and have it shipped directly to 
St.Thomas if possible. The shipping address would be: 

If you could please send me an invoice for this. 
Thank you, 

On Jul 28, 2011, at 4:36 PM, Laurence, Lisa wrote: 

No worries... 
This item is in stock. Do you want to see a cutting? 
Net price $48/yd. 
I've placed it on reserve for you - ref 
Lisa 

From: [mailto: 
Sent: Thursday, July 28, 2011 2:14 PM 
To: Laurence, Lisa 
Subject: Fwd: 

Sony Lisa, I called you Laura by mistake! 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: Jul 28 2011 2:11:57 PM EDT 
To:" ' 
Subject: 

Hi Laura. I wanted to place an order for 8 yards of 34556-2; New Nice-Ice. Could you please let me 
know the price and if it's in stock. Thank you! 

Er 
301 E 66th St 14G 
New York NY 10065 
Account 
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