From: Karyna Shuliak - _
To: Richard Kahn H—
Subject: Re: Revised Move Estimate
Date: Sun, 22 Oct 2017 00:40:07 +0000

I see, thanks Rich...

On Oct 21, 2017, at 8:18 PM, Richard Kahn ~"~'_'-'-* wrote:

FYI
been pushing merwin all week on this but his follow up 1s average at best. ..

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

975 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: Richard Kahn </ -

Subject: Re: Revised Move Estimate
Date: October 20, 2017 at 5:44:11 PM EDT
To: Merwin Dela Cruz </ -

did you receive a revised quote?

Richard Kahn

HBERK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022
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On Oct 19, 2017, at 4:26 PM, Richard Kahn <|| | N NN - '

100 removal ok but please confirm that Insurance will be
removed as well and please have them resend quote. Thanks.

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

On Oct 19, 2017, at 4:03 PM, Merwin Dela cruz

< - rote:

Hi Rich,
Please see below

Merwin Dela Cruz
I
I

Begin forwarded message:

From: *
=

Date: October 19, 2017 at 3:34:59 PM EDT

To: Merwin Dela cruz <

Subject: RE: Revised Move Estimate

Good Afternoon Merwin,
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As per our conversation Jim has reviewed your estimate and the transportation charge of $ 3,465.00 is the cost
the Allied Driver charges us, this cannot be reduced.
We can however, deduct from our charges by 5100.00. Guaranteed price would be 54,413.00.

Kindly confirm asap if you wish to proceed as we have only one slot now left on 10/25/17.
Thank you,
Anne Marie

Liffey Wan Lines, Inc.
As Agent for Allied Van Lines

<image00l.png>

From: Merwin Dela cruz [mailto. S

Sent: Thursday, October 15, 2017 3:16 PM

To: I

Subject: Re: Revised Move Estimate

Any updates?

On Oct 19, 2017, at 9:56 AM, Merwin Dela cruz &_* wrote:

Can you please have Jim or Conner call me on my cell.

Thank you

Merwin Dela Cruz

On Oct 18, 2017, at 1:59 PM, " -, - ot

Good Afternoon Mr. Dela Cruz,
Thank you for your call. Please see attached Revised Move Estimate, revised as follows: Destination updated
to Stanley, New Mexico [Transportation remains the same). Insurance charges removed, basic insurance

included on page two.

We have availability for your move on 10/25/17, Kindly confirm if this date is suitable and also address in
Mew Mexico so we can register your shipment and forward you a contract.

We look forward to serving you.

Kind regards,
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Anne Marie
Liffey Van Lines, Inc.
As Agent for Allied Van Lines

MNew York, NY 10035.
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<Mervin Dela Cruz - Revised Estimate. pdf=

Begin forwarded message:

From: Richard Kahn </ -

Subject: Re: Move Estimate

Date: October 16, 2017 at 10:35:42 AM EDT
To: Merwin Dela Cruz <
Cc: bellaklein <

=

>, Karyna Shuliak </

thank you

what about two other quotes: IFL and Fed Ex?
please advise

thanks

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

On Oct 16, 2017, at 9:58 AM, Merwin Dela cruz _ wrote:

Please see attached from Liffey Van lines.
Thank you

Merwin Dela Cruz
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Begin forwarded message:

From: Reception Liffeyvanlines w_
Date: October 14, 2017 at 11:00:53 AM EDT

Subject: Move Estimate

Good morning Ms. Cruz.

Please see attached Mowve Estimate.

Please do not hesitate to contact our office on (212)-410-3500 if you have any questions or queries.
Kind regards,

James Clogston

Liffey Van Lines, Inc.

I

I
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