
From: Karyna Shuliak 
To: Ebby Saghian 

Subject: Re: ESTIMATE 
Date: Thu, 15 Jun 2017 18:56:54 +0000 

Hi Ebby, 

This is Karyna. I haven't heard back from you regarding the estimate for the 301 E 66th St, apt.11P project. 
Please advice. 
Thank you, 

Karyna 

> On Jun 8, 2017, at 11:45 AM, Ebby Saghian <MMI=I > wrote: 

> Hi Karyna, 
> I just left you a message. 
> I checked the fabric and it is available as of now. it is a little more than the other fabric. 
> I discounted all just like your privious and the total of this job will be 5040.27 
> Please let me know. 

> Kind regards, 

> Ebby Sa hian 
> Phone 
> Fax, 
> Off on Fridays 

EFTA00565469


