From: [N - -
To: Bella Klein H—*
Subject: Re: [l exp. report
Date: Wed, 07 Sep 2011 20:09:37 +0000

It all looks OK.

On Sep 6, 2011, at 3:56 PM, Bella Klein wrote:

Hi . Attached please find _ expense report. Can you approve it for reimbursement or we should

take 1t to JE?
Thank you,
Bella

Begin forwarded message:

From:
Date: September 6, 2011 4:34:46 PM EDT
To:

Subject: Message from KMBT C253
Reply-To: NI
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