
From: 

To: Lina  

Subject: Fwd: JSC Interiors_Artefacto_Amex authorization_05/26/16 

Date: Thu, 26 May 2016 19:43:16 +0000 

Attachments: doc00393520160526125221.pdf 

Hi Lina, 
Please see below the authorization form requested. 
Let me know once the order is processed. 
Thank you, 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: bellaklein 
Date: May 26, 2016 at 2:22:33 PM EDT 
To: 
Cc: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: JSC Interiors_Artefacto_Amex authorization 05/26/16 

here is the form 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On May 26, 2016, at 2:19 PM, bellaklein > wrote: 

Hi 
As per your request authorization form attached. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Fwd: SLK designs invoice 
Date: May 25, 2016 at 2:34:39 PM EDT 
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To: Richard Kahn < 
Cc: Lina Varela < 

Hi Rich, 
Please review below the new invoice from Artefacto and fill out the attached forms if everything is correct. 
Thank you! 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Lina Varela
Date: Ma 25, 2016 at 1:37:25 PM AST 
To: 
Subject: RE: SLK designs invoice 

Hello Karina, 

Please find attached the Order with discount applied and under the name of 
the new Company. 

Please fill it out, and I will proceed the payment. 

Let me know if you have any questions. 

Thank you, 

Lina Varela 
Interior Design Consultant 
Artefac to 
17651 Biscayne Blvd 
Aventura, FL 33160 

 Original Messa e 
From: [mailto 
Sent: Tuesday, May 24, 2016 5:37 PM 
To: Lina Varela 
Subject: SLK designs invoice 

Hi Lina, 
As per our conversation, please see the invoice attached with one of our 
previous orders.. 
Thank you, 
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MR 
<JSC INTERIORS LLC.pdf> 

<Credit Card Authorization 1 .doc> 

<TERMS & CONDITIONS.pdf> 
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