From: Karyna Shuliak _
To: Lina Varela <[ N

Subject: Re: JSC Interiors Artefacto Amex authorization 05/26/16
Date: Tue, 31 May 2016 22:46:10 +0000

Hi Lina,
I need to cancel the order for the Cuba mirror. Please contact me as soon as you get this.
Thank you!

Karyna.

On May 27, 2016, at 1:12 PM, Lina Varela ﬂ—'-'-* wrote:

Hello Karing,

| hope everything is well.

The payment was successfully, we are sending to production today.

Let me know if you need anything else, | will be more than happy to assist you.

Thank you,

Lina Varela
Interior Design Consultant
Artefac to
17651 Biscayne Blvd
Aventura, FL 33160
Direct Line: ||| GGGc—_
T:
r:

www.artefacto.com

From: Karyna Shuliak [mailto: |

Sent: Thursday, May 26, 2016 3:43 PM
To: Lina
Subject: Fwd: 15C Interiors_Artefacto_Amex authorization_05/26/16

Hi Lina,
Please see below the authorization form requested.
Let me know once the order 1s processed.

Thank vou,

EFTA00567238



Karyna.

Begin forwarded message:

From: bellaklein <||
Date: May 26, 2016 at 2:22:33 PM EDT

To: Karyna Shuliak = =
Ce: Richard Kahn < -

Subject: Re: JSC Interiors Artefacto Amex authorization 05/26/16

here 1s the form

EFTA00567239



