
From: Karyna Shuliak 

To: Cindy Reed <MNIMII > 

Subject: Re: order 16-1530 

Date: Fri, 15 Apr 2016 18:17:30 +0000 

Great! Thank you. 

> On Apr 15, 2016, at 2:17 PM, Cindy Reed <MNIMIla> wrote: 

> Karyna, 
> You are all set. 
> It will arrive on Tuesday by the end of the day. 
> Thank you, 
> Cindy 

>> On 4/15/2016 2:03 PM, Karyna Shuliak wrote: 
>> Hi Cindy, the transaction has been authorized. You can go ahead and process it again if it did not go through 
yet. 
» Thanks, 
» Karyna. 

>>> On Apr 15, 2016, at 1:26 PM, Cindy Reed <MNIMIla> wrote: 
>» 
>» Karyna, 
>>> I think you might have to call the number on the back of the card and authorize us to process your card for 
payment. 
>>> Cindy 
>» 
>>>> On 4/15/2016 1:22 PM, Karyna Shuliak wrote: 
>>» Hi Cindy, 
>>>> I would be happy to help, what exactly do you need me to do? 
>>>> 
>>>>> On Apr 15, 2016, at 1:14 PM, Cindy Reed <MNIMIll > wrote: 
>>>» 
>»» Hi Karyna, 
>>>>> We have your order ready for shipping, But the credit card is coming up with and error message to call 
for authorization. If you could check on this and get back to me that would be great. 
>»» Thank you, 
>>>>> Cindy 
>>>» 
>>>» --
>>>» Cindy Reed 
>»» MegaPrint Inc. 
>>>» Dept. 
>>>» 
>>>» 
»>--
»> Cindy Reed 
>» MegaPrint Inc. 
>>> Shipping/Purchasing Dept. 
>» 
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>>> Fax 603-536-1411 
> 
> --
> Cindy Reed 
> MegaPrint Inc. 
> Shipping/Purchasing Dept. 

EFTA00567739


