
From: Karyna Shuliak <Ma 

To: Eric Herman a> 

Cc: a Richard Kahn 

Subject: Re: Approved floor sample 

Date: Tue, 20 Oct 2015 19:10:34 +0000 

Hi Eric, 
We are approved to proceed with the floor work in 2G. When would be the soonest you could begin? And how 
long would the work take? 
I cc'd Rich Kahn here, he is responsible for the financial part, you can discuss the payment details with him. 
Will check on insurance certificate and let you know. 
Thanks, 
Karyna. 

> On Oct 14, 2015, at 9:12 AM, Eric Herman a wrote: 

> Sounds good. If insurance certificate is required please send us info. And let us know when you'd like to begin 

> Best Regards, 
> Eric Herman 
> President 
> State Of The Art Wood Floor Gallery 

>> On Oct 14, 2015, at 8:35 AM, Karyna Shuliak <a> wrote: 

>> Ok, no need then. I will email it to our financial coordinator. 

>>> On Oct 14, 2015, at 8:33 AM, Eric Herman a> wrote: 
>» 
>>> Great. The original quote is accurate. Will resend this am 
>» 
>» Best Regards, 
>» Eric Herman 
>» President 
>>> State Of The Art Wood Floor Gallery 

>» 
>» 
>>>> On Oct 14, 2015, at 8:26 AM, Karyna Shuliak <E > wrote: 
>>» 
»» I see, I was not sure. 
>>>> Great, then we would like to proceed with it please. 
>>>> Would you please send me a quote for it? 
>>» Thanks, 
>>» Karyna. 
>>» 
>>>>> On Oct 14, 2015, at 7:01 AM, Eric Herman a wrote: 
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>>>» 
>»» Hi 
>>>>> They are both the same stain and finish. You will get variation between planks 
>>>» 
>»» Best Regards, 
>»» Eric Herman 
>»» President 
>>>>> State Of The Art Wood Floor Gallery 
>>» 
>>» 
>>>» 
>>>» 
>>>>>> On Oct 13, 2015, at 11:07 PM, Karyna Shuliak <M E> wrote: 
>>>>» 
>>»» Hi Eric, 
>>>>>> We chose the sample on the right side of the picture ( it is slightly longer). 
>>>>>> Could you please send me a quote for it ( I am not sure if it is any different from the initial one)? 
>>»» Thank you, 
>>>>>> Karyna. 
>>>>» 
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>>>>» 
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