From: " IINNNEGEGEEE - -
To: I -
Subject: Re: Re: Outdoor furniture invioce
Date: Wed, 10 Jan 2018 05:05:36 +0000
Attachments: Outdoor furniture invioce.xlsx

Hi, Dear Karyna Shuliak

Nice to hear from you!

The next step is you arrange the deposit USD4850, then we start to make the products you
purchase. When all the goods make out, | take photos to you to see it. And you arrange the
balance. Then we start to ship it

By the way, you want us to do the shipping or you find a shipping agent to do the shipping?

Best regards
Andy Ho

Heshan Ruihui Furniture Co.,Ltd

WhatsApp: NN

Wechat: I
Te!: I

website:http: /|

From: Karyna Shuliak
Date: 2018-01-10 12:13

To: [N

Subject: Re: Outdoor furniture invioce

Dear Andy,

Thank you very much for providing the new quotation. | agree to have 10 all white dining sets in
order to fill the container.

| would like to proceed with the purchase. Please advice what should be the next step.

Thank you,

Karyna

On Jan 9, 2018, at 1:01 AM, | NG . ote:
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Hi, Dear Karyna Shuliak

Thank you for your quick reply!

The dining table set we can make it in white color. And | make an invioce here . Please check it.
Base on the total CBM, | suggest you order 10 sets. If you order 10 dining table sets, it is a full
40GP container. 8 dining table sets will waste you about 3 CBM of the container. What do you think

of it?

And it is the end of the year now. The delivery time maybe a little late. Once we make out, | will
inform you to ship it. Thank you!

Best regards
Andy Ho

Heshan Ruihui Furniture Co.,Ltd

WhatsApp: NN

Wechat: I
Te!: I
Website:http.//

From: Karyna Shuliak
Date: 2018-01-09 12:23

To: [N

Subject: Re: White color dining table sat

Dear Andy,
Thank you for your response.

| would like to double the amount of the furniture please, so that the total amount will be as
follows:

-1 seat sofa x 40 pieces (in AM08 common rattan and A14814 fabric)

-3 seat sofa x 20 pieces (in AM08 common rattan and A14814 fabric)

-Ottoman x 40 pieces (in AM08 common rattan and A14814 fabric)

-Dining table with chairs x 8 sets (If you could make it fully white that would be best, otherwise |
will order white frame as on the picture you sent).

Could you please send the final quotation sheet for the order?

Thank you very much,
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Karyna

On Jan 8, 2018, at 2:03 AM, | NEGNNGNGEGEGEGEGEGE .ot

Hi, Dear Karyna Shuliak

Nice to hear from you again!

The sofa size | write in the quotation sheet is suitable. Don't worry.

And we have the white color frame dining table set. | attached the picture here. Please check it.
By the way, would you like to add 1 more set dining table set? This order can add 1 more
dining table set to rach a full 20ft container CBM.

Any problem, please feel free to contact me. Thank you!

Best regards
Andy Ho

Heshan Ruihui Furniture Co.,Ltd

WhatsApp: N
Wechat: I

Te!: [
Website:http.//

From: |

Date: 2018-01-08 14:14
To: Judy Qin; Andy Ho
Subject: [Alibaba Reply Motification] Karyna Shuliak has replied you

L
www.Alibaba.com

Trade Center P:24.** ** 02
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Karyna Shuliak from United States has replied you

Reply Now Manage Your Orders

=
s Karyna Shuliak

Hi Judy Qin
Dear Andy,

Thank you for your prompt response.

Could you please verify the dimensions for one seat sofa (chair) and the ottoman (stool).
One seat sofa dimensiones on the website are listed as 95x83x67, however on the
quotation sheet it is 85x85x66. Ottoman dimensions on the website are T2x72x33, and on
the quotation sheet 60x60x43.

Also, could you please confirm if the dining table with dining chairs are available in white
color?

Thank you very much!

Karyna
e Latest outdoor patio furniture corner
sofa design UsS %
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