
From: Merwin Dela cruz
To: Karyna Shuliak 

Cc: bellaklein Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Move Estimate 
Date: Mon, 23 Oct 2017 17:31:32 +0000 

Liffey Van lines is coming on Wednesday 10-25-17 to pick up the items. 
Can you please ask Mr Epstein if that's ok? 

Thanks 

On Oct 21, 2017, at 8:02 PM, Karyna Shuliak wrote: 

Mr. Epstein was surprised it wasn't gone by now. We should definitely have a set date on Monday please. 

On Oct 21, 2017, at 7:40 PM, Merwin Dela cruz > wrote: 

We will try and finalize everything on monday. 

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone 

On Saturday, October 21, 2017, 7:37 PM, Karyna Shuliak 

Hi Merwin, 

Do we have a date for the move yet? 

Thanks, 

Karyna 

On Oct 16, 2017, at 11:21 AM, Richard Kahn 

> wrote: 

wrote: 

estimate weight and please call IFL every day as we cannot move forward until we have other quotes 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fa 
cel 
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On Oct 16, 2017, at 11:15 AM, Merwin Dela cruz wrote: 

Still waiting for IFL. I thought Liffey would measure but they did not. Fedex will be tough as they need 
the weight. We don't have a weighing scale for big stuff. 

Thanks 

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone 

On Monday, October 16, 2017, 10:35 AM, Richard Kahn 

thank you 
what about two other quotes: IFL and Fed Ex? 
please advise 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
eel 

wrote: 

On Oct 16, 2017, at 9:58 AM, Merwin Dela cruz > wrote: 

Please see attached from Liffey Van lines. 

Thank you 

Begin forwarded message: 
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From: Reception Liffeyvanlines <sales@liffeyvan.com>
Date: October 14, 2017 at 11:00:53 AM EDT 
To: 

Subject: Move Estimate 

Good morning Ms. Cruz. 

Please see attached Move Estimate. 

Please do not hesitate to contact our office on 

Kind regards, 

James Clogston 

Liffey Van Lines, Inc. 
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<Lif7ey Van Lines Inc ..vef> 

<Dela Cruz LD Estimate.pdf> 

if you have any questions or queries. 
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