
From: Sarah K  Pi•
To: Nadia -4 

Subject: Re: Re: 
Date: Tue, 04 Oct 2011 18:32:45 +0000 

Holy shit balls. What does it include?? 

On Oct 4, 2011, at 2:30 PM, Nadia <I  wrote: 

Yeah, I thought he might change his mind... 
LV just sent him the cost estimate for the Africa trip (162k) And I think that doesn't even include fuel.. 

From: Sarah K 
To: Nadia M 
Sent: Tuesday, October 4, 2011 1:07 PM 
Subject: 

Hello dear. I think I am going to have to bail on Ikea tonight. JE told me to book a ticket to Paris on Thurs and I 
have a bunch of shit I want to get done before that. Im hoping I won't have to go in the end cause he still seems 
quite unsure of the schedule. You never know. 
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