
From: Richard Kahn 

To: Sonam Dema 

Cc: Bella Klein Karyna Shuliak 

Subject: Re: payroll 

Date: Fri, 04 Aug 2017 13:17:37 +0000 

ok 
karyna please confirm hours and we will pay sonam today at office and payroll will begin monday august 7th 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

On Aug 4, 2017, at 9:03 AM, Sonam Dema wrote: 

Dear Richard, 
Please find the following for my past two weeks hours: 

26th july 9 am to 5 pm 
27th july 9 am to 5 pm 
28th july 9 am to 5 pm 
31st july 9 am to 4 pm 
1st August 9 am to 5 pm 
2nd August 10 am to 5:30 pm 
3rd August 8 am to 5:30 pm 

4th August today I started at 8:00 am and finishing hour I will let you know at 
the end of the day 

On Aug 3, 2017, at 7:03 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 
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Yes. Sony for the error. Salary is 50,000 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 
Phone
Fax 
Cell 

On Aug 3, 2017, at 7:01 PM, Sonam Dema > wrote: 

Thank you Mr. Richard 
Regarding my salary, if I am not mistaken I was agreed with $50000 without health insurance. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Aug 3, 2017, at 5:34 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

it was nice seeing you earlier 

to recap your salary will remain at 45,000 

you will need to complete your paperwork at home and email or bring in early next week 

your payroll will begin 8-7-2017 

regarding the past two weeks please send your hours to karyna, bella and i and bella will pay you 
tomorrow 

bella and i are in the office all day tomorrow 

thank you 

Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 

New York, NY 10022 

tel 

fax 

cell 
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