From: Richard Kahn H—
To: Karyna Shuliak <[

Subject: Re: ESTIMATE
Date: Thu, 04 May 2017 21:16:22 +0000

ok
will call him and pay tomorrow
thanks

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

On May 4, 2017, at 5:13 PM, Karyna Shuliak ~_« wrote:

Would it be ok for yvou to process the payvment please? then I would take over from there and be in touch with
them regarding the installation

Please advise.

Thank you!

On May 4, 2017, at 5:10 PM, Richard Kahn *—P wrote:

do you want to take over and pay and be in touch with Ebby or do you prefer 1 do so
please advise

thanks

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor

New York, NY 10022
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On May 4, 2017, at 5:09 PM, Karyna Shuliak »_a wrote:

Thank you so much Rich!

On May 4, 2017, at 4:35 PM, Richard Kahn *-—-?' wrote:

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com=
Subject: Re: ESTIMATE
Date: May 4, 2017 at 4:34:31 PM EDT

To: Richard Kahn <[ -

ok

On Thu, May 4, 2017 at 4:02 PM, Richard Kahn <|| R - ot
was able to reduce 5178.20 to 4717.66 for 460.54 savings or 8.9% discount
please advise if ok to proceed
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

te! N
fax I
cell NG
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Begin forwarded message:

From: Ebby Saghian <[ -

Subject: RE: ESTIMATE
Date: May 4, 2017 at 4:00:18 PM EDT
To: Richard Kahn </ -

Good afternoon Richard,

I contacted our sales manager and they approved some extra discount and by that it brought the total
down by -460.54.

50 the new discounted total will be 4717.66

Please let me know 1f you want me to proceed.

Kind regards,

Ebby Saghian
Phone,
Fax,

Off on Fridays

Sent: Thursday, May 4, 2017 2:21 PM
To: Ebby Saghian
Subject: ESTIMATE

thanks for your time
can yvou please send me vour best pricing as discussed
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel

fax
cell

Begin forwarded message:

From: Ebby Saghian </ - | o -

Date: May 3, 2017 at 1:14:18 PM EDT
To: " ‘mailto:
<mailto:

Subject: RE: ESTIMATE
Hi Karyna,

Good news, the fabric is good stock.
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51 yards of fabric at 52.00 = 2652.00 -20% = 2121.60
freight = 76.50

Labor to make the drapes = 1466.00

Tracks = 470.00

Freight = 40.00

Installation = 582.00

Total = 4756.10 + Tax = 5178.20

Please let me know if you have any questions and if you want me to proceed.

Kind regards,

Ebby Saghian
Phone,
Fax,

Off on Fridays
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