
From: Cecile de Jongh  
To: Karyna Shuliak < 
Cc: Karyna Shuliak  >, Daphne Wallace

Subject: Re: Documents- St. Croix 
Date: Tue, 17 Nov 2015 18:23:20 +0000 

Great! Congrats again and Happy Thanksgiving!!!! 

With warm regards, 

Cecile 

On Tuesday, November 17, 2015 2:18 PM, Karyna Shuliak <tEl > wrote: 

Yes, this should be all, at least for now. 
Thanks again, 
Karyna. 

On Nov 17, 2015, at 1:01 PM, Cecile de Jongh < > wrote: 

I believe this concludes everything, right? 

With warm regards, 

Cecile 

On Tuesday, November 17, 2015 1:56 PM, Karyna Shuliak <:MI > wrote: 

Excellent! Thank you very much ladies! 

> On Nov 17, 2015, at 11:32 AM, Cecile de Jongh aMIE > wrote: 

> Hi Karyna, 

> Your $200 money order and your dental documents were delivered to the Dental Licensure Office 
on St. Croix. The date and initials on the upper right hand of the page are the evidence that it was 
filed. The initials are those of Ms. Liger. 
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> With warm regards, 
> 
> Cecile 
> 
> Sent from my iPhone and misspellings courtesy of iPhone. 
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