
From: Daphne Wallace
To: Karyna Shuliak 

Cc: Rich Kahn < >, Janusz Banasiak

Subject: Re: Side table for LSJ 
Date: The, 20 Oct 2015 12:46:37 +0000 

Greetings Karyna, 

An accurate description, a Country of origin, and a value. 

Kind regards, Daphne 

On Oct 20, 2015 8:42 AM, "Karyna Shuliak" > wrote: 
I don't have an invoice for this. Daphne, can you create one? If so, information would you need? 

> On Oct 20, 2015, at 2:19 PM, Janusz Banasiak wrote: 

> Hi Karyna in order to ship these tables will need invoice for Tropical Shipping. 
> Thanks Janusz 
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