
From: Daphne Wallace
To: Richard Kahn <I 
Cc: Janusz Banasiak < >, 

Subject: Re: Side table for LSJ 
Date: Wed, 21 Oct 2015 13:44:43 +0000 

Attachments: Invoice_for Two_Artefacto_Bedside_Tables_from_PBl.pdf 

Greetings Janusz, 

Attached please find the revised invoice for the 2 Artefacto bedside tables now valued at $3,699. 

Kind regards, DW 

On Tue, Oct 20, 2015 at 4:09 PM, Richard Kahn < 
attached values were amount we paid in October 2014 
please revise invoice using 75% of purchase price 

thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

> wrote: 

On Oct 20, 2015, at 3:54 PM, Daphne Wallace < > wrote: 

Greetings Janusz, As promised, please see attached. Kind regards, DW 

-------- Forwarded message 
From: Daphne Wallace <1 
Date: Tue, Oct 20, 2015 at 2:40 PM 
Subject: Re: Side table for LSJ 
To: Karyna Shuliak 
Cc: Richard Kahn Janusz Banasiak < 

Greetings Karyna, 

Thank you. Janusz I will create the invoice and send it to you shortly. 

Kind regards, DW 

On Tue, Oct 20, 2015 at 1:35 PM, Karyna Shuliak wrote: 

EFTA00573822



Thanks Daphne, 
Here is the information from the invoice when this was ordered (the invoice is attached below, but there are 
many other items on that order). 

ZEPP III BEDSIDE TABLE - SECTIONAL 01 - W/ 04 ASAP DRAWERS - ROBLE - 19 3/4 X 193/4 X 25 1/2 H 
Finish GRAY POLISHED 

Unit price: $2,465.96 (this is the price of one bedside table, we are shipping two) 

Country of origin is not listed. The company name is "Artefacto". it is based in Brazil, the showroom 
location was in Florida, US. But I do believe they manufacture their furniture in Brazil. 

Below is also the picture of the items as described on the website, as well as the invoice when this was 
ordered. 
Thanks, 
Karyna. 

On Oct 20, 2015, at 8:46 AM, Daphne Wallace < wrote: 

Greetings Karyna, 

An accurate description, a Country of origin, and a value. 

Kind regards, Daphne 

On Oct 20, 2015 8:42 AM, "Karyna Shuliak" < wrote: 
I don't have an invoice for this. Daphne, can you create one? If so, information would you need? 

> On Oct 20, 2015, at 2:19 PM, Janusz Banasiak < > wrote: 

> Hi Karyna in order to ship these tables will need invoice for Tropical Shipping. 
> Thanks Janusz 

<Invoice for Two Artefacto Bedside Tables from PBI.pdf> 
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