

Statement

Statement Date: Statement No.

10/27/2017	860
------------	-----

Terms Due Date

NET 10 days	11/6/2017
-------------	-----------

Tonja Haddad, PA
 Advocate Building



954.467.1223

Bill to

Darren Indyke Jeffrey Epstein 575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor New York, New York 10022 United States
--

Case Name	PO No.	Billing Type	Rate
Rothstein Edwards Litigation		Retainer - Hourly	425.00

			Amount
Total hours:		75.05	31,896.25
Work Hours			
Date	Description	Hours	
10/1/2017	Review and respond to multiple correspondence.	0.50	
10/2/2017	Teleconference with co-counselors. Review and respond to communications. Conduct research and prepare for hearing.	5.80	
10/3/2017	Prepare for and attend hearings on Motions. Meetings with co-counselors,	12.10	
10/4/2017	Communications with client. Review SJ Opposition Motion and begin drafting Motion for Sanctions.	2.70	
10/5/2017	Conduct additional research and finalize Motoin for Sanctions. Communications with co-counselors regarding same. Review Verified Answers to Interrogatires. Review communications from Scarola regarding expert witness.	6.50	
10/6/2017	Review and respond to emails from opposing counsel and co-counselors. Review Proposed Order and send proposed revisions.	2.50	
10/9/2017	Review Transcript from hearing of October 3.	1.30	
10/10/2017	Communications with co-sounselors. research regarding recusal. Fraft Answers to Expert	5.10	
Page No. 1			

Work Hours

Date	Description	Hours	
	Interrogatories.		
10/11/2017	Conduct additional research and draft response to Edwards's Motion in Limine. Revise answers to expert interrogatories and file. Draft Motion to Disqualify Judge.	11.80	
10/12/2017	Review and respond to multiple correspondence. Teleconferences with DKI.	3.80	
10/13/2017	review timeline of CVRA case, transcripts, and edits to Motion. Communications with co-counsel. Review discovery filed by co-counsel and served upon Edwards.	3.10	
10/16/2017	Review additional witness list. Multiple communications with client and co-counsels regarding mediators, new co-counsel, and case.	3.70	
10/19/2017	Hearing to procure hearing dates in West Palm. Communications with co-counsels.	3.80	
10/20/2017	Receive and review Proposal for Settlement, Expert reports, and Deposition Designations. Communications with co-counsel and opposing counsel.	2.40	
10/23/2017	Review correspondence and Notices for Mediation and Deposition. Communications with co-counsels regarding same.	1.20	
10/24/2017	Travel to and attend meeting with new attorneys.	7.90	
10/26/2017	Multiple communications with co-counsels and opposing counsel regarding dates and documents.	0.85	
	Total hours:	75.05	
		Amount	31,896.25
		Subtotal	31,896.25
		Total Due	31,896.25