
Emad Hanna 

From: 
Sent: Friday, uecemoer 04, 2009 9:22 AM 
To: Emad Hanna 
Subject: Fwd: Fountain 

Emad 

this is approved for payment. 
Requesting a wire transfer for next week, any questions please call 
Thx 

 Original Message 
Fro • et 
To: 
Sent: Tues. Nov 24. 2009 11:16 am 
Subject: Fountain 

Brice, 
I am re-submitting this request for change order. There was more labor involved to expose areas for 
both the electrician and plumber. We added additional reinforcing, instead of using wire welded 
mesh, we used a rebar mat, spaced 1' x 1' on center. We mixed in an additive into the the concrete 
mix design to waterproof it and did two (2) 7" pours. We formed the interior to allow the estancia to 
continue to drain and installed angle iron to install drain grates. We mixed all the concrete on site 
because the local plants would not make that mix design for a small quantity. 

price of change order is 2400.00 plus tax 

Thank you *X imbo 
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