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From: O‘Hara, Michelle
Sent: Wednesday, October 26, 2005 6:29 PM
To: Gruss, Perry

Subject: FW: Updated N41VB Operating Budget
Attachments: DZ Airplane Expenses.xls

Perry,
:Jusi so you're in the loop on DZ airplane deal... -

MO

From: Kahn, Harold

Sent: Tuesday, October 25, 2005 2:23 PM -
To: O'Hara, Michelle

Subject: RE: Updated N41VE Operating Budget

But you didn't format for letter printing... :). Very good...now a little more of your
magic....since we will be borrowing at L + 250 under the Citi line we are now finalizing, we
should add an interest factor of the same amount to these advances from the time of
advance. Too big a pain in the butt to do? Doesn't need to be "exact/exact" but a reasonable
effort would be fine. Also, we should probably treat the LC amount separately from the other
amounts that will be reimbursed on a quarterly basis, i.e., "a permanent advance” until such
time as DZ disposes of the plane, but the quarterly commitment fee (based on 2.5% -
annual) on the LC should be charged to DZ's "revolving™ account.

hdk

~ From: O'Hara, Michelle
Sent: Tuesday, October 25, 2005 1:53 PM
To: Kahn, Harold-
Subject: RE: Updated N41VB Operating Budget

- Hi Harold,

" Altached is a summary of all the items related to DZ's Airplane expenses. Please have a Iuok& let ma know
'uirhai you think.

MO
1

Frum. Kahn, Harold

Sent: Tuesday, October 25, 2005 9:45 AM

To: O'Hara, Michelle :

Cc: Law, Li Anne; Gruss, Perry

Subject: FW: Updated MAIVE Operating Budget

Confidential Treatment Requested

By Fried Frank Harris Shriver & Jacobson LLP DEZ 0004487

EFTA00599602
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M - - Pls arrange wire per the attached...amount to be added to DZ's prepaid account. When
you get a sec, let's discuss the calc of the amount ultimately receivable from DZ upon receipt
of his mgmt fee distribution. -

hdks

Confidential Treatment Requested
By Fried Frank Harris Shriver & Jacobson LLP DBZ 0004488

EFTA00599603
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