

Podhurst Orseck, P.A.

City National Bank Building, Suite 800
25 West Flagler Street
Miami, Florida 33130-1780

Miami (305) 358-2800
Fort Lauderdale (954) 463-4346

LD. # 59-1263738

September 25, 2008
Reference No.: 14835

Kirkland & Ellis, LLP
Attn: Jay P. Lefkowitz, Esq.
153 East 53 Street
New York, NY 10022

Client: 5501 – Kirkland & Ellis, LLP
Matter: 30608 - Epstein, Jeffrey adv. USA

Date	Atty	Services	Hours	Amount
11/23/07	RCJ	Preparation ; Research; Case Management	2.75	2,062.50
11/26/07	RCJ	Preparation ; Research	0.75	562.50
11/27/07	RCJ	Preparation ; Research	0.50	375.00
11/28/07	RCJ	Preparation ; Research	0.25	187.50
11/29/07	KWE	Meeting with RCJ, RAR and SFR re: internet research	3.00	1,275.00
11/29/07	RCJ	Facts Investigation	1.75	1,312.50
11/29/07	RAR	Meeting with RCJ, KWE and SFR; Review documents.	1.00	325.00
11/30/07	RCJ	Facts Investigation	2.25	1,687.50
12/01/07	RCJ	Preparation ; Facts Investigation	2.00	1,500.00
12/03/07	RCJ	Preparation ; Facts Investigation	0.50	375.00
12/04/07	RCJ	Preparation ; Research; Facts Investigation	1.00	750.00
12/05/07	RCJ	Research ; Conference	0.75	562.50
12/11/07	RCJ	Preparation ; Facts Investigation	0.50	375.00
12/13/07	RCJ	Telephone call ; Facts Investigation	0.75	562.50
08/20/08	RCJ	Preparation ; Research	1.75	1,312.50
08/21/08	RCJ	Preparation ; Research; Facts Investigation	1.25	937.50
08/22/08	RCJ	Preparation ; Research	1.75	1,312.50
08/25/08	RCJ	Preparation ; Research	3.00	2,250.00
08/27/08	RCJ	Preparation ; Facts Investigation	2.25	1,687.50

Date	Atty	Services	Hours	Amount
09/02/08	RCJ	Preparation ; Research	0.50	375.00
09/02/08	KWE	Telephone call ; E-mails to Bert Patton (forward) and RCJ.	0.25	106.25
09/03/08	RCJ	Preparation ; Research; Case Management	1.75	1,312.50
09/03/08	KWE	Telephone call ([REDACTED]; M [REDACTED]; S [REDACTED] companies.	3.50	1,487.50
09/04/08	KWE	Telephone call with [REDACTED]; [REDACTED] emails with RCJ; Reviewed files and correspondence.	1.50	637.50
09/05/08	RCJ	Preparation ; Research; Telephone	0.50	375.00
09/05/08	KWE	Telephone call message from [REDACTED] Conference with RCJ and Bert Patton.	0.25	106.25
09/08/08	RCJ	Conference ; Preparation; Telephone; E-Mail	1.25	937.50
09/09/08	RCJ	Preparation ; Telephone	0.75	562.50
09/09/08	KWE	Conference with RCJ; Reviewed and prepared client information form; Prepared retainer agreement.	2.50	1,062.50
09/10/08	RCJ	Preparation ; Conference; Research	2.00	1,500.00
09/10/08	KWE	Travel from downtown to meet with RCJ and Amy Ederi; Conferred about strategies, procedures, plan for representation.	2.75	1,168.75
09/11/08	RCJ	Preparation ; Research; Facts Investigation	1.25	937.50
09/11/08	KWE	Review wavier letter prepared by client; Email [REDACTED] and RCJ.	0.25	106.25
09/12/08	RCJ	Preparation ; Case Management; Telephone	0.75	562.50
09/15/08	KWE	Preparation retainer agreement; Review questionnaire; Telephone call from [REDACTED], Amy Josefsberg; Conference with Amy Josefsberg and RCJ.	5.50	2,337.50
09/15/08	RCJ	Conference ; Preparation; Telephone	3.75	2,812.50
09/16/08	KWE	Case Management re: file opening number and organization; Telephone calls to [REDACTED]; Reviewed correspondence from Herman; Email to [REDACTED]; Reviewed correspondence [REDACTED]; Reviewed CV's prepared by psychiatrist; Email [REDACTED]; Telephone call with [REDACTED]; Emails confirming appoints; Revised [REDACTED]	7.00	2,975.00
09/17/08	IXY	Research on the [REDACTED] information on victims; [REDACTED] within our list and [REDACTED].	6.50	975.00
09/17/08	KWE	Conference with Iliana Yarzabal and Javier A. Dominguez re: attempting to locate victims; Long telephone call conference planning with Amy Ederi; Preparation of [REDACTED] Many telephone calls with RCJ, [REDACTED] victims, Amy Ederi; [REDACTED]	9.00	3,825.00

Date	Atty	Services	Hours	Amount
09/17/08	RCJ	Preparation ; Research; Facts Investigation	4.75	3,562.50
09/18/08	IXY	Research on the web; MySpace and Facebook for information on victims; [REDACTED]	6.00	900.00
09/18/08	RCJ	Research ; E-Mail; Conference	3.00	2,250.00
09/19/08	IXY	Research on the web; [REDACTED] for information on victims; [REDACTED]	6.00	900.00
09/19/08	RCJ	Facts Investigation ; Preparation; Research	2.50	1,875.00
09/20/08	RCJ	Preparation ; Research	1.25	937.50
09/22/08	JDP	Research of court docket, printing new documents and review of docket sheet.	0.50	37.50
09/22/08	KWE	Travel to and from West Palm Beach- met with 2 victims and [REDACTED] numerous telephone calls- planning; Reviewing [REDACTED]	10.00	4,250.00
09/23/08	KWE	Telephone call with Amy Ederi (many times); Organizing information and documents; Telephone call with [REDACTED] Prepared letter to [REDACTED], 3 telephone calls with [REDACTED], Telephone call with [REDACTED] Updated client information list.	6.00	2,550.00
09/24/08	KWE	E-Mail (many) with Amy Ederi; Prepared letter to clerks; Emails to and from RCJ; Preparation of task list; Case management re: research; Reviewed CV's of experts; Prepared letter requesting school records.	3.25	1,381.25
09/24/08	RCJ	Preparation ; E-Mail; Telephone	1.25	937.50
09/25/08	RCJ	Research ; Facts Investigation	0.75	562.50
Total For Services:				\$63,718.75

Summary Of Services

	Hours	Rate	Amount
Jessica De Paula	0.50	75.00	37.50
Katherine W. Ezell	54.75	425.00	23,268.75
Robert C. Josefsberg	49.75	750.00	37,312.50
Ramon A. Rasco	1.00	325.00	325.00
Iliana Yarzabal	18.50	150.00	2,775.00

Date	Expenses	Amount
	Photostats	270.20
	Telephone Charges	3.20
	Total For Expenses:	\$273.40
Total for Services and Expenses This Invoice:		\$63,992.15
Total Amount Due:		\$63,992.15