

# Podhurst Orseck, [REDACTED].

City National Bank Building, Suite 800  
25 West Flagler Street  
Miami, Florida 33130-1780

Miami (305) 358-2800  
Fort Lauderdale (954) 463-4346

ID. # 59-1263738

February 24, 2009  
Reference No.: 15112

Kirkland & Ellis, LLP  
Attn: Jay P. Lefkowitz, Esq.  
153 East 53 Street  
New York, NY 10022

AND

Roy E. Black, Esq.  
201 South Biscayne Blvd., Suite 1300  
Miami, FL 33131

Client: 5502 -Kirkland & Ellis, LLP  
Matter: 30608 -Epstein, Jeffrey (COMMON) adv. USA

Date	Atty	Services	Hours	Amount
01/12/09	KWE	E-Mail re: [REDACTED] evaluations	0.25	106.25
01/14/09	KWE	Telephone call with all plaintiffs counsel.	1.25	531.25
01/20/09	KWE	Review emails; Telephone call conference with EBS; Amy Josefsberg Ederi, RCJ re: [REDACTED] issues; [REDACTED], etc.	0.25	106.25
01/20/09	IXY	Preparation of charts to keep track of medical records ordered and received from medical providers.	2.00	300.00
01/21/09	KWE	Meeting with Amy Josefsberg Ederi and EBS; Telephone call with [REDACTED]	1.50	637.50
01/23/09	KWE	Telephone call with RCJ re: various issues; Telephone call with [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] Telephone call with [REDACTED]; Conference with Amy Josefsberg Ederi re: work to schedule and do [REDACTED]	2.25	956.25
01/25/09	EBS	Research re: [REDACTED]	1.00	225.00
01/25/09	KWE	Review pleadings in [REDACTED] cases.	0.50	212.50
01/26/09	EBS	Research re: [REDACTED]	0.25	56.25
01/26/09	EBS	Research re: [REDACTED] email correspondence with A Ederi, K Ezell re same	7.25	1,631.25
01/26/09	EBS	Research re: [REDACTED] conference with B Josefsberg re: same	0.75	168.75

Date	Atty	Services	Hours	Amount
01/26/09	RCJ	Preparation ; Telephone	0.25	187.50
01/26/09	KWE	Review research of EBS; Reviewed pleadings [REDACTED]	1.50	637.50
01/26/09	KWE	[REDACTED] s. Telephone call to and from [REDACTED] Telephone call with [REDACTED]; Brandy Macaluso (2x); Conference with Amy Josefsberg.	1.00	425.00
01/27/09	EBS	Conference with K Ezell re [REDACTED] and statutory damages research; email correspondence with A Ederi re: same; research re [REDACTED] and statutory damages; telephone conference with A Ederi re [REDACTED] and statutory damages research	8.50	1,912.50
01/27/09	RCJ	Conference ; Preparation; Telephone	0.25	187.50
01/27/09	KWE	Conference with EJE; Conference with Victor Mas re: billing.	0.50	212.50
01/27/09	KWE	Conference with EPS re: Research about [REDACTED] Emails.	0.25	106.25
01/28/09	JDP	Research of court docket, printing new documents and review of docket sheet	0.25	18.75
01/28/09	EBS	Research re [REDACTED] and statutory damages; telephone conference with A Ederi re: statute of limitations and statutory damages research; conference with K Ezell re: statutory damages research	5.25	1,181.25
01/28/09	RCJ	Preparation ; Telephone	0.25	187.50
01/29/09	EBS	Research re [REDACTED] and use of criminal evidence in civil action; email corr. w K Ezell re: same	4.00	900.00
01/29/09	KWE	E-Mail to Amy Josefsberg Ederi; RCJ and EBS re: research and defense response.	1.00	425.00
01/30/09	EBS	Research re [REDACTED] and use of criminal evidence in civil action; email corr. w K Ezell re: same	2.00	450.00
01/30/09	RCJ	Preparation ; Research; Telephone	0.75	562.50
01/30/09	EBS	Research re: retroactivity of 2006 Amendment	4.00	900.00
01/30/09	IXY	Preparation of additional records to send to [REDACTED] letter to [REDACTED] enclosing medical records.	1.00	150.00
01/31/09	RCJ	Preparation ; E-Mail	0.25	187.50
01/31/09	EBS	Research re [REDACTED] and use of criminal evidence in civil action	2.00	450.00
02/02/09	EBS	Research re [REDACTED] and retroactivity of 2006 amendment; email corr w KE and AE re same	8.50	1,912.50
02/03/09	EBS	Research re: retroactivity of 2006 amendment, including extensive review of legislative history email corr w KE and AE re same; research re [REDACTED], drafting legal memo re same	8.25	1,856.25
02/03/09	RCJ	E-Mail ; Preparation	0.50	375.00
02/03/09	KWE	Review EB's research re: USC [REDACTED]	0.50	212.50
02/04/09	EBS	Research re [REDACTED] conference with A. Ederi re same; memo to file re: research; research re:	7.50	1,687.50

Date	Atty	Services	Hours	Amount
		legislative history of [REDACTED]		
02/04/09	RCJ	Telephone call ; Preparation; E-Mail	0.75	562.50
02/04/09	KWE	E-Mail	0.25	106.25
02/05/09	EBS	Research re legislative history of [REDACTED];	0.75	168.75
02/05/09	RCJ	E-Mail ; Telephone	0.50	375.00
02/06/09	EBS	Review pleadings in other state and federal suits v. JE; draft memo to file re: same; email corr w A. Ederi re same	7.50	1,687.50
02/06/09	RCJ	E-Mail ; Conference; Telephone	0.75	562.50
02/06/09	KWE	E-Mail ; Telephone call from [REDACTED]	0.25	106.25
02/07/09	RCJ	Telephone call ; Conference	0.50	375.00
02/08/09	RCJ	Telephone call ; E-Mail	0.25	187.50
02/09/09	EBS	Review of [REDACTED] collateral interview with mother	0.75	168.75
02/09/09	EBS	Review pleadings in other state and federal suits v. JE; draft memo to file re: same; email corr w/ B. Josefsberg, K. Ezell and A. Ederi re same	7.50	1,687.50
02/09/09	JDP	Research of court docket, printing new documents and review of docket sheet.	0.50	37.50
02/09/09	RCJ	E-Mail ; Preparation	0.50	375.00
02/10/09	RCJ	Preparation ; Conference; Telephone	0.75	562.50
02/10/09	EBS	Review potential federal and state law claims v. JE; email corr w/ B. Josefsberg, K. Ezell and A. Ederi re same; conferences with B. Josefsberg re settlement negotiations	9.25	2,081.25
02/10/09	IXY	Review records; letter to [REDACTED] additional medical records.	1.00	150.00
02/10/09	IXY	Review all files, update chart to follow-up on records not received; phone calls to schools for transcripts; phone calls to medical providers to follow-up on request.	4.00	600.00
02/10/09	KWE	E-Mail re: scheduling of calendared entries; misc.	0.50	212.50
02/11/09	EBS	Review potential federal claims; drafting model federal complaint; fact research in support of settlement negotiations; email corr w/ JE, A. Ederi re fact research in support of settlement negotiations	8.75	1,968.75
02/11/09	RCJ	E-Mail ; Telephone	0.50	375.00
02/11/09	IXY	Review files to determine records still missing; continue following up on missing records.	4.00	600.00
02/11/09	KWE	Telephone call with [REDACTED] re: interviews; records, etc; Conference with Amy Josefsberg Ederi; Conference with EBS.	0.75	318.75
02/12/09	EBS	Draft federal complaint; fact research in support of settlement negotiations ([REDACTED] each victim's visits with JE; email corr. re same [REDACTED])	8.25	1,856.25
02/12/09	RCJ	Preparation ; E-Mail	0.50	375.00
02/12/09	KWE	E-Mail with [REDACTED]; Amy Josefsberg Ederi and EBS	0.25	106.25

Date	Atty	Services	Hours	Amount
		re: interviews generally; Case management.		
02/13/09	EBS	Research in support of statutory damages (legislative history); email corr w K. Ezell re [REDACTED] for abuse cases;	5.00	1,125.00
02/13/09	RCJ	Briefing ; Facts Investigation; Case Management	0.50	375.00
02/13/09	IXY	Review records; letter to Dr [REDACTED] additional medical records.	2.00	300.00
02/13/09	IXY	Preparation of second request to hospitals/doctors and schools re: records not received	2.00	300.00
02/13/09	KWE	E-Mail re: scheduling; team mailing; Conference with Iliana Yarabal re: organization of files; Reviewed articles; Reviewing research done by EBs; Review early files re: dated of involvement for RCJ; Miscellaneous.	5.25	2,231.25
02/14/09	EBS	Review Shifting Burden of Proof (Legal Guide for Survivors and Their Supporters)	2.50	562.50
02/15/09	RCJ	E-Mail ; Preparation	0.25	187.50
02/15/09	EBS	Review [REDACTED] (resource for survivors, including explanation of damages (physical and psych. effects of child sex abuse)	2.00	450.00
02/16/09	RCJ	Preparation ; Facts Investigation	0.50	375.00
02/16/09	IXY	Review ; organize files; medical records; follow-up on outstanding requests.	5.00	750.00
02/17/09	EBS	E-Mail re: review of secondary source on legal strategy for settlement and potential damages claims	4.75	1,068.75
02/17/09	RCJ	Telephone call ; Preparation; Facts Investigation	0.75	562.50
02/17/09	IXY	Review ; organize files, records.	3.00	450.00
02/18/09	EBS	Conference, Facts Investigation w client; conference with AE, SB, RCJ re settlement negotiations, strategy	9.75	2,193.75
02/18/09	IXY	Meeting with Mr. Josefsberg and staff re: review of files and status of records.	3.50	525.00
02/18/09	RCJ	Telephone call ; Conference; Preparation; Research; E-Mail	3.75	2,812.50
02/19/09	EBS	Draft response letter to JE and counsel and [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; meetings with RCJ re same; conference with AE re [REDACTED]	7.25	1,631.25
02/19/09	RCJ	Conference ; Facts Investigation; Preparation; Research	1.50	1,125.00
02/20/09	EBS	E-Mail re [REDACTED]; revisions to letter to J Laikowitz re [REDACTED]	2.75	618.75
02/20/09	RCJ	Conference ; Preparation; Facts Investigation	2.25	1,687.50
02/21/09	KWE	Telephone call with RCJ; Telephone call with Amy Josefsberg Ederl- status re: meeting of team; Herman's suspension; Status of demands, negotiations; what	1.25	531.25

Date	Atty	Services	Hours	Amount
		needs doing.		
02/23/09	JDP	Research of court docket, printing new documents and review of docket sheet.	1.00	75.00
02/23/09	EBS	Conference with [REDACTED] re fact research in support of settlement negotiations; conference with KE re same	5.75	1,293.75
02/23/09	KWE	Conference with Iliana Yarzabal re: update status; Conference with EBS re: recap of team meeting; strategies and status.	0.50	212.50
02/24/09	KWE	E-Mail ; Telephone call with Amy Josefsberg Ederi.	0.50	212.50
02/24/09	RCJ	Preparation ; Research; Telephone	0.75	562.50
<b>Total For Services:</b>				<b>\$57,881.25</b>

**Summary Of Services**

	Hours	Rate	Amount
Jessica De Paula	1.75	75.00	131.25
Katherine W. Ezell	20.25	425.00	8,606.25
Robert C. Josefsberg	17.50	750.00	13,125.00
Evelyn B. Sheehan	141.75	225.00	31,893.75
Iliana Yarzabal	27.50	150.00	4,125.00

Date	Expenses	Amount
01/30/09	Conference Expense: CL4534/1-21-09	37.49
01/30/09	Conference Expense: CL4534/1-21-09	15.28
02/05/09	Miscellaneous - Client CL6017-E.Shehan Reim./US Dept Justice Report	38.99
02/10/09	Federal Express Corp. - delivery charge CL6820-Fed Ex	43.17
02/11/09	Federal Express Corp. - delivery charge CL7704-Fed Ex	53.50
02/12/09	Miscellaneous - Client CL8001-[REDACTED]/Periodical Research	20.64
02/24/09	Conference Expense: CM0568/2-18-09	109.42
02/24/09	Federal Express Corp. - delivery charge CM0566-Fed Ex	20.68
	Photostats	274.80
	Facsimile Charges	32.00
	Telephone Charges	132.33
	Westlaw Legal Research	792.12
	Postage	154.07
<b>Total For Expenses:</b>		<b>\$1,724.49</b>

**Total for Services and Expenses This Invoice:**

**\$59,605.74**

**Total Amount Due:**

**\$59,605.74**