

Podhurst Orseck, [REDACTED]

City National Bank Building, Suite 800
25 West Flagler Street
Miami, Florida 33130-1780

Miami (305) 358-2800
Fort Lauderdale (954) 463-4346

[REDACTED] # 59-1263738

August 14, 2009
Reference No.: 15331

Kirkland & Ellis, LLP
Attn: Jay P. Lefkowitz, Esq.
153 East 53 Street
New York, NY 10022

Client: 5502 -Kirkland & Ellis, LLP
Matter: 12109 -Epstein, Jeffrey re [REDACTED]

Date	Atty	Services	Hours	Amount
03/18/09	KWE	Telephone call from [REDACTED]; Telephone call to [REDACTED]; Emails to and from team; Prepared of letter and enclosures.	2.00	850.00
03/18/09	IXY	Preparation of letters to schools to request transcripts.	0.50	75.00
03/19/09	KWE	Conference with Amy Josefsberg Ederi; RCJ; Iliana Yarzabal by email re: SOL, interview and evaluation.	0.50	212.50
03/20/09	KWE	Conference with Amy Josefsberg Ederi; 2 telephone call with [REDACTED] re: scheduling.	0.25	106.25
03/24/09	KWE	Telephone call on 3/23 and 3/24; Telephone call with Amy Josefsberg on 3/24.	0.50	212.50
Total For Services:				\$1,456.25

Summary Of Services

	Hours	Rate	Amount
Katherine W. Ezell	3.25	425.00	1,381.25
Iliana Yarzabal	0.50	150.00	75.00

Total for Services and Expenses This Invoice:

\$1,456.25

Date	Atty	Services	Hours	Amount
		call with Amy Josefsberg Ederi; Prepared letter to client and [REDACTED]		
01/09/09	KWE	Revisions to two letters to [REDACTED] and her [REDACTED]; Telephone call to [REDACTED] office; Telephone call with Amy Josefsberg Ederi; Prepared package to send.	1.25	531.25
01/12/09	KWE	E-Mail with Amy Josefsberg Ederi; Case Management.	0.25	106.25
01/19/09	KWE	Conference with Amy Josefsberg Ederi re: [REDACTED] visit; travel plans, etc; Conference with RCJ and JDE.	0.50	212.50
01/21/09	EBS	Review case file in preparation for drafting complaint	2.25	506.25
01/23/09	KWE	Travel to and from Wachula; Collateral interviews with [REDACTED]; Facts investigation and conference with client re: [REDACTED]; Telephone call's with [REDACTED].	12.50	5,312.50
01/28/09	KWE	Telephone call with Amy Josefsberg about [REDACTED]; Telephone call from [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED], miscellaneous emails from and to EPS, RCJ and Amy Josefsberg Ederi; Case management.	1.50	637.50
01/29/09	KWE	Telephone call from and to [REDACTED]; Telephone call from [REDACTED] Telephone call to and from Amy Josefsberg Ederi.	0.25	106.25
02/11/09	KWE	E-Mail ; Conference with Amy Josefsberg Ederi; Conference with Iliana Yarzabal re: records; Telephone call with [REDACTED], [REDACTED] and Amy Josefsberg Ederi.	2.00	850.00
02/12/09	IXY	Telephone call with [REDACTED] office re: outstanding records for client; sending records again via federal express.	1.00	150.00
02/12/09	KWE	Conference with Iliana Yarazabal re: records; Long telephone conference with [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] and Amy Josefsberg Ederi; Emails and phone calls with Amy Josefsberg Ederi and [REDACTED]; Research re: [REDACTED] and article.	1.75	743.75
02/18/09	IXY	Telephone call w/Client re: following up on missing records.	0.50	75.00
02/23/09	KWE	Review emails; status report; emails.	0.25	106.25
02/26/09	EBS	Review and analyze comments to draft [REDACTED] complaint; conference with AE, SB, re: [REDACTED] settlement negotiations and drafting of complaint	0.25	56.25
02/26/09	KWE	Conference with Amy Josefsberg Ederi; EBS; Reviewing other complaints; Looking for [REDACTED] complaint; Editing draft; Telephone call with Amy Josefsberg Ederi and RCJ.	3.00	1,275.00
02/27/09	EBS	Review comments to draft [REDACTED] complaint; conference with AE, SB re: [REDACTED] settlement negotiations and drafting of complaint	1.25	281.25
03/02/09	KWE	Telephone call ; Check in call by client.	0.25	106.25
03/06/09	KWE	Conference with Amy Josefsberg Ederi re: evaluation	0.50	212.50

Date	Atty	Services	Hours	Amount
03/11/09	KWE	and treatment plan; Telephone call with [REDACTED]; Telephone call with Amy Josefsberg Ederi re: [REDACTED]; Emails; Reading draft complaint.	0.50	212.50
03/12/09	EBS	Draft complaint	3.00	675.00
03/13/09	KWE	Conference with EBS re: draft complaint.	0.25	106.25
03/13/09	EBS	Draft complaint	1.75	393.75
03/15/09	KWE	Review draft complaint; Reviewed Judge Mana's decisions.	0.50	212.50
03/16/09	KWE	Preparation of complaint with Amy Josefsberg Ederi.	2.00	850.00
03/16/09	EBS	Draft complaint	2.00	450.00
03/17/09	KWE	Telephone call to and from client; Conference with Amy Josefsberg Ederi; Emails with EBS; Reviewed portions of complaint.	1.00	425.00
03/17/09	EBS	Draft complaint; corr w team re same	2.50	562.50
03/18/09	KWE	Review [REDACTED] complaint.	0.25	106.25
03/22/09	KWE	Review lasted draft complaint.	0.50	212.50
03/24/09	KWE	Telephone call with [REDACTED]; Telephone call conference with RCJ and [REDACTED]; Conference with AJE; Conference with RCJ; Review file; Telephone call from and to [REDACTED]; Reviewed file; Rough calculation of damages.	1.25	531.25
03/25/09	EBS	Draft complaint	2.00	450.00
03/25/09	KWE	Telephone call re: [REDACTED]; Telephone call conference between Amy Josefsberg Ederi, Susan Bennett and me; Conference with Team re: preparation complaint; Telephone call from [REDACTED].	1.00	425.00
Total For Services:				\$23,043.75

Summary Of Services

	Hours	Rate	Amount
Katherine W. Ezell	45.75	425.00	19,443.75
Evelyn B. Sheehan	15.00	225.00	3,375.00
Iliana Yarzabal	1.50	150.00	225.00

Total for Services and Expenses This Invoice:	\$23,043.75
Past Due Balance:	9,456.15
Total Amount Due:	\$32,499.90