112008 3:38:46 PM Pre-Billing Report

. Client Information Section
biling Atty: RCJ Robert C. Josefsberg

Client Coda: 5502

Client Name:  Kirkland & Eliis, LLP
Biling Address: Kirkland & Elils, LLP

Attry: Jay P. Lefuowitz, Esq.

A

Fage 1

153 East 53 Street
New York, NY 10022
Biling Date:  November 10, 2009 Fees Billed Thru Date: October 31, 2009 Costs Billed Thru Date: October 31, 2009
MATTERS ON THIS BILL
MATTER FEES COSTS TOTAL
12109 - Epstain, Jeffrey re IR 27,593.75 38,49 27,632.24
TOTAL OF ALL MATTERS (1) ON THIS BILL 27 593.75 38.48 27.632.24

— =

Matter Information Section

Matter: 12109 - Epstein, Jeffrey re Jili#

Billing Atty: RCJ Robart C. Josefsberg Bill Cycle: N
|nitiating: RCJ Robert C. Josafsberg Misc 1:
Responsible:  RCJ Robert C. Josefsberg Misc 2:
Alternate: KWE Katherine W, Ezell Misc 3:
Billing Group: Mattar Trusl Bal.: $0.00 Malter Pre-Paid Bal.: $0.00
Long Styla Mame:
Fee Detalls for Matter: 12109 - Epstein, Jefirey (e Sl
Codes _F(E?'nﬂ{l'-ifhrmh Final Sill Amt
Date Services BiliNo-Bill Ay Aclvy Task  Ewvent s Amount Hours  Amount
03/26/09  E-Mail re: scheduling. KWE EM CMBass 026 10825
0373108 Preparation of letter to ‘ Case KWE P CMB0E2 0.50 212580
Management re: documents.
04/08/09  E-Mail re: role in state case; Conference KWE  EM CNSD18 1.00 425.00
with lliana Yarzbal and Amy Josefsberg
Ederi.
04/00/08  Case Management re: interview and Jane KWE  CM CNS043 1.00 425.00
Doe issue; Emails with client and Amy
Josefsberg Ederi.
041402  Review ; Received and reviewed additional KWE RV CNS103 0.25 106.25
records.
0420008  Conference ; Travel; Preparation RC) © CH4231 1.50  1.125.00
0421/08  Review records received; letter to SEEEEE» XY RV CN5439 4.00 800.00
with records; follow-up on additional
records.
04127108 Telephone call from and to il Conference ~ KWE T CNB635 0.25 10825
with Amy Josefsherg Ederi re: @l
0472808  Telephone call (several); Conference with KWE T CNoOT4 0.75 n|TE__
lliana Yarzabal re: scheduling evaluations
and interviews; Conference with client re:
schedule.
05/01/08  Conference with Amy Josefsberg Ederi; KWE C CNg320 0.50 212.50
Scheduling; Email client.
050508 Review 'inhwiaw by Recary. HWE RV CNO252 1.00 4200

EBS

EFTA00600854



Pre-Biling Report Page 2
11/10/2009 3:39.46 PM

Chent: 5502 - Kirkland & Eliis, LLP
Matter: 12109 - Epstein, Jeffrey re @

Fee Details for Matter: 12109 - Epstein, Jeffrey re P

Codes iral (i dierent) Final Bill Amt
Date Services BilyNc-Bill Ally  Aclvy Task  Evenl rs  Amount Houors  Amount
0507108 Conference rediIERN—— [ COa062 0.00 000
Review of file; Ml
05/10/09 Talﬂnne call with Amy Josefsberg Ederi KWE T CP2021 0.50 212.50
re:
05/11008  Travel to and from Palm Beach- Met with KWE TR ChaTes 1400 595000
client along with Amy Josefsberg Ederi; For
long initial interview; Telephone call with
RCJ.
0517109 Meeting with Eﬁg@m! and Amy KWE MTG CP2028 0.25 106.25
Josefsberg re:
0528009  Draft authorization to release JERG_G_G_G_ AMR  DRAF CO5054 0.25 LR
0528109  Letter todiRexplaining what the enclosed AMR  LTR CO505S 0.50 a7.50
authorizations meant.
052809 Research R file. AMR R CO5057 1.00 75.00
0528008  Conference with Annette Rasco re: KWE C CO73x 0.75 eTs__
®Prepared
letter to client.
05/29/02  Preparation of Authorization for Release of iy P cos5108 1.00 150.00
Records; letter to client.
0528008 Conference with Amy Josefsbeg Eder] re: KWE C CO7347 1.00 42500
; Conference with
Annelte Rasco; Review of letter request o
L
080109 Conference with Annette Rasco re: letter Kwe C CO7360 0.75 318.75
request toJie
060809 Case Management re HPPD releases and KWE  CM cP1709 025 10625__
prepare for meeting.
061009 Conference with Amy Josefsberg Ederi; KWE C CP1178 0.26 106.25
Prepared for meeting.
081802  E-Mail ‘s with client i re: ytse XY EM CP1876 0.50 75.00
ey
D6/23/09  Preparation for meeting. KWE P CP2252 0.25 10825
06/24/08  Travel to Hollywood to meet with Amy KWE TR CP3841 450 191250
Josefsberg Ederi and client; Conference
with collateral's; Obtain physiological
evidence; Conference re: settlement.
07101708  Review ; Exchanged emaifs with Annette KWE RV CP8eg2 0.50 212.50
Rasco m:&.
07112109 E-Mail from and to Amy Josefsberg Ederi, KWE EM CP8361 0.25 108.25 _
07M7T08  E-Mail to members of team re: names KWE EM Cragaz 0.25 106.25
being suggested for depositions; Telephone
call to client and from lliana Yarzbal, Amy J.
Ederi and RCJ; Telephone call from J. Hill's
office; Emai
0772008  Review email instructions and prepared KWE RV CQ0207 0.25 10825__

email to client re: witnesses and requests
for documents, c...interviews.

-r -— A _— L
—

T aEnaEE - e —
07279 Preparation emails seeking information. KW P ©0Q3556 0.25 0625
07/28/09  Preparation ; Dictation RCJ P Q3251 0.50 0000
08/02/09  E-Mail from Amy J. Ederi; Emails to client. KWE EM caabes 0.50 212.50

EFTA00600855



Pre-Billing Report Page 3
1171002009 3:38:48 PM

Client: 5502 - Kirkland & Ellis, LLP
Matter: 12109 - Epstein, Jeffrey re e

Fee Details for Matter: 12109 - Epstein, Jeffrey re Jilk

Codes Original (¥ defierani Final BN Amt
Date Services Bill/Mo-Bill Aty Aclvy  Task Event Hours  Amount Hours Amacint
08/02/08  Review of file in preparation for drafting of JED RV co3zes 275 412.50
complaint.
08/03/08  E-Mail to client re: meeting; preservation KWE EM CO3796 0.50 2250
issues; questions,
0an409  Review of file [l in preparation eusmgy  vED RV €Q3390 400  600.00
"
08/05/08  Review of file receipt and review of JED RV ©03420 5.50 82500
detective interview of S
080609 Draft ; Began i JED  DRAF ca3421 8.50 ers00___
0806/08  E-Mail from and 1o JlPre: medical records: KWE EM CQ3873 1.00 42500
SRR time to meet.
08/06/09  Conference with Jimmy Doddo re: KWE G Caame 0.25 1wea2s_
- . -
0807/09  Draft R JED  DRAF C03469 1.00 160.00_ _
0807109  Conference with lliana Yarzbal re: medical KWE C CO4023 0.25 106.25
records for client.
0810/08 E-Mail client re: records and contacts KWE EM CQ7568 0.50 21280
needed; Conference with lliana Yarzabal.
021102 Preparation of letter to request medical XY p CcQ4219 1.00 150.00
records from s
locate counselor on web.
08/14/08  E-Mail KWE EM coaqes 0.25 108.25
0819708  Reviewing file, looking for information; KWE  RVW COB7T8 0.50 21280
Conference about S
0820/08  Telephone call with Amy J. Ederi and client; KWe T Ccasaisd 0.50 21280
Conference about documents neaded,;
medical information; status and WR;
0&25/08  Reviewing notes re: memo preparing KWE RVW CQanss 0.50 21250__
revisions to memorandum,
0825/08  Telephone call to A re: meeting: KWE T cQe107 0.50 212.50
updating information.
08/31/08  Draft ; Meeting with K. Ezell; continuedw®@®  JED  DRAF CRO5%8 2.25 BYIS0___
]
0901/08  Telephone call from and to SR, Email KWE T CRO364 0.25 106.25
to Amy J. Ederi.
0801109 Telephone call 2x to YR Returned KWE T CROST7 0.25 106.25
call; scheduling.
0801/0%9  Document Review ; Continued review and JED DR CROB01 3.00 45000
PR . [\iecting with K. Ezell,
080209 Draft ; Com JED DRAF CRO603 4.25 637.50
SRS circulation of the same.
0904/09  Tealephone call ; Conference RCJ T CR4488 025 200,00 .
020409 E-Mail from @R Telephone call with Amy J. KWE EM CR4949 150  637.50
Ederi; Email to RCJ and Amy J. Ederi;
Telephone call with RCJ and Amy J. Ederi;
Ermnail with Sl Reviewed interviewing
. noles; forward information to Amy J. Ederi, . ) 3
0910/08  Preparation : RCJ P CR4864 026  20000_
0911109 Telephone call re: telephone call with ol KWE T CR5690 050 21250

Conference abounlll Schedule

EFTA00600856



Pre-Biling Report Page 4
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Client 5502 - Kirkland & Ellis, LLP

Matter: 12109 - Epstein, Jeffrey re«ik
Fee Details for Matter: 12100 - Epstein, Jeffrey re ik

Codes irval {f difleroni) Final Bill Amt
Date Services BillNo-Bifl Ally  Actyy Task  Event r&  Amount Hours  Amount
interview, Prepared email 1o client; Email
Amy J. Ederi.
091508 Telephone call with @K; Telephone KWE T CR5722 0.50 2250
conference with Amy J. Ederi and #ilka
Telephone calls tuhe
081608 Travel with Amy J. Ederi to meet and KWE TR CR5T24 550 233750
interviewymimms Telephone call with il
and Amy J. Ederi.
0818108  Case Management re: collateral interview KWE CM CRS5T43 025 10825
S Tclephone call from Amy J.
Ederi.
0821709  Preparation of emall; Conference with Amy KWe P CRa6e7 0.50 21250
J. Ederi; Telephone call to client; Email
from client.
0822/08  E-Mail from client; Email letter to KWE EM CRB727 0.25 10625
authorization to client.
0926/08  Telephone call conference with client and KWE T CR9399 100 42500
Amy J. Ederi: Telephone call to TS
—
082708 Telephone call conference with client and KWE T CRra402 1.00 42500
Amy J. Ederi; Telephone call toJmme-
V2909 Telephone call from Amy J. Ederi; KWE T Cs7408 0.25 W0625_____
Telephona call conference with Amy J.
Ederi and client discussing many things,
ee-_____ 1}
Summary of FEES by Attormey Code
Alty Code  Attomey Name Hours Rate Amount
AMR Annette M. Rasco 1.75 75.00 131.25
JED Jimmy E. Doddo 29.25 150.00 4,387.50
KWE Katherine W. Ezell 47.00 42500  19,875.00
RCJ Robert C. Josafsberg 1,50 750.00 1,125.00
RCJ Robert C. Josefsberg 1.25 800.00 1,000.00
EBS Evelyn B. Sheehan 0.00 0.00 0.00
XY lliana Yarzabal 6.50 150.00 g75.00
- Total for Services 87.25 27,593.75 | Billable time 87.25 27,593.75
Non-billable time 0.00 0.00
Suppressed ime 0.00 0.00

Amound billed - Fees
Disbursements Details for Matter: 12109 - Epstein, Jeffrey re P
Cash

) Expense

Data Expenses Adv Ref# Event Coda  Vendor Qnty  Amount Bill Amt
0407/09  Telephone Charges (561)306-5322 N 203 CN1081 LD : 2 065
0414/08  Medical reconds: CHOB58-TMBHC e SR 4 -5-05 A 107458 CN1T15 MR TMBHC 139.00 _
04/24/09  Pholostals M 2214 CNS5EZ COPY 1 020
O4/28/08  Telephone Charges (561)306-5322 M 203 CNBT55 LD 1 065
05/05/08  Filing Fee: CNTE7EEER— A 1077168 CN7BB8 FF Clerk of Court 35000
05M14/09  Conference Expense: CNEE13-K Ezall'Wesl Palm/5-09 A 107812 COO0258 CE Kathy Ezsll 4335
051409  Federal Express Comp. - delivery charge CO0882-Fed Ex A 107831 COOT4T FE Fed Ex 19.74 _
05/14/09 Federal Express Corp. - dalivery charge CO0582-Fed Ex A 107831 COO804 FE Fed Ex 17.34

05M18/09 Telephone Charges NN M 217 CO1887 LD 2 129

Talephone Chargo s/
EFTA00600857



Client. 5502 - Kirkiand & Ellis, LLP
Matter: 12109 - Epstein, Jeffrey re AH

Fre-Billing Report

Disbursements Details for Matter: 12109 - Epstein, Jeffrey re AH

Page §
11112008 3:3%:48 PM

Cash Expensa
Date Expenses Ady Ref# Event Code Vendor Cinity Amount Bill Amil
051809 M 217 COo18M LD 1 0.85
052709  Talephone Charges JANEEESE N 224 CO48E3 LD 5 805
0520/09 Photostats M 5122 CO5683 COPY 1 0.20
QINEI09  Corference Expenss: CPT262-K Ezell/Clhent Mg /6-24-00 A 108377 CPT7423 CE Kathy Ezell 2038
08/14/09 Cost Reimbursement: Costs reduced from fee paid thru 32508 A CO5665 CREM -609.32
0W15/08  Telephane Charges SN M 203 CR3643 LD 2 1.46
DW2509  Miscellaneous Travel CREZ23-Amy Josafsberg/West A 109042 CRT026 MT Ay Risth 3r.03
Palm/g-08 Josefsberg Ederl
L Amourd Billed - Expanses 38,49
r——fvance vs. Non-Cash Summary————
Advanced expenses 26.52
Mon-cash expenses 11.87
Tatal Costs 38.49
Summary of COSTS by Expense Code
Coade Expense Total
CE Conference Expense: T2.T3
COPY  Photostats 0.40
CREM Cost Relmbursement: 604,32
FE Faderal Express Corp. - delivery charge ar.os
FF Filing Fee: 350.00
LD Telephone Charges 11.57
MR Medical records: 139,00
MT Miscallansous Travel: ar.03
Total Costs for this matter 530,45
TOTALS for Matter: 12109 - Epstein, Jeffrey redll}
Total Fees this matter 27.583.75
Total Cosls this matter 38.49
Total Fees and Costs for Matter: 12109 $27,622.24

EFTA00600858



