

Amy Josefsberg Ederi [REDACTED]
12990 S.W. 74 Court
Miami, Florida 33156
(305)-582-0119

Re: Jeffrey Epstein
Billing Statement for November 16, 2008-December 31, 2008

November 16, 2008- Phone conference w/ SB re 11/17 interview of [REDACTED] and meeting w/ [REDACTED]; Meeting w/ SB re 11/17 interview and meetings ([REDACTED]); Phone call w/ [REDACTED] re 11/17 interview ([REDACTED]); Research; Email to KE and ME; File organization for 11/17 meeting- .25 hrs; 1. hr; .125 hrs; .25 hrs; .125 hrs; .25 hrs- 2. hours

November 17, 2008- Obtained letter for [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Prepared interview questionnaire for interview of [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Emails w/ KE and RCJ; Phone calls w/ SB re 11/17 meetings; Printed rough draft notes from 11/10 [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Skimmed [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; Drive to WPB preparing for interviews of [REDACTED] and interview of [REDACTED] (including [REDACTED] and call to [REDACTED] and call from RCJ ([REDACTED])); Meeting w/ [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] and SB re [REDACTED] and signed letter ([REDACTED]); Review w/ SB re meeting w/ [REDACTED], phone message to [REDACTED], phone call w/ [REDACTED] and phone call w/ RCJ ([REDACTED]/General); Interview of [REDACTED] w/ SB ([REDACTED]); Drive to Miami reviewing meeting w/ [REDACTED] and interview of [REDACTED], phone conference w/ RCJ and SB ([REDACTED]/General); phone messages w/ [REDACTED], phone conference w/ [REDACTED] and SB ([REDACTED]); phone message to [REDACTED], Phone message to [REDACTED]; Emails- .125 hrs; .25 hrs; .25 hrs; .5 hrs; .25 hrs; .25 hrs; 2.5 hrs; 2.25 hrs; .75 hrs; 2.75 hrs; 2. hrs; .25 hrs 12.125 hours

November 18, 2008- Phone calls w/ [REDACTED]; Phone messages w/ [REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ SB; Review of correspondence from [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ RCJ; Emails- .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .5 hrs; .125 hrs; .25 hrs- 1.375 hours

November 19, 2008- Meeting w/ RCJ; Emails- .25 hrs; .25 hrs; .5 hours

November 20, 2008- Phone call w/ [REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ KE; Phone call w/ [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ SB; Phone call w/ RCJ; Emails- .125 hrs; .75 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .625 hrs- 1.875 hours

November 21, 2008- Phone messages w/ [REDACTED], Phone calls w/ [REDACTED] office; Phone calls w/ KE and SB; Phone messages w/ potential [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Review of miscellaneous correspondence; Meeting w/ SB re [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Reviewing [REDACTED] w/ SB ([REDACTED]); Emails- .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .5 hrs; .25 hrs; .25 hrs; 1. hrs; .5 hrs- 3.125 hours

November 22, 2008- Phone calls w/ SB re [REDACTED]; Phone message to [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Phone message to [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Emails- .25 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .875 hrs; 1.375 hours

November 23, 2008- Meeting w/ SB re [REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ [REDACTED] and SB; Preparation of [REDACTED] -.5 hrs; .125 hrs; 3.25 hrs- 3.875 hours

November 24, 2008- Phone calls w/ SB re [REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ [REDACTED] office; Phone call w/ ME and KE; Phone calls w/ KE; Emails-.625 hrs; .125 hrs; .25 hrs; .375 hrs; .5 hrs- 1.875 hours

November 25, 2008- Phone call w/ [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ SB re [REDACTED] (SE); Phone calls w/ [REDACTED] office; Phone calls w/ SB; Phone call w/ KE; Emails- .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .25 hrs; 1.125 hrs; .375 hrs; .625 hrs- 2.625 hours

November 26, 2008- Phone call w/ RCJ; Emails- .125 hrs, .125 hrs- .25 hours

November 30, 2008- Phone calls w/ SB; Phone calls w/ KE; Phone calls w/ [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Emails; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .375 hrs- .75 hours

December 1, 2008- Phone messages from and calls w/ [REDACTED], Emails- .125 hrs .375 hrs- .5 hours

December 2, 2008- Reading letter from [REDACTED]; Phone call with KE; Reading correspondence; Emails- .25 hrs; .5 hrs; .25 hrs; .375 hrs- 1.375 hours

December 3, 2008- Email to RCJ/KE re contacting [REDACTED]; Email to [REDACTED] re [REDACTED]; Phone message to [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ [REDACTED] and KE ([REDACTED]); Phone call w/ KE and [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Reading miscellaneous correspondence; Phone call w/ KE; Phone call w/ SB re [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Miscellaneous emails- .125 hrs; .25 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .25 hrs; .5 hrs; .5 hrs; .25 hrs; 1.5 hrs- 3.5 hours

December 4, 2008- Phone message from [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ SB; Phone call w/ [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Reading and responding to emails and correspondence-.125 hrs; .25 hrs; .375 hrs; 3.25 hrs- 4. hours

December 5, 2008- Phone call w/ [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ SB; Phone calls w/ [REDACTED]; Preliminary review of [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Emails- .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .25 hrs; .375 hrs; 1.25 hrs- 2.125 hours

December 6, 2008- Review of [REDACTED], Phone call w/ KE re [REDACTED], [REDACTED], and [REDACTED], and other matters (General/ [REDACTED]); Phone call w/ [REDACTED]; Meeting w/ RCJ; Overview of [REDACTED]; Reading correspondence; Emails- .25 hrs; .5 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; 1. hrs; .625 hrs; 1.125 hrs- 3.75 hours

December 7, 2008- Preparation of notes of [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Emails; 1.75 hrs; .125 hrs- 1.875 hours

December 8, 2008- Phone calls w/ SB re [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Phone calls w/ [REDACTED] re [REDACTED]; Emails; Phone calls w/ SB re incorporating SB's revisions; [REDACTED] incorporate SB's revision into [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Incorporating SB's revisions into [REDACTED] notes ([REDACTED]); Reading correspondence- .25 hrs; .125 hrs; .5 hrs; .5 hrs; .625 hrs; .75 hrs; .5 hrs- 3.25 hours

December 9, 2008- Phone call w/ [REDACTED] re [REDACTED], Phone call w/ IY re [REDACTED], [REDACTED], Phone call w/ JD re [REDACTED], Phone call w/ KE re 12/10 meetings/interviews; Phone call w/ [REDACTED] re 12/10 interview ([REDACTED]); Phone call w/ [REDACTED] re 12/10 interview ([REDACTED]); Phone call w/ SB; Preparation of outline for interview of [REDACTED]; Preparation of outline for interview of [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Emails- .125hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .375 hrs; .375 hrs; .375 hrs- 2. hours

December 10, 2008- Case review and preparation for meeting/interview of [REDACTED] and interview of [REDACTED] w/ KE ([REDACTED]); Meeting and Interview of [REDACTED]; Phone message from and call to [REDACTED] re her unavailability on 12/10 ([REDACTED]); Phone message to [REDACTED]'s office confirming [REDACTED] on 12/17; Review of meeting w/ [REDACTED] w/ KE; Interview of [REDACTED] w/ KE ([REDACTED]); Review of interview of [REDACTED] w/ KE, [REDACTED] w/ KE, and other misc matters ([REDACTED]); Phone call w/ [REDACTED], Phone messages to RCJ; Phone call w/ RCJ; Meeting w/ RCJ; Emails- 1.75 hrs; 5.5 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .5 hrs; 1.625 hrs; 1.75 hrs; .25 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .5 hrs- 12.5 hours

December 11, 2008- Phone call w/ [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ [REDACTED] office; Phone messages to KE; Emails- .25 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .5 hrs- 1.125 hours

December 12, 2008- Phone call w/ SB; Phone calls w/ KE; Phone call w/ RCJ; Phone call w/ [REDACTED]; Emails- .375 hrs; .5 hrs; .125 hrs; /125 hrs; .5 hrs- 1.625 hours

December 13, 2008- Meeting w/ SB re case status, ██████████, ██████████, ██████████, and other miscellaneous matters; Phone calls w/ ██████████; Phone messages w/ KE; Emails- .75 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .25 hrs- 1.25 hours

December 14, 2008- Preparing for meeting w/ ██████████, Preparing for interview of ██████████ (██████████); Preparing for interview of ██████████ (██████████); Phone message and call w/ KE; Emails- .25 hrs; .375 hrs; .375 hrs; .125 hrs; .375 hrs- 1.5 hours

December 15, 2008- Preparing w/ KE for interviews of ██████████ and ██████████ and review of case status, and phone call to ██████████); Attempted visit to ██████████); Travel w/ KE for interview of ██████████); Arrangements for interview of ██████████); Interview of ██████████); Review w/ KE of interview of ██████████); Meeting w/ ██████████); Review w/ KE re interview of ██████████ and meeting w/ ██████████ and other matters (██████████/General); Phone call w/ RCJ and KE; Phone call w/ SB and KE re ██████████ (██████████); Phone message to ██████████ office; Meeting w/ SB re ██████████ (██████████); Reading Emails- 1.75 hrs; .5 hrs; .5 hrs; .25 hrs; 5.75 hrs; .75 hrs; .5 hrs; 1.75 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .25 hrs; .25 hrs- 12.625 hours

December 16, 2008- Phone messages from and to ██████████); Phone call w/ ██████████); Phone call w/ ██████████); Phone call w/ KE; Phone call w/ SB; Emails; Reading miscellaneous correspondence; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .5 hrs; .5 hrs; .25 hrs; .375 hrs .25 hrs- 2.125 hours

December 17, 2008- Phone messages from and to ██████████); Phone message from ██████████); Phone calls w/ KE; Phone call w/ ██████████ and KE; Phone calls w/ SB; Phone call w/ ██████████); Phone call w/ ██████████); Emails- .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .625 hrs; .75 hrs; .25 hrs; .25 hrs; .5 hrs; .625 hrs .625 hrs- 3.875 hours

December 18, 2008- Phone calls w/ ██████████, KE, ██████████); Phone messages to and from ██████████); Phone calls w/ ██████████); Phone calls w/ SB; Reading and edits of letter to plaintiffs; Emails- 1.25 hrs; .125 hrs; .5 hrs; .25 hrs; .375 hrs; .625 hrs- 3.125 hours

December 19, 2008- Viewing of ██████████); Reading miscellaneous correspondence; Phone messages to and from KE; Phone call w/ KE re edit of letter to plaintiffs; Conference w/ RCJ- 1.25 hrs; 1.25 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs- 2.875 hours

December 20, 2008- Viewing ██████████ (different from 12/19 ██████████);

Emails; 1.25 hrs; .25 hrs-	1.5 hours
December 21, 2008- Reading miscellaneous correspondence; Emails-.375 hrs; .25 hrs-	.625 hours
December 22, 2008- Reading miscellaneous correspondence; Emails-.375 hrs; .25 hrs-	.625 hours
December 24, 2008- Phone call w/ [REDACTED]; Reading miscellaneous documents; Emails- .25 hrs; .25 hrs; .125 hrs-	.625 hours
December 26, 2008- Reading miscellaneous documents; Emails-.25 hrs; .125 hrs-	.375 hours
December 28, 2008- Typing handwritten notes from interview of [REDACTED]; Typing handwritten notes from interview of [REDACTED]; Reading miscellaneous documents- 1.25 hrs; 1.25 hrs; .75 hrs-	3.25 hours
December 30, 2008- Phone call w/ KE; Phone call w/ [REDACTED] office re scheduling ([REDACTED]); Review of correspondence; Emails- .5 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .375 hrs-	1.125 hours
December 31, 2008- Phone calls w/ [REDACTED]; Emails- .125 hrs; .5 hrs-	.625 hours
	<hr/>
	105.5 hours

\$350.00 per hour X 105.5 hours = \$36,925.00

TOTAL DUE = \$ 36,925.00