

Amy Josefsberg Ederi [REDACTED]  
12990 S.W. 74 Court  
Miami, Florida 33156  
(305)-582-0119

Re: Jeffrey Epstein  
Billing Statement for September 8, 2008-November 14, 2008

09/08/08- Conference w/ RCJ- .5 hrs-	.5 hours
09/10/08- Conference w/ RCJ and KE; Conference w/ RCJ and SB- 1.5 hrs; .5 hrs-	2. hours
09/11/08- Phone messages re [REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ [REDACTED] KE; Emails w/ RCJ, KE, SB; Reading materials- .25 hrs; .5 hrs; and .5 hrs-	1.25 hours
09/12/08- Phone messages to [REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ [REDACTED]; Phone Calls w/ SB; Phone Call w/ RCJ; Phone call w/ KE; Reading materials-background; Drafting questionnaire- .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .5 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; 1.125 hrs; and .25 hrs-	2.375 hours
09/13/08- Reading materials-background; Phone call w/ KE- .625 hrs; .125 hrs-	.75 hours
09/14/08- Reading materials in preparation for 9/15 Meeting w/ RCJ and KE- 3.5 hrs-	3.5 hours
09/15/08- Phone messages to [REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ [REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ SB; Emails; Meeting w/ RCJ and KE- .125 hrs; .75 hrs; .25 hrs; 1. hrs; 6.5 hrs-	8.625 hours
09/16/08- Reading materials; Phone calls and Emails- 2.625 hrs; 1.25 hrs-	3.875 hours
09/17/08- Revising questionnaire; Reading materials [REDACTED] and other materials; Research and reading materials re [REDACTED]; Emails; Phone calls w/ [REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ SB, RCJ, KE- .75 hrs; 3. hrs; 1.25 hrs; 1. hr; 1. hr; 1.25 hrs-	8.25 hours

09/18/08- Phone calls w/ [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ SB;  
Phone calls w/ [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ RCJ;  
Preparation for 9/19 Interviews ([REDACTED])-.5 hrs; .25 hrs; .75 hrs;  
.125 hrs; 3.5 hours- 5.125 hours

09/19/08- Drive to WPB (Preparation w/ KE for [REDACTED]  
[REDACTED] and [REDACTED], phone calls w/ [REDACTED], RCJ, SB ([REDACTED]); Interview  
of [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Phone calls w/ RCJ and [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Interview w/ [REDACTED] and  
[REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Conversation w/ [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Drive to Miami (Review  
of interviews w/ KE, phone calls w/ RCJ, SB, [REDACTED], w/stop  
at RCJ/KE's office to retrieve documents, CVs, etc., phone call w/ KE, SB,  
and [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]/General); Phone calls w/ [REDACTED]; Phone call  
w/ SB; Emails- 2.25 hrs; 2.5 hrs; .5 hrs; 2.75 hrs; .125 hrs; 2.5 hrs; .25 hrs;  
.25 hrs; .375 hrs- 11.5 hours

09/21/08- Messages to [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ [REDACTED]  
([REDACTED]); Emails; Phone call w/ SB; Preparation for 9/22 [REDACTED]  
[REDACTED])-.125 hrs; .125 hrs; .25 hrs; .125; .5 hrs- 1. hours

09/22/08- Drive to WPB (Preparation w/ KE for [REDACTED]  
and [REDACTED], phone calls w/ SB, RCJ, [REDACTED] [REDACTED]/General);  
Interview of [REDACTED]; Meeting w/ [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Phone Calls w/  
RCJ re [REDACTED]; Interview [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Drive to Miami (Review  
of interviews w/ KE, phone calls w/ RCJ, w/ stop at RCJ/[REDACTED] office to retrieve  
documents/CVs, etc, phone calls to [REDACTED], SB) ([REDACTED]/General);  
Emails and review of miscellaneous documents- 2.5 hrs; 2.5 hrs; .25 hrs; .5 hrs;  
2.75 hrs; 2.25 hrs; 1.5 hrs- 12.25 hours

09/23/08- Phone calls w/ KE; Phone calls w/ [REDACTED] [REDACTED]  
and [REDACTED]; Phone consultation w/ [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Phone calls w/ SB, [REDACTED]  
[REDACTED]; Emails; Review of misc documents; Research of [REDACTED]  
[REDACTED]; .5 hrs; .375 hrs; .375 hrs; .5 hrs; .75 hrs; .75 hrs; .25 hrs- 3.5 hours

09/24/08- Phone calls w/ KE; Phone calls w/ SB; Research re [REDACTED]  
[REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ [REDACTED] [REDACTED] and others); Review  
of [REDACTED]; Review of [REDACTED];  
Emails- .25 hrs; .125 hrs;.5 hrs; .625 hrs; .5 hrs; .25 hrs; 1.25 hrs- 3.75 hours

09/25/08- Phone calls w/ KE; Phone calls w/ SB; Phone Consultation w/  
[REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ and research of [REDACTED]; Emails-  
.375 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .875 hrs; .75 hrs- 2.25 hours

09/26/08- Preparation of [REDACTED]  
Meeting [REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ KE; Phone Call w/ RCJ; Phone calls w/ SB;  
Review of [REDACTED]; review of correspondence between KE  
and plaintiffs; research [REDACTED]

[REDACTED]; compiling list of [REDACTED]; Review of [REDACTED], emails-1.5 hrs; .25 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; 1.25 hrs; .125 hrs; .375 hrs; 1. hrs; .125; 1.5 hrs- 6.375 hours

09/27/08- Phone calls w/ SB; review of CVs w/ SB; Phone call w/ [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Preparation of [REDACTED]; [REDACTED]; Editing [REDACTED] and [REDACTED]; Reading background materials; Reading of [REDACTED]; Emails - .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .25 hrs; 1.5 hrs; .25 hrs; .375 hrs; .25 hrs; .125 hrs- 3. hours

09/28/08- Preparation for [REDACTED]; Reading background material; phone calls w/ KE and RCJ; emails- .625 hrs; .25 hrs; .25 hrs; .375 hrs- 1.5 hours

09/29/08- Phone Conference w/ SB and [REDACTED]; Preparation for [REDACTED] w/ SB; Meeting at [REDACTED] RCJ, KE, SB, [REDACTED] and [REDACTED]; Review of [REDACTED] w/ SB; Meeting w/ SB and KE re [REDACTED] and [REDACTED]; Phone conference w/ SB and [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]), Phone conference w/ SB and [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Emails- .5 hrs; .5 hrs; 2.875 hrs; .375 hrs; 1.375 hrs; .625 hrs; .375 hrs; .625 hrs- 7.25 hours

09/30/08- Phone Calls from [REDACTED]; Meeting w/ SB and RCJ' Meeting w/ RCJ; Short list re [REDACTED]; Emails- .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .25 hrs; .125 hrs; 1.25 hrs 1.875 hours

10/01/08- Phone Calls and Emails w/ RCJ, SB, and KE re case management, [REDACTED], and logistics for meetings, interviews, and [REDACTED]; Emails w/ [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Preparing list of [REDACTED]; Reading materials- 2.75 hrs; .25 hrs; .25 hrs; .5 hrs- 3.75 hours

10/02/08- Phone Calls and Emails w/ RCJ, KE, SB, re appointments w/ [REDACTED] and [REDACTED]; Emails w/ RCJ, KE, SB, [REDACTED] and [REDACTED]; Emails w/ [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Phone calls and emails w/ SB re [REDACTED]; Emails w/ KE and RCJ re case management/scheduling- 1.5 hrs; .25 hrs; .25 hrs; .125 hrs; 375 hrs- 2.5 hours

10/03/08- Phone calls w/ RCJ, KE, and SB; Emails w/ RCJ, KE, SB, [REDACTED]; Emails w/ [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]) and phone message to [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Viewing [REDACTED] from [REDACTED]; Review of printed materials from [REDACTED]; Rough draft of questions w/ SB for [REDACTED]; 1. hrs; 1.375 hrs; .375 hrs; .25 hrs; .5 hrs; 1.25 hr- 4.75 hours

10/04/08- Phone calls w/ KE and SB; Emails w/ KE and SB; Emails to [REDACTED] and [REDACTED], Emails w/ [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] and phone message to [REDACTED]; Draft of questions for [REDACTED]; Review of dates provided in [REDACTED]; [REDACTED] re [REDACTED]; Comparison [REDACTED]; Viewing of MSNBC Report of Sex Slave Industry in U.S.- .375 hrs; .5 hrs; .25 hrs; .125 hrs; .375 hrs; .375 hrs; .5 hrs; 1 hr- 3.5 hours

10/05/08- Phone calls w/ KE and SB; Phone call w/ [REDACTED]; Emails w/ [REDACTED]; emails w/ KE, SB, and RCJ; Reading of Jane Doe Complaints; Preparation for [REDACTED] 1. hrs; .25 hrs; .125 hrs; .875 hrs; .75 hrs; .5 hrs- 3.5 hours

10/06/08- Phone Calls w/ [REDACTED] and conference w/ [REDACTED] and SB; [REDACTED]; Review of [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ [REDACTED], and Preparation for Meeting w/ [REDACTED] w/ KE and SB; Meeting w/ [REDACTED] w/ KE and [REDACTED]; Review of Meeting w/ [REDACTED] w/ KE and [REDACTED]; Preparation for meeting w/ [REDACTED]; Meeting w/ [REDACTED] w/ KE [REDACTED]; Review of Meeting w/ [REDACTED] w/ KE [REDACTED]; Conference and Preparation for Meeting w/ [REDACTED] w/ KE and SB; Meeting w/ [REDACTED] w/ KE and SB; Review of Meeting w/ [REDACTED] w/ KE and SB; Phone calls w/ RCJ, KE, and SB re these appointments; emails- .875 hrs; 2.625 hrs; 1.125 hr; 1.125 hr; .75 hrs; .625 hrs; 1.5 hrs; .625 hrs; 1.375 hrs; 1.625 hrs; .625 hrs; .5 hrs; 1. hrs- 14.375 hours

10/07/08- Phone calls w [REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ KE; Phone calls w/ SB; Emails- .125 hrs; .25 hrs; .625 hrs; 1.125 hrs- 2.125 hours

10/08/08- Phone calls w/ KE; Phone calls w/ SB; Phone calls w/ [REDACTED] office; Emails and fax- .25 hrs; .75 hrs; .125 hrs; 1.75 hrs- 2.875 hours

10/09/08- Emails; Revisions to letter to [REDACTED]. File organization- .5 hrs; .125 hrs; .625 hrs- 1.25 hours

10/10/08- Phone calls to KE and John Dotterer's office; Emails- .125 hrs; .125 hrs- .25 hours

10/11/08- Read/noted correspondence from J.Herman re representation of plaintiffs; Read other correspondence; .25 hrs; .125 hrs .375 hours

10/13/08- Phone call w/ SB; Phone call w/ reference for [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ reference for [REDACTED]; Emails w/ KE, reference, [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] .125 hrs; .25 hrs; 1. hrs; .75 hrs- 2.125 hours

10/14/08- Phone message and email to [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ KE; Phone call w/ RCJ; Emails w/ RCJ, KE, [REDACTED], [REDACTED] SB; Emails w/ reference [REDACTED]- .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; 1.1 hrs; .125 hrs- 1.5 hours

10/15/08- Review of case status and preparation for meeting w/ [REDACTED] w/ KE; Phone calls w/ RCJ and KE; Meeting w/ [REDACTED] w/ KE; Review of meeting w/ [REDACTED] w/ KE; Phone messages to [REDACTED] ( [REDACTED] ); Phone calls w/ RCJ and KE; Review of calls w/ references for [REDACTED] w/ KE; Phone call w/ SB; Phone message to [REDACTED]; Emails- 1.375 hrs; .25 hrs; .625 hrs; .625 hrs; .25 hrs; .875 hrs; .125; .25 hrs; .125 hrs; 1.25 hrs- 5.75 hours

10/16/08- Phone call w/ [REDACTED] ( [REDACTED] ); Phone messages to references for [REDACTED] ( [REDACTED] ); Phone calls w/ SB; Phone calls w/ KE; Preparation for meeting w/ [REDACTED] ( [REDACTED] ); Review of Law Enforcement Reports (JA); Preparation for meeting w/ [REDACTED] ( [REDACTED] ); Emails- .375 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .375 hrs; .75 hrs; .5 hrs; .625 hrs; .875 hrs- 3.75 hours

10/17/08- Phone messages from references for [REDACTED] ( [REDACTED] ), phone calls w/ [REDACTED] and phone calls w/ [REDACTED]; Preparation for interview of [REDACTED] w/ [REDACTED] and KE ( [REDACTED] ); Case status/updates w/ KE and SB; Interview w/ [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] and KE ( [REDACTED] ); Interview w/ [REDACTED] and KE ( [REDACTED] ); Phone call to [REDACTED] re resources in WPB area; Review of meeting w/ [REDACTED] w/ KE and SB ( [REDACTED] ); Meeting w/ KE, SB, and [REDACTED]; Preparation for meeting w/ [REDACTED] ( [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] ); Interview w/ KE, SB, and [REDACTED] of [REDACTED] ( [REDACTED] ); Review of interview of [REDACTED] ( [REDACTED] ) w/ KE, SB and [REDACTED]; Review of interview of [REDACTED] ( [REDACTED] ) w/ KE and [REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ RCJ, KE, and/or SB); Phone call and meeting w/ RCJ; Phone call w/ SB- .125 hrs; .5 hrs; 1.375 hrs; 2. hrs; 1. hrs; .125 hrs; .5 hrs; 3. hrs; 1. hrs; 2.5 hrs; .25 hrs; 1.5 hrs; .375 hrs; .375 hrs- 14.625 hours

10/18/08- Phone call w/ RCJ re reference for [REDACTED] ( [REDACTED] )- .125 hrs- .125 hours

10/19/08- Phone call w/ KE; Miscellaneous emails- .25 hrs; 1.75 hrs 2. hours

10/20/08- Phone calls w/ KE; Phone call w/ RCJ; Phone messages w/ [REDACTED]; Miscellaneous emails- .25 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; 1.5 hrs- 2. hours

10/21/08- Phone messages w/ [REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ [REDACTED]; Phone

messages w/ SB; Phone calls w/ SB; Review of [REDACTED] re contacting all the [REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ KE; Miscellaneous emails- .125 hrs; .5 hrs; .125 hrs; .75 hrs; .125 hrs; 1.5 hrs; 1.75 hrs- 4.875 hours

10/22/08- Meeting w/ SB; Phone call KE; Phone calls RCJ; Phone calls w/ SB; Phone call [REDACTED] office; Phone messages to [REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ [REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ [REDACTED]; Meeting w/ RCJ; Miscellaneous email correspondence- .375 hrs; .25 hrs; .25 hrs; .375 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .25 hrs; .25 hrs; .5 hrs; 2.25 hrs- 4.75 hours

10/23/08- Phone calls w/ [REDACTED]; Reviewing documents and correspondence; Phone call w/ [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Phone call w/ [REDACTED]; Phone messages from [REDACTED], [REDACTED], and others ([REDACTED] general); Phone call w/ SB; Phone calls w/ [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Meeting w/ RCJ re case status and progress; Emails to [REDACTED], [REDACTED], SB, KE, RCJ, [REDACTED], and others- .5 hrs; .75 hrs; .125 hrs; .25 hrs; .25 hrs; .25 hrs; .125 hrs; .25 hrs; .375 hrs; 2.75 hrs- 5.625 hours

10/24/08- Phone calls w/ SB in preparation of [REDACTED] interview and case status [REDACTED]; Meetings w/ SB re preparation of [REDACTED] interview and case status [REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ RCJ re [REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ KE re case progress and case status; Phone messages to [REDACTED], and others; Phone call w/ [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ [REDACTED]; Phone messages and calls w/ [REDACTED]; Preparation of documents and questionnaire for interview of [REDACTED]; Research re resources and Emails w/ RCJ, KE, SB, [REDACTED] and others- .5 hrs; .75 hrs; .125 hrs; .625 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .375 hrs; .125 hrs; .75 hrs; 3.25 hrs- 6.75 hours

10/25/08- Preparation for interview of [REDACTED] w/ [REDACTED]; Interview of [REDACTED] w/ SB ([REDACTED]); Review of interview of [REDACTED] w/ SB ([REDACTED]); Phone calls w/ [REDACTED]; Research re [REDACTED]; Emails w/ [REDACTED], SB, KE, RCJ, [REDACTED], and others; Phone calls w/ SB; Reading [REDACTED] [REDACTED] 1. hr; 2.25 hrs; .5 hrs; .5 hrs; .75 hrs; 1. hr; .25 hrs; .5 hrs- 6.75 hours

10/26/08- Preparation of letters to [REDACTED]; Meeting w/ RCJ re case status; Emails w/ KE, SB, [REDACTED] and others; Phone message from [REDACTED] .375 hrs; .5 hrs; 1.25 hrs; .125 hrs- 2.25 hours

10/27/08- Phone calls w/ [REDACTED] office; Phone call w/ [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Emails- .25 hrs; .125 hrs; 1.625 hrs- 2. hours

10/28/08- Phone calls w/ [REDACTED] administrative staff re contact information and logistics for [REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ RCJ; Phone messages and calls w/ KE; Phone call w/ [REDACTED]; Phone messages to [REDACTED] and [REDACTED]; Review and revision of notes from phone conference w/ [REDACTED] and SB on 10/25 ([REDACTED]); Brief reading of [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Miscellaneous Emails- .625 hrs; .125 hrs;

.25 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .25 hrs; .375 hrs; 1.75 hrs- 3.625 hours

10/29/08- Emails and phone calls w/ [REDACTED] office re logistics for upcoming [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ [REDACTED] re availability for [REDACTED] for other [REDACTED] and for other resources for [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ [REDACTED] re upcoming [REDACTED] and other needed resources ([REDACTED]); Email and phone call to [REDACTED]; Finalized my notes from interview of [REDACTED]; Email to [REDACTED] re meeting time and place and Phone call to [REDACTED] to confirm 11/3 meeting time and place ([REDACTED]); Phone calls w/ RCJ; Phone calls w/ KE; Emails- .5 hrs; .25 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .5 hrs; .125 hrs; .375 hrs; .75 hrs; 2.125 hrs- 4.875 hours

10/30/08- Phone messages and emails w/ [REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ KE; Review of [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ SB re [REDACTED]; Reading correspondence; Preparation for phone conference w/ [REDACTED]; Miscellaneous emails- .125 hrs; .25 hrs; .75 hrs; .375 hrs; .375 hrs; .125 hrs; 1.5 hrs- 3.5 hours

10/31/08- Phone calls w/ RCJ re [REDACTED]; Phone conference w/ [REDACTED], SB, and KE re WPB resources; Phone messages w/ [REDACTED] re need for resources ([REDACTED]); Phone calls w/ SB re resources prior to and after phone conference, and re [REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ KE re resources, [REDACTED] and [REDACTED], and case status; Phone calls w/ [REDACTED] re upcoming [REDACTED]; Miscellaneous emails- .25 hrs; 1. hrs; .125 hrs; 1. hrs; 1.375 hrs; .375 hrs; .75 hrs- 4.875 hours

11/2/08- Phone call w/ [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ [REDACTED]; Phone call w/ RCJ re [REDACTED] evaluations, 11/3 meetings, [REDACTED]; Phone calls w/ KE re [REDACTED] and preparation for 11/3 meetings; Assembly and Review of [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Miscellaneous Emails; Directions for 11/3 appointments; Finalized interview notes of [REDACTED]; [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Finalized interview notes of [REDACTED] (LP); Finalized interview notes of [REDACTED]- .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .25 hrs; 1.5 hrs; 1.25 hrs; .75 hrs; .375 hrs; .75 hrs; .5 hrs; .75 hrs- 6.375 hours

11/3/08- Drive to WPB (Review misc case status w/ KE, Prepare for interview of [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] (General [REDACTED]); [REDACTED] interview of [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Review of interview of [REDACTED] and calls w/ [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Collateral interview of [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Review of interview of [REDACTED] and phone call w/ [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]); Meet w/ [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] w/ KE to review initial [REDACTED] Review w/ KE of [REDACTED] interviews, initial [REDACTED] and case status, and phone message to RCJ, and phone calls w/ [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] 3. hrs; 3.25 hrs; .75 hrs; 2. hrs; .75 hrs; 1.75 hrs; 2.5 hrs- 14. hours

11/4/08- Phone call w/ RCJ re 11/3 meetings and evaluations; Phone call w/ SB re evaluations; Meeting w/ RCJ and SB re evaluations; Emails; Review

of initial interviews of █████ and █████ (█████)- .25 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; 1. hrs;  
.5 hrs- 2. hours

11/5/08- Emails w/ KE, RCJ, █████, and IY; Reading of █████  
████████████████████ and reviewing his ████████████████████ (█████); File  
organization; Phone call w/ KE and fax to KE- 3.75 hrs; .375 hrs; .125 hrs;  
.5 hrs- 4.75 hours

11/6/08- Phone call w/ RCJ; Phone calls w/ █████ office; Phone message  
from █████ (█████); Phone call w/ █████; Phone calls w/ KE; Emails-  
.125 hrs; .25 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; 1. hrs; .375 hrs- 2. hours

11/7/08- Phone messages to █████, █████, RCJ, and █████  
████████████████████ (█████ General); Phone call w/ ████████████████████; Phone call  
w/ KE; Phone call w/ ████████████████████ (█████); Phone message to ████████████████████ (█████);  
Emails; Finalized notes from interview of ████████████████████ (█████)- .125 hrs; .5 hrs; .25 hrs;  
.125 hrs; .125 hrs; .625 hrs; .75 hrs- 2.5 hours

11/8/08- Finalized notes from interview of ████████████████████; Finalized ████████████████████  
interview notes of ████████████████████ (█████); Finalized notes of ████████████████████  
interview of ████████████████████ (█████); Finalized notes of ████████████████████ interview of  
████████████████████ (█████); Emails-75 hrs; .75 hrs; .625 hrs; .625 hrs; .5 hrs- 3.25 hours

11/09/08- Finalized notes from phone conversation of SB and █████ w/ █████  
████████████████████; Minor changes to notes from interviews of ████████████████████ and ████████████████████  
████████████████████; Phone message to ████████████████████ (█████); Emails- .25 hrs; 1.25 hrs; .125 hrs; .5 hrs.- 2.125 hours

11/10/08- Phone call w/ RCJ; Phone calls w/ ████████████████████; Emails to KE,  
RCJ, and ████████████████████ re ████████████████████; Emails to KE and RCJ re 11/11  
appointments and past interviews (█████); Emails w/ SB re revisions of  
████████████████████ notes; Finalized ████████████████████  
████████████████████; Finalized ████████████████████ notes of ████████████████████ with SB's revisions  
████████████████████; Miscellaneous emails; Viewing ████████████████████  
████████████████████ .125 hrs; .625 hrs; .25 hrs; .25 hrs; .25 hrs; .75 hours;  
.75 hrs; .875 hrs; 1. hr- 4.875 hours

11/11/08- Phone calls w/ ████████████████████; Phone calls w/ ████████████████████; Phone  
messages to SB; Phone calls w/ ████████████████████ (█████); Phone call w/  
plaintiff ████████████████████ (█████); Phone calls w/ plaintiff ████████████████████ (█████); Phone calls w/  
plaintiff ████████████████████ (█████); Faxes to RCJ's office; Preparation of Questionnaire for  
████████████████████ (█████); Drive to WPB w/ KE discussing various case issues  
and prep re meeting w/ ████████████████████ and interview of plaintiff ████████████████████ (█████); Meeting  
w/ ████████████████████ and KE; Review of Meeting w/ ████████████████████ w/ KE; Interview of ████████████████████  
████████████████████; Drive to Miami w/ KE discussing interview of ████████████████████ and

various case issues (████); Emails- .375 hrs; .25 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs;  
.125 hrs; .125 hrs; .25 hrs; .25 hrs; 2. hrs; 1.5 hrs; .5 hrs; 4.5 hrs; 2. hrs;  
.675 hrs- 12.875 hours

11/12/08- Email and phone calls w/ █████; Phone call w/ KE re █████; Phone call w KE to █████; Phone calls w KE re misc issues; Phone message to █████; Phone calls w/ SB re █████ interviews; Phone call w/ RCJ; Phone call w/ █████ Reading of miscellaneous correspondence; Fla Bar opinion; Miscellaneous emails- .375 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .75 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .25 hrs; .375 hrs; .25 hrs; .625 hrs- 3.25 hours

11/13/08- Printing copies of Interviews of █████; Printing copies of █████ (████); Phone call w/ █████ (████); Rereading of Fla Bar opinion; Reading of KE's response to Fla Bar opinion; Phone calls w/ SB re case status and upcoming interview and gathering of materials; Phone calls w/ KE; Phone calls w/ RCJ; Miscellaneous Emails- .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .125 hrs; .25 hrs; .25 hrs; 1.25 hrs; .5 hrs; .25 hrs; 1.75 hrs- 4.625 hours

11/14/08-Printing copies of all interviews for SB; Emails w/ law clerk; Phone calls w/ RCJ; Emails w/ SB, █████, KE, RCJ, and ME; Phone calls w/ █████ (████); Meeting w/ SB; Phone call and texts w/ █████ (████); Phone call w/ █████; Emails re █████; Phone calls, text, and emails w/ █████ re █████; Miscellaneous emails- .625 hrs; .125 hrs; .25 hrs; 1.25 hrs; .25 hrs; .125 hrs; .25 hrs; .25 hrs; .125 hrs; .5 hrs; 1.5 hrs- 5.25 hours

279.375 hours

\$ 350 per hour X 279.375 hours = \$97,781.25

TOTAL DUE = \$ 97,781.25