

# INVOICE

November 1, 2009

Invoice No. 338

Matter: Epstein

Susan E. Bennett, Esq.  
10420 SW 139<sup>th</sup> Street  
Miami, Florida 33176  
(305) 510-4705

<u>Date</u>	<u>Matter No.</u>	<u>Description of Service</u>	<u>Time</u>	<u>Amount</u>
10/1/09	30608 General	Review email re [REDACTED]; review email from Mr. Josefsberg re: upcoming meeting; [REDACTED]; [REDACTED]; review reply from Ms. Ederi; review email from Ms. Ezell re: anonymity and deposition transcript.	.7	245.00
10/2/09	30608 General	Review email from Mr. Josefsberg to Mr. Critton re: 9/25 settlement; review and send replies between team; telephone conference with Mr. Ederi re: same; review email from Ms. Estrada at [REDACTED] [REDACTED] re: deposition of Mr. Riley, etc.; review email from Ms. Ezell re: settlement clarification; review email from Ms. Ezell re: tolling agreement; review email from Ms. Ederi re: settlement; review email attaching emergency motion to enforce order granting leave to proceed anonymously through sealing of deposition and motion to terminate deposition or for 2-hour time limit.	3.1	1,085.00
10/3/09	30608 General	Review email from Ms. Ederi re: Defendant; review email from Ms. Ederi re: settlement and fees.	.3	105.00
10/5/09	30608 General	Email team re: issues at settlement meeting; review reply from Mr. Josefsberg; review email attaching cross-ntices; review email from Ms. Ederi re: tolling agreement; review reply from Ms. Ezell; reply.	.5	175.00
10/6/09	30608 General	Review emails re: depositions and notice of deposition; review email from Ms. Yarzabal with article link; review email from Ms. Ezell re: and attaching SM agreement; review email from Ms. Ezell attaching tolling agreement; review emails from Ms. Ederi re: same; review email from Ms. Ederi re: SM agreement; review email from Ms. Ezell to Mr.	.8	280.00

		Josefsberg re: same.		
10/8/09	30608 General	Review emails from Ms. Ezell re: telephone conference with Mr. Critton re: tolling agreement, SM agreement, and settlement; review reply from Ms. Ederi; review emails re: deposition and notices; review email forward from Ms. Ezell of email to Mr. Critton re: presence at deposition of Defendant; review email from Ms. Ezell re: and attaching SM agreement; reply; review replies from Ms. Ezell and Ms. Ederi; review email from Ms. Ezell re: deposition of Defendant and email from Mr. Critton to Ms. Ezell re: same; review email from Ms. Ezell to Mr. Critton re: and attaching SM and tolling agreements; review email from Ms. Ezell re: telephone conference.	1.1	385.00
10/9/09	30608 General	Review emails attaching deposition notices, cross-depositions, and motion to terminate deposition; review same; review email from Ms. Ezell attaching letter [REDACTED] re: settlement; review letter; review email [REDACTED]; review attachment; telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: settlement; telephone conferences with team re: same.	2.6	910.00
10/10/09	30608 General	Review emails from Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED]; review same; telephone conferences with Mr. Josefsberg, Ms. Ederi, and Ms. Ezell re: settlement issues; telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi and Ms. Ezell re: same; email Ms. Ederi summary of points from telephone conference.	1.9	665.00
10/11/09	30608 General	Prepare notes of telephone conference with team re: settlement issues; email team re: same; send email re: same; review email from Ms. Ederi revising same.	.3	105.00
10/12/09	30608 General	Review email from Ms. Ederi to Ms. Ezell re: settlement issues; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi and Ms. Ezell re: settlement negotiations and fees; review email from Ms Ederi re: same; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: settlement and NPA.	1.0	350.00
10/13/09	30608	Telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: settlement;	2.4	840.00

	General	review email from Ms. Ezell re: [REDACTED] and witnesses; review email from Ms. Ederi re: miscellaneous; review email from Mr. Critton re: settlement; review email from Mr. Josefsberg to team re: same; review email from Mr. Josefsberg re: depositions; review email attaching deposition notice; review email from Ms. Ezell re: releases; draft and send email to team re: settlement issues and [REDACTED]; review reply from Ms. Ezell; review email from Mr. Josefsberg forwarding email from Mr. Critton re: settlement funds; review email from Ms. Ederi re: conference with Mr. Josefsberg re: settlement issues; review email from Ms. Ederi responding to Mr. Critton's settlement points.		
10/14/09	30608 General	Review email from Ms. Ederi re: email to Mr. Josefsberg re: settlement issues; review emails re: deposition and attaching cross-notice; send email reply to Ms. Ederi and Ms. Ezell re: edits to notes; review reply from Ms. Ederi; review email from Ms. Ederi to Mr. Josefsberg re: settlement issues; review email from Ms. Ederi to Mr. Josefsberg re: settlement funds; review email from [REDACTED] re: deposition witness; email team re: same; review reply from Ms. Ederi; review email from Ms. Ederi to Mr. Josefsberg re: responding to Mr. Critton re: settlement issues; review reply from Mr. Josefsberg; review email from Ms. Ederi re: sending email to defense counsel and listing points re: settlement; review reply from Ms. Ezell.	1.2	420.00
	[REDACTED]	Review email from Ms. Ederi re: status of client.	.1	35.00
10/15/09	30608 General	Telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: settlement agreement and release ([REDACTED]); review same; conference with Ms. Ederi re: same; telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi and Ms. Ezell re: same; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi, Mr. Josefsberg, and Ms. Ezell re: same; review email reply from Ms. Ederi to Mr. Critton re: settlement issues; review email from Mr. Critton re: SM and tolling agreements and attaching same; review email reply to Mr. Critton and his legal team re: SM agreement; review email from Ms. Ezell to Mr. Josefsberg re: cross-notices and	3.9	1,365.00

		subpoena of witness; review email from Ms. Ezell re: and attaching draft of SA; review email re: depositions; review email from Ms. Ezell re: SA issues.		
10/16/09	30608 General	Review email from Ms. Ezell re: SA language; review reply from Ms. Ederi; review email from Mr. Doddo attaching draft of SA review reply from Ms. Ederi; review email re: witness and attaching letter from Mr. Hill to Mr. Critton re: deposition of same; review email attaching subpoena and deposition notice; review email from Ms. Ezell re: telephone conference with Mr. Critton re: settlement issues; review replies from Mr. Josefsberg and Ms. Ederi; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: SA; revise same; telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: and revising same; email revised and clean SA to Ms. Ederi; review email from Ms. Ederi to team attaching clean and redlined SA.	4.0	1,400.00
10/17/09	30608 General	Review email from Ms. Ederi re: SA language; review email from Ms. Ederi re: issues discussed by Mr. Critton and Ms. Ezell; review email from Ms. Ezell [REDACTED] review email re: future depositions; review email from Ms. Ezell to Mr. Josefsberg re: [REDACTED]; review email from Ms. Ezell re: [REDACTED]; email team re: [REDACTED]; review replies from Ms. Ezell and Ms. Ederi re: same.	.7	245.00
10/18/09	30608 General	Review email from Ms. Ezell re: SA language; review reply from Ms. Ederi; review email from Ms. Ederi re: settlement issues.	.4	140.00
10/19/09	30608 General	Review email forward from Ms. Patton of email from Mr. Josefsberg forwarding email from Mr. Critton attaching 10/15/09 letter re: settlement negotiations; review same; review email forward from Mr. Josefsberg of email from Mr. Critton re: settlement; review email from Ms. Ezell re: same; review emails from Mr. Doddo re: and attaching drafts of SA; review emails re: deposition of witness and cross-noticing; review email from Ms. Ezell attaching draft of SA;	5.0	1,750.00

		review email from Ms. Ezell re: and attaching draft of response letter to Mr. Critton; review same; review email from Mr. Critton attaching 10/19/09 letter to Mr. Josefsberg and attaching draft of SA; review same; review email from Mr. Doddo re: and attaching draft of response to letter; review same; revise same with Mr. Ederi; review email from Ms. Ederi re: and attaching same; review email from Ms. Ederi re: and attaching no-contact order; review same; review email from Ms. Ezell re: language in no-contact provision of SA; telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED]; telephone conference with Mr. Doddo, Ms. Ezell, and Ms. Ederi revising SA; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi and Ms. Ezell re: [REDACTED]; telephone conference with Ms. Ezell re: second letter from Mr. Critton to Mr. Josefsberg re: settlement; revise response to letter with Ms. Ederi; telephone conference with Ms. Ezell and Ms. Ederi re: second letter from Mr. Critton to Mr. Josefsberg re: settlement; revise response with Ms. Ederi.		
10/20/09	30608 General	Telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: Mr. Critton's version of SA; telephone conference with Ms. Ezell re: same; revise same with Ms. Ezell; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi and Mr. Doddo re: and revising same; draft email to team re: [REDACTED]; telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: same; review email from Ms. Ezell re: settlement and response to Mr. Critton's second letter; review email re: [REDACTED]; review email from Ms. Ezell re: and attaching Mr. Critton's version of SA; send email to team re: confidentiality provision; review reply from Ms. Ezell.	2.1	735.00
10/21/09	30608 General	Email Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED] review reply from Ms. Ederi; research re: [REDACTED] email Ms. Ederi re: same; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: settlement issues.	1.4	490.00
	[REDACTED]	Review email from Ms. Ederi re: status of client and settlement issues; email team re: settlement issue concerning client; review reply.	.3	105.00

November 1, 2009

Invoice No. 338

Matter: Epstein

10/22/09	30608 General	Review email from Ms. Ederi listing settlement issues to resolve; reorganize same and [REDACTED]; email same to Ms. Ederi; telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: same; review email from Ms. Ederi with revised list; research re: [REDACTED]; send emails to Ms. Ederi re: same; emails with Ms. Ederi re: confidentiality; review email from Ms. Ederi re: settlement issues; reply; review email from Ms. Ezell to Ms. Ederi re: Mr. Critton's response re: settlement; review reply from Ms. Ederi; review email from Ms. Ederi to Ms. Ezell re: latest draft of SM agreement; review email from Ms. Ederi to Mr. Josefsberg and Ms. Ezell re: [REDACTED]	5.1	1,785.00
10/23/09	30608 General	Telephone conference with Mr. Ederi re: revised SA and letter from Mr. Critton to Ms. Ezell; conference with Ms. Ederi reviewing same; review email from Ms. Ezell re: [REDACTED]; review email from Ms. Patton re: same; review email from Ms. Ezell attaching Mr. Critton's latest revisions to settlement agreement; review emails from Ms. Ederi re: same; review email from Ms. Ederi and me to Mr. Josefsberg and Ms. Ezell re: settlement issues to discuss and resolve; review email from Ms. Ederi to Ms. Ezell re: latest letter from Mr. Critton; review reply from Ms. Ezell re: same and re: Mr. Critton's changes to SA; review email re: witness deposition.	1.7	595.00
10/26/09	30608 General	Conference with Ms. Ederi re: settlement issues; telephone conference with evaluators and Ms. Ederi re: miscellaneous issues; email Ms. Ederi notes of same; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: same; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi and Ms. Ezell re: same and re: SM agreement; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi and Mr. Doddo revising SA; review same; telephone conference with Mr. Doddo revising same; telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: same; review emails from Ms. Ezell re: miscellaneous issues; emails to Ms. Ezell re: SM; review replies; email Ms. Ezell re: depositions; review reply; review email from Ms. Estrada re: same; review email from Ms. Ederi attaching letter and draft of SA from Mr. Critton; review email from Ms. Ederi re:	2.4	840.00

		miscellaneous issues; review email from Ms. Ezell to Mr. Josefsberg re: SA and SM agreement; review emails from Mr. Doddo attaching draft of settlement agreement; review email from Ms. Ezell re: same; review emails from Ms. Ezell attaching same; review emails re: cancelled depositions; review email from Mr. Doddo re: and [REDACTED]; review email from Ms. Ederi to Ms. Ezell re: SM agreement; text Ms. Ederi re: envelope provision; review email from [REDACTED]. Ederi revising notes from telephone conference with evaluators; review email from Ms. Ederi to Ms. Ezell re: and including same; reply.		
10/27/09	30608 General	Telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: settlement issues; review revised SA; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi and Ms. Ezell re: SA and issues; review email from Ms. Ederi re: telephone conference with evaluators; reply; review replies from Ms. Ezell; review email from Mr. Josefsberg re: SM agreement; review email from Ms. Estrada attaching letter to Mr. Critton and [REDACTED] re: SM agreement; emails with Ms. Ezell re: revising SA; review email from Ms. Yarzabal attaching calendar; review email from Mr. Doddo re: and attaching SA versions; review email from Ms. Estrada re: letter from Mr. Critton; review email from Ms. Ezell re: SA revisions.	2.9	1,015.00
10/28/09	30608 General	Review emails from Ms. Ederi re: SA; emails with Ms. Ederi re: telephone conference with evaluators; review email from Ms. Ederi re: and attaching notes from telephone conference with evaluators and follow-up call; review email from Ms. Ederi re: same and re: SA; review email from Ms. Ezell re: SA versions and general update; review emails from Mr. Doddo [REDACTED]; review email from Ms. Ezell re: no-contact; review email from Mr. Doddo re: no-contact order; review email from Ms. Estrada to Mr. Critton attaching letter from Ms. Ezell; review email from from Ms. Ezell to team attaching draft of letter to defense counsel; review emails between Mr. Josefsberg and Ms. Ezell re: same; review email from Ms. Ezell attaching letter sent to Mr. Critton re: SM agreement; review email from Ms. Ederi to Mr. Josefsberg re: same; review	4.3	1,505.00

		<p>reply from Mr. Josefsberg; review email from Ms. Ederi to team re: revisions to SA and attaching same; review email from Ms. Ezell to Mr. Josefsberg re: status of SA issues; review replies from Mr. Josefsberg and Ms. Ederi; telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi and Mr. Doddo revising SA; telephone conference with Mr. Doddo revising same; telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: same; review email from Ms. Ezell attaching Ms. Ederi's drafted letter to Mr. Critton; reply; review and revise letter; telephone conference with Ms. Ezell re: revisions to letter; review email from Ms. Ezell to team re: same; review reply from Mr. Josefsberg; review email from Ms. Ezell re: telephone conference with Mr. Josefsberg; review email from Mr. Critton re: bills; review reply from Ms. Ezell; email Ms. Ederi re: no-contact provision; review email from Ms. Ezell to Mr. Critton's office; review email from Ms. Estrada to Mr. Critton attaching letter and draft of SA; review email from Mr. Ezell to Mr. Josefsberg re: telephone conference with Mr. Critton re: SA; review email from Ms. Ezell to team re: Mr. Critton's position on SM matter.</p>		
10/29/09	30608 General	<p>Telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: letter to Mr. Critton and SA; review letter from Ms. Ezell to Mr. Critton; revise same; telephone conference with Ms. Ezell re: same; conference with Ms. Ederi/telephone conference with Ms. Ezell and Mr. Doddo re: and revising same; conference with Ms. Ederi re: same; review email from Ms. Ezell re: our position on SA; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: same; review draft of response with Ms. Ederi re: same.</p>	4.5	1,575.00
10/30/09	30608 General	<p>Review email from Ms. Ederi to team re: SA issues; review emails from Ms. Ederi re: settlement terms and NPA; review emails from Mr. Josefsberg re: confidentiality; review reply from Ms. Ezell; review email from Ms. Ezell to Mr. Critton re: SA issues; review reply from Mr. Josefsberg; review emails from Mr. Josefsberg re: anonymity, no-contact, and NPA; review email from Ms. Ezell to Mr. Critton re: and attaching revised SA; review email from Ms. Patton forwarding email from Mr. Josefsberg to Mr. Critton</p>	2.6	910.00

November 1, 2009

Invoice No. 338

Matter: Epstein

		re: settlement and SM issues; review reply from Mr. Critton; review email from Ms. Ezell re: settlement issues and NPA; review reply from Mr. Josefsberg; review email from Ms. Ezell re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED], email to Mr. Josefsberg; review reply from same; review email attaching deposition notice; review email attaching Mr. Critton's revisions to SM agreement; review email from Ms. Ederi re: same.		
10/31/09	30608 General	Conference with Ms. Ederi re: SA issues and SM agreement issues.	.8	280.00
	TOTAL	58.1 hours @ \$350.00 per hour		\$20,335.00