

# INVOICE

October 10, 2008

Invoice No. 326

Matter: Epstein

Susan E. Bennett, Esq.  
10420 SW 139<sup>th</sup> Street  
Miami, Florida 33176  
(305) 510-4705

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description of Service (All General 30608)</u>	<u>Time</u>	<u>Amount</u>
9/10/2008	Conference with Mr. Josefsberg and Ms. Ederi re: case.	.5	175.00
9/11/2008	Telephone conferences with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] referrals; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED]	.5	175.00
9/12/2008	Telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: questions and issues [REDACTED]	.5	175.00
9/15/2008	Telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED]; review email from Ms. Ederi re: same.	1.0	350.00
9/16/2008	Locate contact information for [REDACTED], research information on [REDACTED], telephone [REDACTED] with message re: interest or references; telephone [REDACTED] with message re: knowledge about [REDACTED]; telephone [REDACTED] with message re: [REDACTED]; locate contact information for [REDACTED], and [REDACTED] and the [REDACTED]; telephone conference with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED]; telephone conference with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED].	1.2	420.00
9/17/2008	Locate contact information for [REDACTED]; telephone [REDACTED] with messages to return calls; telephone conference with [REDACTED] re: search for [REDACTED]; telephone conference with [REDACTED] re: same; telephone conference with [REDACTED] re: same; review emails from Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED]; review information and websites [REDACTED]; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED].	1.8	630.00
9/18/2008	Telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: West Palm Beach [REDACTED]	.3	105.00

9/19/2008	Telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: Miami and West Palm Beach [REDACTED] and [REDACTED]; telephone conference with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]; telephone conference with [REDACTED], Ms. Ezell, and Ms. Ederi re: issues [REDACTED]; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: conclusions from prior telephone conference.	2.4	840.00
9/21/08	Telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: status of [REDACTED]; review email from Ms. Ederi re: status [REDACTED].	.2	70.00
9/22/08	Telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: issues in [REDACTED]; draft email to Ms. Ederi re: progress in [REDACTED]; telephone [REDACTED] with message to return call; telephone [REDACTED] with message to return call; telephone [REDACTED] with message to return call; telephone assistant of [REDACTED] with message to return call; telephone conference with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]; telephone conference with [REDACTED] re: same telephone conference with [REDACTED] re: same; draft email to Ms. Ederi re: meeting and conversations with [REDACTED]; telephone conference with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]; review email from [REDACTED] with [REDACTED] attached; draft reply email to [REDACTED]; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED] and plan forward; draft email to Ms. Ederi with requested information (summary of contact with [REDACTED]).	3.8	1,330.00
9/23/2008	Review email from Ms. Ederi re: her conference with [REDACTED]; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: same.	.2	70.00
9/24/2008	Review email from [REDACTED] and attached [REDACTED]; telephone conference with [REDACTED] re: same; draft email to Ms. Ederi re: same; review email from [REDACTED] with [REDACTED] attached; [REDACTED]; review emails from Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED] and [REDACTED]; draft email to [REDACTED] requesting more [REDACTED] from [REDACTED] from her practice; review emails from Ms. Ederi with attached [REDACTED] of [REDACTED] and other [REDACTED]; locate contact information for more	2.4	840.00

October 10, 2008

Invoice No. 326

Matter: Epstein

9/25/2008	██████████ Telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: status of ██████████ search; telephone ██████████ with message to return call; telephone conference with ██████████ re: ██████████; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: status of search and ██████████; review emails from Ms. Ederi re: ██████████.	1.4	490.00
9/26/2008	Telephone ██████████ with message to return call; review emails from Ms. Ederi re: upcoming meeting at ██████████; review email from Ms. Ederi re: list of ██████████ and updates; draft email to Ms. Ederi re: same.	.9	315.00
9/27/2008	Review emails from Ms. Ederi re: status; forward ██████████ of ██████████ to Ms. Ederi; telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: ██████████; conference with Ms. Ederi re: same; review telephone message from ██████████.	1.1	385.00
9/28/2008	Draft email to ██████████ re: ██████████; telephone ██████████ with message re: same; review ██████████.	1.2	420.00
9/29/2008	Conference at ██████████ with Mr. Josefsberg, ██████████, Ms. Ezell; Ms. Ederi, ██████████, and another ██████████ re: case, ██████████, and ██████████; telephone conference with ██████████; telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: meeting and upcoming issues; conference with Ms. Ederi and Ms. Ezell re: ██████████.	6.9	2,415.00
9/30/2008	Review emails from Ms. Ederi re: ██████████; conference with Ms. Ederi and Mr. Josefsberg re: ██████████; review proposal of ██████████; telephone conference with ██████████ re: ██████████; review ██████████.	1.0	350.00
10/1/2008	Review emails from Ms. Ederi re: status; draft email to ██████████ re: ██████████; review emails from Ms. Ederi and Ms. Ezell re: ██████████; review emails from ██████████ re: same; draft email to Ms. Ederi re: addition of ██████████ on list;	2.2	770.00

	draft email to ██████ requesting further information; telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: ██████ and upcoming meetings with ██████ and training; review email from Ms. Ederi and Ms. Ezell re: same.		
10/2/2008	Review emails from Ms. Ezell and Ms. Ederi re: status; review email from ██████ re: her status; draft email to ██████ re: same; telephone Ms. Ederi with message re: same; review email from ██████ re: question; draft email to ██████ re: same; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: upcoming meetings with ██████; review emails from Ms. Ederi and Ms. Ezell re: same.	1.1	385.00
10/3/2008	Telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: upcoming meetings with ██████; review emails from Ms. Ederi re: same; draft list of ██████ with Ms. Ederi; review material from ██████ with Ms. Ederi; review ██████ re: ██████ conference with Ms. Ederi re: evaluations, issues, and upcoming meetings with ██████	3.0	1,050.00
10/4/2008	Telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: upcoming meetings with ██████ prepare copies of ██████ and list of questions for ██████; review documentary re: commercial nature of situation in US; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: same.	1.1	385.00
10/5/2008	Telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: upcoming meetings with ██████, damages, and statute of limitations; review emails from Ms. Ederi and Ms. Ezell re: upcoming meetings with ██████	2.0	700.00
10/6/2008	████████████████████ with Ms. Ederi and Ms. Ezell re: ██████; telephone conference with ██████ with Ms. Ederi and Ms. Ezell re: scheduling future meeting; conference with ██████ with Ms. Ederi and Ms. Ezell re: ██████; ██████ review article re: background of case; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: upcoming meeting with ██████ conference with ██████ with Ms.	11.1	3,885.00

October 10, 2008

Invoice No. 326

Matter: Epstein

	Ederi and Ms. Ezell re: [REDACTED] conference with Ms. Ederi and Ms. Ezell re: today's meetings with [REDACTED].		
10/7/2008	Review email from Ms. Ederi re: future meeting with [REDACTED]; draft email to Ms. Ederi re: same; telephone conference with [REDACTED] re: her status.	.8	280.00
10/8/2008	Review email from Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED]; draft reply email re: same; telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: same and other related issues, including future meeting with [REDACTED]	1.2	420.00
10/9/2008	Review emails from Ms. Ezell and Ms. Ederi re: meeting with [REDACTED]	.1	35.00
TOTAL	49.9 hours @ \$350.00 per hour		\$17,465.00