

INVOICE

November 10, 2008

Invoice No. 327

Matter: Epstein

Susan E. Bennett, Esq.
 10420 SW 139th Street
 Miami, Florida 33176
 (305) 510-4705

<u>Date</u>	<u>Description of Service (All General 30608, other than portions specific to particular client in description, noted in parentheses)</u>	<u>Time</u>	<u>Amount</u>
10/13/2008	Telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: meeting with [REDACTED] and viewing [REDACTED]; review notes from meetings with [REDACTED] of [REDACTED], and email from Ms. Ederi forwarding [REDACTED] information to [REDACTED].	.4	140.00
10/14/2008	Review email from [REDACTED] re: meeting with [REDACTED]; review email from Ms. Ezell re: same.	.1	35.00
10/15/2008	Review email from Ms. Ederi re: meeting with [REDACTED].	.1	35.00
10/16/2008	Telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: tomorrow's meetings in West Palm Beach; review and revise [REDACTED]; prepare for meetings with [REDACTED] and [REDACTED]; draft email to Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED].	.7	245.00
10/17/2008	Review email from Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED]; conference with Ms. Ederi and Ms. Ezell re: [REDACTED], [REDACTED] and [REDACTED], questions for [REDACTED], references for [REDACTED], differences between [REDACTED] and [REDACTED], approaches for evaluations, and Ms. Ederi's discussions with two of [REDACTED] references; [REDACTED]; meeting with Ms. Ederi, Ms. Ezell, and [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]; listen to, and relay to Ms. Ederi and Ms. Ezell, message from [REDACTED] re: evaluations; meeting with [REDACTED], Ms. Ezell, [REDACTED], and Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED]; conference with Ms. Ezell and Ms. Ederi re: meeting with [REDACTED] and [REDACTED], and [REDACTED]; telephone conference w/ [REDACTED], Ms. Ederi, and Ms. Ezell re: meeting with [REDACTED] and [REDACTED]; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: meeting with [REDACTED] and [REDACTED]; review evaluation notes from meetings with [REDACTED] and draft email to Ms. Ezell and Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED].	10.2	3,570.00
10/19/2008	Review emails from Ms. Ezell and Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED]; draft responses to emails re: same.	.3	105.00

October 10, 2008

Invoice No. 327

Matter: Epstein

10/20/2008	Review emails from Ms. Ezell and Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED], needs/vocational help for victims, etc.; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: replies to [REDACTED]; draft phone text to Ms. Ederi re: same; draft email to [REDACTED] re: same; review email from Ms. Ezell re: email to [REDACTED].	.8	280.00
10/21/2008	Telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: meeting with [REDACTED]; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: letter to [REDACTED].	1.1	385.00
10/22/2008	Telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: meeting with [REDACTED] and viewing [REDACTED]; conference with Ms. Ederi; draft email to Ms. Ezell and Ms. Ederi re: article.	.8	280.00
10/23/2008	Review email from Ms. Ederi re: meeting with [REDACTED] ([REDACTED]).	.1	35.00
10/24/2008	Review emails and reply (to my email) from Ms. Ederi re: communication with [REDACTED] appointment, and [REDACTED]; telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: collateral appointment; conferences with Ms. Ederi re: same; review email from Ms. Ederi to [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED], [REDACTED], and Palm Beach County Victims' Services; research information re: [REDACTED] draft email to Ms. Ederi, Mr. Josefsberg, and Ms. Ezell re: same; review email from Ms. Ederi to [REDACTED] re: same. (1.3 of the time, [REDACTED]).	3.0	1,050.00
10/25/2008	Review [REDACTED] and [REDACTED]; meeting with collateral [REDACTED] with Ms. Ederi; conferences with Ms. Ederi pre- and post-meeting; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi and [REDACTED], medication, and physician releases; review faxed examples of reports from [REDACTED]; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: collateral meeting; telephone message to, and conference with, Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED] faxed examples of reports; draft email to Ms. Ederi re: draft responses to [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] review email from [REDACTED] re: nonprofit agency treatment. (4.2 of the time, [REDACTED]).	6.7	2,345.00
10/26	Review email from Ms. Ederi re: response to [REDACTED]; review email from Ms. Ederi re: physician and medication information [REDACTED]; draft reply email to Ms. Ezell and Ms. Ederi re: same; review email from Ms. Ederi re: date and time of	.3	105.00

October 10, 2008

Invoice No. 327

Matter: Epstein

	telephone conference with [REDACTED], draft and send reply email re: same; review email from Ms. Ezell re: physician [REDACTED]. (.1 of the time, [REDACTED])		
10/27/2008	Review emails from Ms. Ederi re: note to [REDACTED], future telephone conference w/ [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] sample [REDACTED], draft and send emails to [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] re: their services; review email from [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED], forward same to Ms. Ederi; draft email to Ms. Ederi re: same.	1.7	595.00
10/28/2008	Review emails from Ms. Ezell re: emails to [REDACTED] to be [REDACTED], draft reply email re: same; draft email to Ms. Ezell forwarding [REDACTED]; review email re: instructions for upcoming telephone conference with [REDACTED], Ms. Ederi, and Ms. Ezell; review email from Ms. Ederi re: same.	.5	175.00
10/29/2008	Review email from Ms. Ederi re: prior telephone conference with [REDACTED] and Ms. Ederi; review email from Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED] and a [REDACTED]; review email from Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED]; review notes from conference with [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] draft email to Ms. Ezell and Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED] fees; review email from Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED] review emails from Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED]; draft reply email to Ms. Ederi re: same. (.2 of the time, [REDACTED])	.9	315.00
10/30/2008	Review emails from Ms. Ederi and Ms. Ezell re: [REDACTED] fees; draft reply email re: same; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: same, upcoming [REDACTED], needs list, upcoming telephone conference with [REDACTED], and [REDACTED] telephone conference w/ Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED], [REDACTED], and a collateral.	.3	105.00
10/31/2008	Telephone conference w/ Ms. Ederi re: upcoming telephone conference w/ [REDACTED] telephone conference w/ [REDACTED], Ms. Ederi, and Ms. Ezell re: needs of victims; review emails re: agency names; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: opinions and plans for [REDACTED] and re: Ms. Ederi's telephone conference w/ [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	2.0	700.00
11/3/2008	Review email from Ms. Ederi to [REDACTED], Ms. Ezell, and me re: telephone conference, [REDACTED], and upcoming conference with [REDACTED] (with Ms. Ezell and Ms. Ederi) ([REDACTED]).	.1	35.00

October 10, 2008
Invoice No. 327
Matter: Epstein

11/4/2008	Telephone conference w/ Ms. Ederi re: victim and re: conferences with [REDACTED] and [REDACTED]; conference w/ Ms. Ederi re: same; conference w/ Mr. Josefsberg and Ms. Ederi re: victims. (.2 of the time, [REDACTED]);	.7	245.00
11/10/2008	Review, and draft replies to, emails from Ms. Ederi re: notes from meeting w/ collateral; review Ms. Ederi's notes re: same; review my notes re: same; revise Ms. Ederi's notes re: same; telephone conference w/ Ms. Ederi re: same; conference w/ Ms. Ederi re: same. ([REDACTED])	2.1	735.00
TOTAL	32.9 hours @ \$350.00 per hour		\$11,515.00