

# INVOICE

February 28, 2009

Invoice No. 330

Matter: Epstein

Susan E. Bennett, Esq.  
10420 SW 139<sup>th</sup> Street  
Miami, Florida 33176  
(305) 510-4705

<u>Date</u>	<u>Matter No.</u>	<u>Description of Service</u>	<u>Time</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/24/09	[REDACTED]	Prepare [REDACTED], conference with Ms. Ederi re: same and [REDACTED].	2.3	805.00
1/25/09	[REDACTED]	Prepare [REDACTED], telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED]; prepare [REDACTED], telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED].	3.1	1,085.00
	[REDACTED]	Telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED] interview.	.1	35.00
1/26/09	[REDACTED]	Prepare [REDACTED]; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: same; conference with Ms. Ederi re: same; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: miscellaneous.	2.1	735.00
	[REDACTED]	Telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: needed contact information for proper resources; conference with Ms. Ederi re: same.	.6	210.00
1/27/09	[REDACTED]	Prepare [REDACTED].	.5	175.00
1/28/09	30608 General	Telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED].	.2	70.00
	[REDACTED]	Prepare [REDACTED] and notes.	1.2	420.00
1/31/09	30608 General	Conference with Ms. Ederi re: miscellaneous.	.2	70.00
2/1/09	[REDACTED]	Prepare [REDACTED].	.9	315.00
2/2/09	[REDACTED]	Prepare [REDACTED].	1.9	665.00

February 28, 2009

Invoice No. 330

Matter: Epstein

2/3/09	[REDACTED]	Prepare [REDACTED]	.4	140.00
2/4/09	30608 General	Conference with Ms. Ederi re: victims' present situations and [REDACTED]	.1	35.00
	[REDACTED]	Conference with Ms. Ederi re: victim's present situation and [REDACTED]	.2	70.00
	[REDACTED]	Conference with Ms. Ederi re: victim's present situation and [REDACTED]	.1	35.00
	[REDACTED]	Conference with Ms. Ederi re: victim's present situation and [REDACTED]; prepare [REDACTED], review [REDACTED]	.7	245.00
2/9/09	[REDACTED]	Prepare [REDACTED]	4.3	1,505.00
2/10/09	[REDACTED]	Prepare [REDACTED], review email from Ms. Ezell re: upcoming [REDACTED]; prepare [REDACTED]	4.1	1,435.00
2/11/09	[REDACTED]	Review email from Ms. Ederi re: upcoming [REDACTED] interview; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: same; prepare [REDACTED], prepare [REDACTED]	4.0	1,400.00
2/12/09	30608 General	Telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: upcoming conference to review status of cases.	.1	35.00
	[REDACTED]	Telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED] interview and Ms. Ezell's email.	.2	70.00
2/13/09	30608 General	Review email from Ms. Ederi re: status of case and upcoming conference re: same; review letter to Mr. Josefsberg from Defendant's counsel Mr. Lefkowitz re: attorneys' fees and settlement; review email from Ms. Sheehan re: [REDACTED] ( [REDACTED] ); exchange emails with Mr. Josefsberg, Ms. Ederi, Ms. Sheehan, and Ms. Ezell re: upcoming conference re: status of case.	1.1	385.00
2/16/09	[REDACTED]	Prepare [REDACTED]	3.3	1,155.00

2/17/09	30608 General	Review emails from Ms. Sheehan and Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED] and research [REDACTED] telephone conference with Ms. Ederi's meeting with [REDACTED] and upcoming conference re: status of case.	1.3	455.00
		Prepare [REDACTED]; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED] and upcoming conference with victim.	5.4	1,890.00
2/18/09	30608	Prepare for conference re: status of case; conference with Mr. Josefsberg (for part), Ms. Ederi, Ms. Sheehan (& Ms. Yarzabal for part) re: status of each case, [REDACTED], responding to Defendant's counsel Mr. Lefkowitz's letter, [REDACTED], and [REDACTED], conference with same; conference with same and [REDACTED] regarding status and [REDACTED]; review article re: Defendant.	10.0	3,500.00
		Telephone conference with Mr. Josefsberg, Ms. Ederi, and Ms. Sheehan with victim re: [REDACTED].	.3	105.00
		Review [REDACTED] with Ms. Ederi to prepare for upcoming conference with victim.	1.0	350.00
		Initial interview of victim.	2.0	700.00
2/19/09	30608 General	Review emails from Ms. Ederi re: Defendant's deposition.	.2	70.00
		Telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED].	.1	35.00
		Review email from Ms. Sheehan re: victim.	.1	35.00
2/20/09	30608 General	Review emails from Ms. Yarzabal, Ms. Sheehan, and Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED]; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: same; telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: miscellaneous; review emails from Mr. Josefsberg's office and Ms. Ederi re: draft of response letter to Defendant's counsel Mr. Lefkowitz's letter.	1.5	525.00

		Telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: victim's situation and re: telephone conference between Ms. Ederi, Mr. Josefsberg, and victim.	.2	70.00
2/21/09		Review email from Ms. Ederi re: interview notes; print out interview notes.	.1	35.00
		Review email from Ms. Ederi re: interview notes; print out interview notes.	.1	35.00
		Review email from Ms. Ederi re: interview notes; print out interview notes.	.2	70.00
		Telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: future interview arrangements.	.2	70.00
2/22/09	30608 General	Review emails from Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED]	.3	105.00
		Prepare [REDACTED]	.6	210.00
		Telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: interview of victim.	.3	105.00
2/23/09	30608 General	Conference with Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED] and [REDACTED]; review emails from legal team re: [REDACTED]; review emails re: [REDACTED]; review email from Ms. Sheehan re: recap of conference on 2/18/09.	.6	210.00
		Conference with Ms. Ederi re: settlement.	.1	35.00
		Conference with Ms. Ederi re: victim's present status; prepare [REDACTED].	.2	70.00
		Telephone conference with Ms. Ederi and Ms. Sheehan re: [REDACTED]; conference with Ms. Ederi re: settlement.	.2	70.00
		Telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: upcoming interview of victim; conference with Ms. Ederi re: same; telephone interview of victim with Ms. Ederi; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi, Ms. Sheehan, and Ms. Ezell re: [REDACTED]	5.0	1,750.00
2/24/09	30608 General	Telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED] and Defendant's present situation.	.2	70.00
		Prepare [REDACTED]; review [REDACTED]	2.6	910.00

February 28, 2009

Invoice No. 330

Matter: Epstein

		with victim; prepare [REDACTED] Review notes of victim's interview.	1.2	420.00
		Telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: victim's situation and interview; telephone interview of victim with Ms. Ederi.	5.3	1,855.00
2/25/09	30608 General	Review emails among Ms. Ederi, Ms. Ezell, and Ms. Sheehan re: [REDACTED] others' pleadings, [REDACTED], and [REDACTED]; review email from Ms. Sheehan re: recap of 2/18 legal team conference; review notes re: same conference; research re: [REDACTED]; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: same; review 2007 article re: Defendant; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: same.	2.9	1,015.00
		Prepare [REDACTED], review summaries in preparation for upcoming conference with victim; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: same.	.8	280.00
		Review interview notes in preparation for upcoming [REDACTED] interview.	.2	70.00
		Telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: victim's status.	.2	70.00
		Telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED].	.1	35.00
2/26/09		Prepare and organize questions for [REDACTED]; draft and send text to Ms. [REDACTED]; draft and send text to Ms. Ederi re: same; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: same; review [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] in preparation of conference.	1.6	560.00
		Review [REDACTED] sent by email from Ms. Sheehan; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: same; [REDACTED], draft and send emails to Ms. Ederi, Mr. Josefsberg, Ms. Ezell, and Ms. Sheehan re: and attaching same; review email reply from Ms. Sheehan.	3.7	1,295.00
2/27/09		Telephone conference with Ms. Sheehan and Ms. Ederi (in person) re: settlement and other issues; conference with Ms. Ederi re: present status of victim.	.3	105.00
		Telephone conference with Ms. Sheehan and Ms. Ederi (in person) re: [REDACTED]; conference	.2	70.00

February 28, 2009

Invoice No. 330

Matter: Epstein

	with Ms. Ederi re: present status of victim and ██████████		
██████████ ██████████ ██████████	Prepare for continue of interview; telephone conferences with victim and Ms. Ederi (in person) re: upcoming interview.	.3	105.00
██████████ ██████████	Telephone conference with Ms. Sheehan and Ms. Ederi (in person) re: ██████████ ██████████	.2	70.00
██████████ ██████████	Prepare for interview of ██████████; ██████████ interview in West Palm Beach; conference with victim re: ██████████ in West Palm Beach; telephone conference with Ms. Ezell and Ms. Ederi (in person) re: both; telephone conference with Ms. Sheehan and Ms. Ederi (in person) re: same.	7.3	2,555.00
██████████ ██████████	Prepare for interview of ██████████; ██████████ interview in West Palm Beach; telephone conference with Ms. Ezell and Ms. Ederi (in person) re: same; telephone conference with Ms. Ezell and Ms. Ederi (in person) re: same.	3.7	1,295.00
TOTAL	92.5 hours @ \$350.00 per hour		\$32,375.00