

INVOICE

October 1, 2009

Invoice No. 337

Matter: Epstein

Susan E. Bennett, Esq.
10420 SW 139th Street
Miami, Florida 33176
(305) 510-4705

<u>Date</u>	<u>Matter No.</u>	<u>Description of Service</u>	<u>Time</u>	<u>Amount</u>
9/1/09	30608 General	Telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: meeting with Defendant, settlement, redlining of documents, etc.; telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: statutory law; research re: same; review email from Ms. Ederi re: case law; review email re: upcoming depositions; reviewed email from Ms. Ezell to Mr. Josefsberg re: deposition and overlap with clients; review email from Ms. Ederi re: deponent information and link to article; reply.	2.2	770.00
9/2/09	30608 General	Review emails re: depositions; review emails re: deposition of Defendant; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: settlement issues; research re: statutes.	1.5	525.00
	[REDACTED]	Telephone conference and texts with Ms. Ederi re: statutes; research re: same.	.7	245.00
9/3/09	30608 General	Review email [REDACTED] re: and attaching [REDACTED] review email from Ms. Ezell forwarding email re: mediators; email Ms. Ezell and Ms. Ederi re: statutory research.	.4	140.00
	[REDACTED]	Email Ms. Ederi re: research results; review email from Ms. Ezell re: relevant facts; reply; review email from Ms. Ezell to client re: [REDACTED]	.6	210.00
9/4/09	30608 General	Review email re: and attaching letter from Mr. Critton re: Defendant's attendance at depositions and re: motion for protective order; review reply from Mr. Josefsberg; review email re: [REDACTED]; review emails attaching and re: cross-notices; review email [REDACTED] re: attending state court hearing on motion for protective order.	.8	280.00
	[REDACTED]	Review emails re: [REDACTED].	.3	105.00
9/6/09	30608	Review email from Mr. Josefsberg to defense re:	.1	35.00

	General			
9/7/09	30608 General	Review email from Ms. Ederi re: and attaching notes from July 1 meeting with Defendant; review same; review email from Ms. Ezell re: depositions of witnesses; review reply from Mr. Josefsberg.	.4	.00
9/8/09	30608 General	Review emails from Ms. Yarzabal with links to articles; review same; review emails attaching subpoenas and notices of depositions; review email from Ms. Yarzabal re: upcoming depositions; review emails re: [REDACTED] depositions; review email [REDACTED] re: same and re: protective order; review from Mr. Josefsberg re: same; review emails from Ms. Ezell re: mediation; review email from Ms. Ezell attaching information re: Defendant's expert; review email from Ms. Ederi re: miscellaneous issues; review emails re: financial security; review email attaching correspondence re: a deponent; review same. Review email from Ms. Ederi re: anonymity, etc.	1.5 .1	525.00 35.00
9/9/09	30608 General	Telephone conference with team re: depositions, clients, strategy, etc.; telephone conference re: depositions, etc.; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: same.	1.8	630.00
9/10/09	30608 General	Review email from Ms. Yarzabal with link to article; review same; review email attaching notice of production and subpoenas; [REDACTED] same with link to article; review reply from Ms. Ezell re: same and re: motion to inspect; review email from Ms. Ezell to team re: proposed response to same; review article re: Defendant; email team re: same.	1.5	525.00
9/13/09	30608 General	Review email from Ms. Ederi re: letter re: deponent and attaching same; review same; review email from Ms. Ederi re: attending depositions. Review email from Ms. Ederi re: telephone conference with client and re: her status; review article; reply to email from Ms. Ederi re: article; review reply from Ms. Ederi.	.2 .6	70.00 210.00

9/14/09	30608 General	Review emails re: [REDACTED] re: access; review email from MS. Ederi re: presence at deposition of [REDACTED]; review email from Ms. Ezell and others in string re: Mr. Riley; team meeting re: all clients; research re: [REDACTED]; text Ms. Ederi re: same;	9.0	3,150.00
	[REDACTED]	Research re: miscellaneous; email Ms. Ederi re: same.	.3	105.00
	[REDACTED]	Research re: miscellaneous; email Ms. Ederi re: same.	.3	105.00
9/15/09	30608 General	Review email re: set depositions; review email from Ms. Ezell to team re: same; review email from Ms. Estrada attaching withdrawal of cross-notice; send emails to team re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; review replies from Ms. Ezell; review emails attaching cross-notices; review email from Ms. Ezell re: subpoena of Mr. Riley; review email re: and [REDACTED]; review notice of canceling depositions; review email from Ms. Estrada attaching our motion to file amicus curiae brief to support Jane Doe's motion for protective order enforcing no- contact order; review email from Ms. Ezell re: same; review email from Ms. Ezell re: service; review email re: cancellation of deposition; research re: statutes. Review email replies from Ms. Ederi re: research re: miscellaneous.	1.5	525.00
	[REDACTED]	Review email replies from Ms. Ederi re: research re: miscellaneous.	.1	35.00
	[REDACTED]	Review anonymity file; email Ms. Ederi, Ms. Ezell, and Ms. Yarzabal re: ruling on same.	.3	105.00
	[REDACTED]	Review email from Ms. Ederi re: telephone conference with client; review anonymity file; email Ms. Ederi, Ms. Ezell, and Ms. Yarzabal re: ruling on same.	.4	140.00
9/16/09	30608 General	Review emails re: depositions and motion to inspect property; review email forward from Mr. Josefsberg of email from Mr. Critton re: [REDACTED] and meeting; review email from Ms. Ederi re: proposed trust agreement, etc.; review email from Ms. Ederi re: a plaintiff's whereabouts; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: statutes and re: miscellaneous issues re:	1.0	350.00

		clients.		
		Review email from Ms. Ederi to Ms. Yarzabal re: research.	.1	35.00
		Review email from Ms. Ederi to Ms. Yarzabal re: research.	.1	35.00
		Review order from Ms. Estrada attaching order on Defendant's motion to compel, etc.	.1	35.00
		Review order from Ms. Estrada attaching order on Defendant's motion to compel, etc.	.1	35.00
9/17/09	30608 General	Review email attaching deposition notice; review emails re: depositions; review articles sent by Ms. Yarzabal; email Ms. Ederi re: article; review email from Ms. Ezell forwarding email from Mr. Critton [REDACTED].	.5	175.00
		Review email from Ms. Estrada re: mediation date.	.1	35.00
		Telephone conference with client and team re: settlement.	.8	280.00
9/18/09	30608 General	Review email from Ms. Yarzabal with link to video of deposition of Defendant; review emails attaching notices of depositions; review email from Ms. Yarzabal attaching deposition calendar; review email re: deposition changes; review email from Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED].	.5	175.00
9/21/09	30608 General	Telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: depositions; telephone conferences with Ms. Ederi re: settling; review email re: deposition of Defendant; review email attaching notices of hearings; review emails from Ms. Ederi re: and attaching articles.	.9	.00
		Telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: facts.	.2	70.00
		Telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: settlement, etc.	.2	70.00
9/22/09	30608 General	Review emails from Ms. Yarzabal with links to articles; review same; email team re: same; review replies from Ms. Ezell and Ms. Ederi; review email from Ms. Ezell re: service on Ms. Maxwell; reply; email team re: unsealing of NPA; review replies from Ms. Ezell and Ms. Ederi.	1.3	455.00

October 1, 2009

Invoice No. 337

Matter: Epstein

9/23/09	30608 General	Review documents and prepare notes for meeting; conference with Ms. Ederi re: same; team meeting to prepare for settlement meeting with Defendant; telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: same; text Ms. Ederi re: information from research re: issues discussed in meeting.	10.2	3,570.00
9/24/09	30608 General [REDACTED]	Telephone conference with Ms. Ederi re: tomorrow's meeting. Review notes re: NPA, etc.	.5 1.0	175.00 350.00
9/25/09	30608 General [REDACTED]	Exchange texts with Ms. Ederi re: preparing for meeting with Defendant; review files and prepare notes for meeting; review email from Ms. Ederi [REDACTED] [REDACTED] re: meeting; review email re: cancellation of deposition; meeting with team, Defendant, and Mr. Critton; meeting with Ms. Ezell and Mr. Doddo re: today's meeting and issues to resolve; research re: [REDACTED]; meeting with Ms. Ezell re: settlement; text Ms. Ezell and Ms. Ederi re: [REDACTED] re: settlement. Telephone conference with client re: settlement.	10.1 .2	3,535.00 70.00
9/26/09	30608 General	Telephone conferences with Mr. Ederi re: settlement; send texts to Ms. Ederi re: settlement figures; text Ms. Ederi re: state crimes.	.9	315.00
9/27/09	30608 General	Review emails from Ms. Ederi re: meeting with Defendant; send replies.	.3	105.00
9/29/09	30608 General [REDACTED]	Review email from Ms. Yarzabal with links to articles; review same; review email re: deposition. Review email from Ms. Ederi re: meeting with client.	.4 .2	140.00 70.00
9/30/09	30608 General	Review email attaching documents re: [REDACTED].	.1	35.00
	TOTAL	54.4 hours @ \$350.00 per hour		\$19,040.00