LSJ CONSTRUCTION
Subcontractor Payout

Master Suite #1004
Thassos Marble

Project:
Trade:

Subcontractor Makedonika Marble, Inc.

Original Cﬂntréct Sum:

August 3, 2010

Req. #1

Insurance expiration: January 0, 1900 |
Partial

$36,650.00

Change Orders Submitted & Approved: $0.00
New Change Orders: $0.00
Total Work Contracted to Date: $36,650.00
Total Work Completed to Date: 100% $36,650.00
Less Retainage: $0.00
Total Payments Made to Date: $0.00
Total Current Payment Due: $36,650.00
Balance to Finish including Retainage: $0.00
Sales Tax Liability:
a. Subcontractor/Supplier is liable, explail install iny / tax
included in contract

b. Non-resident Subcontractor/Supplier Bond Applicable:
c. Use Tax to be paid by our company:
d. Shipping None

$36,650.00

JEE approval attached
YES NO
X

o )

Submitted Bill

Date: August 3, 2010

Approved by: Emad \\
7 \
Signed: [ Em'x\

Total Outlays for this contract incl. Sales or Use Tax:

Invoice Attached

YES NO
A

Approved by: Gary >
Signed:

Date: August 3, 2010

Approved by:
Signed:

Date:

Date: I'=_x %}}H/} C'

o
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LEJ CONSTRUCTION

Project Master Suita #1004

Supplier - full legal namae: Makedanika Marbla, inc Dale Revised August 17, 2010
Phasa # 09-341
Trade: Thassos Marble - slabs
Invoice #: Heg. =1
Ingurance expirabion: Payment
Partial Final
X
Invnice/Re Dale |CIO Amount Relamnage Due Paid Date Paid |Check# | Balance |
Amaunt DansHo 47,6562 50 T
COs2
CO#3
COma i
CO#s
e _—— . —————— ——
inilion i1 Tolal Payment 47,652.50 0.00 ] 47 652 50 T AT.B52.50
isitson #2 0.00 - 0.00
Requigition #3 0.00
[Requisition #4 N 0.00
[Total [ _arss250] 0.00] 4785250 0.00 47652 50 |

Contract Amount - Phase

g Thassos Marbia - slabs A7.652 50
1 - Descriplion
Cownz B - Descriplion
COxa - Degcription o
GO Descriplion
Co=s Descripticon
Confracted To Date 47,652 50
Balance of Conlract wiRetainage -
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Emad Hanna

From: William Rowles

Sent: Tuesday, August 17, 2010 11:18 AM
To: Emad Hanna

Cc: Gary Kerney; Monique Harry
Subject: Fw: Thassos Slab Payout
Attachments: Slab Payout 01.pdf

Emad -

Please get this payment to them as quickly as you can. They will only hold this marble for us until
today.

Thanks

William Rowles

6100 Red Hook Quarter B3
St. Thomas, VI 00802

(i Please consider the environment before printing this email.

- Forwarded Message ----

ror vitiom rovic: IR
To: William Rowles

Sent: Tue, August 17, 2010 10:51:29 AM

Subject: RE: Thassos Slab Payout

Approved Gary

From: William Rowles

Sent: Tue 8/17/2010 10:31 AM
To: Gary Kerney

Cc: Monigue Harry

Subject: Thassos Slab Payout

Gary -
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Please approve payment of $47,652.50 for the Thassos slabs as per attached.

William Rowles

6100 Hed Hook Quarter B3
St. Thomas, VI 00802

(i Please consider the environment before printing this email.
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Emad Hanna

From: Jeffrey Epstein [jeevacation@gmail.com)

Sent: Tuesday, August 17, 2010 2:10 PM

To: Emad Hanna

Subject: Re: LSJ Master Suite Marble

ok

On Tue, Aug 17, 2010 at 12:01 PM, Emad Hanna _ wrote:
Jeffrey,

[ forgot to mention the budget line item for this marble will be over budget by $ 14,302 and Gary said the labor
will be under budget by about $ 8,000 so the net of these two line items will be over budget by $ 6,000

Thank you

Emad Hanna
Project Controller
HBRK Associates

PO Box 480

New York, NY 10158

e R Y R e T T
The information contained in this communication is

confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may

constitute inside information, and is intended only for

the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this

communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
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