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Emad Hanna

From: Manique Harry ]
Sent: Wednesday, December 08, 2010 12:08 PM
To: Emad Hanna

Subject: FW: Johnny Weekes Invoice 65997
Attachments: Weekes 65997 pdf, Johnny Weekes 65997 pdf
Emad,

Attached for payment Johnny Weekes Invoice 65997. Project 1010 Code 03-130
Monique

Date: Wed, & Dec 2010 08:42:13 -0800

Subiect: Fw: Fwd: Johnny Weekes Invoice 65997
To:

William Rowles

6100 Red Hook Quarter B3
St. Thomas, VI 00802

----- Forwarded Message ----

From: <

To:

Sent: Thu, December 2, 2010 12:16:21 PM
Subject: Fwd: Johnny Weekes Invoice 65997

approved for payment

—====-=--- Forwarded message ----------

From: Monique Harry <momqgueharry _

Date: Thu. Dec 2, 2010 at 9:35 AM
Subject: Johnnv Weekes Invoice 65997

[0

Good Day.

Attached for vour approval Johnny Weekes Invoice 65997 in the amount of $640.00.
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$300.00 hauling Tanker
$300.00 (loading cement & barge wait time)
$40.00 Port Charges

Please forward to Bill Rowles for construction coding upon your approval.

Monique
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