
Emad Hanna 

From: Monique Harry  
Sent: Thursday, April 15, 2010 10:21 AM 
To: Emad Hanna; Daphne Wallace 
Subject: FW: Allied 33812 
Attachments: Allied 33812.pdt 

From: 
To: 
CC: 
Subject: 
Date: Thu, 15 Apr 2010 10:19:53 -0400 

Good Morning Emad, 

Attached for your review Allied Rental Invoice #33812. Payment made on Casey's credit for Construction 
project 1012 code 01-645. 

Monique 

Hotmail: Trusted email with powerful SPAM protection. Sign uo now. 

Hotmail: Trusted email with powerful SPAM protection. Sian uo now. 
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