
Re: RIB Sportis S-10500/K Shona 1 

Do: 

Temat: Re: RIB 5 ortis 5-10500/K 

Ukryta kopia: 
Data: Non, 24 Jun 2013 14:18:29 +0200 

"Adam Zygowski " 

"Richard Kahn" < 

Dear Richard, 

Following our discussion, enclosed please find the contract with the required modifications. 

I have the following comments: 

section 5.4 - after discussing with our lawyer, I think it would be more reasonable if you carried out the 

technical inspection of final product here in the factory, and upon this transfer the second payment (before 

shipment). 

Either you may come yourself (you are very welcome, plane tickets to Poland with return to NY is 8 1-2 k) or 

entitle someone to do it for you. 

We can also arrange an inspector of Germanischer Lloyd or other class. society, and even cover the costs. 

Finally we can entitle somebody to be present during the loading the boat on the ship. 

However what we would highly require is payment before shipment. 

section 6.1 - we picked British law. Can be Spanish or Portuguese - better geographically, however I don't know if 

this is on the same arbitration level as German, British, Austrian. 

I will give you a call ca. 10 NY EST to discuss. 

Best regards 

Adam Zygowski 

Dnia 21-06-2013 0 23:28:34 Richard Kahn < napisak(a): 

> it was nice talking with you earlier. I have summarized our > conversation regarding changes to the contract as 

follows: 

> a) Buyer Name - Page 1 

> LSJE LLC 6100 Red Hook Quarter, 83 St Thomas, USVI 00802 

> hl see small grammar comments on word document i sent you 

> c) section 2.2 - delivery to st [homes not dominican republic 

> dl section 5.3 - delay of 1 month not 3 months 

> el section 5.4 - we will supply bank guarantee for final 501 payment to > be released after buyer has 2 weeks 

after delivery in st thomas to + install engines and test boat 

> t) section 6.1 - pick country in between usvi and poland for arbitration 

> Thank you again for all your help. Looking forward to resolving + contract and sending wire next week 

> • Richard Kahn 
> HBRK Associates Inc. 
> 575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 

> New York, New York 10022 
> tel 
> fax 

> cell 

> On Jun 21, 2013, at 6:37 AM, Adam Zygowski wrote: 

+>. I will give you a call approx. 9.00-10.00 NY ost. 
4> 

4> Besr regards 
» Adam Zygowski 

4, Onia 20-05-2013 o 22:24:50 Richard Kahn - a a> napisallal: 

>» i have attached our attorneys comments 
5» would you have time tomorrow to discuss 
>» thank you 
>» 

>» Richard Kahn 
>» MIRK Associates Inc. 
>» 575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
>» New York, New York 10022 
>» tel 
>» fax 
>» cell 
>» 
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