

ATTERBURY, GOLDBERGER & WEISS, P.A.
250 Australian Avenue South
Suite 1400
West Palm Beach, Florida 33401

Fax: [REDACTED]

DATE: December 1, 2009

TO: Darren Indyke ([REDACTED])
Jeffrey Epstein (jeevacation@gmail.com)

FROM: Jack Goldberger

REMARKS: Invoices from Cohen & Gresser - Please advise as to whether
I should pay these invoices,.

TOTAL PAGES: 7, including cover sheet

Cohen & Gresser LLP
100 Park Avenue
New York, New York 10017
Telephone [REDACTED]
Fax [REDACTED]
Tax #16-1645666

Jack A. Goldberger, Esq.
Atterbury Goldberger & Weiss, P.A.
250 Australian Avenue South
Suite 1400
West Palm Beach FL 33401-5012

Page: 1
November 24, 2009
Client Number: 1407-001
Statement No: 9714

Doe v. Jeffrey Epstein

Expenses

Court Reporter	476.40
TOTAL EXPENSES Thru 10/31/2009	476.40
TOTAL CURRENT WORK	476.40
PREVIOUS BALANCE	\$9,481.00

Payments

Total Payments for 11/02/2009	-9,481.00
-------------------------------	-----------

BALANCE DUE	<u>\$476.40</u>
--------------------	------------------------

Please Remit	<u>\$476.40</u>
--------------	-----------------

SEARCHED BY [REDACTED]

40.00

TOTAL CURRENT WORK

476.40

TOTAL EXPENSES THRU 10/31/2009

476.40

Please include your client number on all payments.

476.40

Wires to: JP Morgan Chase, 850 Third Avenue, New York, NY 10022
ABA Routing #021000021, SWIFT code CHASUS33
For credit to Cohen & Gresser LLP Account [REDACTED]

Cohen & Gresser LLP
 100 Park Avenue
 New York, New York 10017
 Telephone [REDACTED]
 Fax [REDACTED]
 Tax #16-1645666

Jack A. Goldberger, Esq.
 Atterbury Golderger & Weiss, P.A.
 250 Australian Avenue South
 Suite 1400
 West Palm Beach FL 33401-5012

Page: 1
 November 25, 2009
 Client Number: 1413-001
 Statement No: 9733

Doe v. Ghislainè Maxwell

Fees

		Rate	Hours		
09/24/2009	MSC	Telephone conference with G. Maxwell; conferences with B. Jaffe; e-mails re case.	550.00	0.80	440.00
10/05/2009	BDJ	Conference with M. Cohen; conference with G. Maxwell; review documents re: same.	475.00	1.80	855.00
	MSC	Conference with B. Jaffe; telephone conferences with client; telephone conferences re case.	550.00	1.50	825.00
	MSC	G. Maxwell -- telephone conference with client and B. Jaffe; conference with B. Jaffe; review materials.	550.00	2.00	1,100.00
10/08/2009	MSC	Multiple telephone conferences with client and B. Jaffe; conferences with B. Jaffe; telephone conferences with J. Goldberger and B. Jaffe; review documents.	550.00	3.50	1,925.00
	BDJ	Multiple telephone conference with G. Maxwell; conf with M. Cohen; various telephone conferences; conferences with J. Goldberger, R. Critton.	475.00	3.80	1,805.00
10/09/2009	MSC	Multiple telephone conferences with client; multiple telephone conferences re responding to reporters; telephone conferences with client and A. Stone; telephone conferences with J. Goldberger; drafting re materials; telephone conference with B. Jaffe; review materials.	550.00	5.00	2,750.00
	AS	Tasks related to responding to reporters on behalf			

Doe v. Ghislaine Maxwell

		Rate	Hours	
	of G. Maxwell; reviewing all complaints filed against J. Epstein; close review of Jane Doe 102 Complaint	315.00	5.80	1,827.00
10/12/2009				
MSC	Multiple telephone conferences re case; conferences with B. Jaffe; review materials.	550.00	1.00	550.00
AS	Research standards for a motion to quash in the SDNY	315.00	2.80	882.00
BDJ	Meeting with M. Cohen; review research; conf with A. Stone re same; telephone conference with G. Maxwell.	475.00	1.20	570.00
10/13/2009				
MSC	Telephone conferences re case; telephone conferences with R. Critton; telephone conference with J. Goldberger; conferences re case.	550.00	1.50	825.00
AS	Continue research related to motion to quash and motion for protective order; begin to draft motion papers; research related to statutes of limitations for civil actions	315.00	6.00	1,890.00
BDJ	Prepare for meeting with G. Maxwell; review civil complaints; review research; conf A. Stone re same.	475.00	2.40	1,140.00
10/14/2009				
MSC	Conference with client, B. Jaffe and A. Stone; conferences with B. Jaffe; multiple telephone conferences re case; review materials.	550.00	3.50	1,925.00
BDJ	Prepare for mtg with G. Maxwell; Meeting with G. Maxwell, M. Cohen, A. Stone.	475.00	3.70	1,757.50
10/15/2009				
AS	Draft motion to quash and gather precedent for B. Jaffe	315.00	6.30	1,984.50
MSC	Telephone conferences with J. Goldberger; conferences with B. Jaffe; review materials.	550.00	1.00	550.00
JA	Opened file on new case; created binder sets of case materials for attorney review.	115.00	2.00	230.00
10/16/2009				
MSC	Multiple telephone conferences with client; e-mails re case; review letter.	550.00	0.40	220.00

Doe v. Ghislaine Maxwell

			Rate	Hours	
10/18/2009	MSC	Conference with client; review materials; telephone conference re case.	550.00	2.00	1,100.00
10/19/2009	AS	Review Rodriguez and Alessi deposition transcripts; continue to draft motion to quash/motion for protective order	315.00	3.20	1,008.00
	MSC	Telephone conference with client; telephone conference with J. Goldberger; conference with B. Jaffe.	550.00	1.00	550.00
	JA	Created binder set of deposition transcripts for attorney review.	115.00	1.00	115.00
	BDJ	Telephone conference with counsel; review depo transcripts; meeting with A. Stone re same; conference with M. Cohen.	475.00	1.20	570.00
10/20/2009	MSC	E-mails client; conference with B. Jaffe; review materials.	550.00	0.30	165.00
	BDJ	Attention to issues re deposition subpoena, motion for protective order; conf A. Stone re same; conf M. Cohen re same.	475.00	2.00	950.00
10/21/2009	MSC	Telephone conference with J. Goldberger and B. Jaffe; telephone conference with client; review materials.	550.00	0.70	385.00
	AS	Discussion with Part I clerk; review Keenan and Stein discovery opinions;	315.00	4.80	1,512.00
	JA	Printed and assembled cases for attorney review.	115.00	1.00	115.00
	BDJ	Telephone conference with J. Goldberger, M. Cohen; Telephone conference with B. Edwards; telephone conference with G. Maxwell; review research.	475.00	2.00	950.00
10/22/2009	MSC	Review letter from B. Edwards; conference with B. Jaffe; telephone conference with client.	550.00	0.80	440.00
	AS	Review Jones and Batts discovery opinions.	315.00	2.70	850.50

Doe v. Ghislaine Maxwell

		Rate	Hours	
	BDJ Draft/revise letter to B. Edwards; attention to research issues; meeting with A. Stone re same; meetings with M. Cohen re strategy; telephone conference with G. Maxwell.	475.00	3.70	1,757.50
10/23/2009	MSC Telephone conferences with client; conference with B. Jaffe re strategy.	550.00	0.30	165.00
	BDJ Revise letter to B. Edwards; meeting with M. Cohen re same; transmit same.	475.00	1.80	855.00
10/26/2009	MSC Telephone conference with client.	550.00	0.50	275.00
	BDJ Correspondence re subpoena; Email B. Edwards.	475.00	1.20	570.00
10/27/2009	MSC Multiple telephone conferences with client.	550.00	0.50	275.00
	BDJ Multiple telephone conferences with client.	475.00	0.50	237.50
10/28/2009	BDJ Telephone conference with B. Edwards; conf with M. Cohen re same; draft/revise confidentiality restrictions.	475.00	1.40	665.00
10/30/2009	MSC Telephone conference with R. Critton and B. Jaffe; conference with B. Jaffe; review materials.	550.00	0.80	440.00
	BDJ Telephone conference with R. Critton; telephone conference with G. Maxwell; review materials, research.	475.00	1.40	665.00
	FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED		90.80	38,666.50

Recapitulation

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total</u>
Mark S. Cohen	27.10	\$550.00	\$14,905.00
James Abamont	4.00	115.00	460.00
Brett D. Jaffe	28.10	475.00	13,347.50
Alexis Stone	31.60	315.00	9,954.00

Expenses

Research - Westlaw	433.58
Overnight Courier	15.50

• • • * Jack A. Goldberger, Esq.

Page: 5

November 25, 2009

Client Number: 1413-001

Statement No: 9733

Doe v. Ghislaine Maxwell

Outside Reproduction Service	41.96
TOTAL EXPENSES Thru 10/31/2009	<u>491.04</u>
TOTAL CURRENT WORK	39,157.54
BALANCE DUE	<u>\$39,157.54</u>
Please Remit	<u>\$39,157.54</u>

Please include your client number on all payments.

Wires to: JP Morgan Chase, 850 Third Avenue, New York, NY 10022

ABA Routing #021000021, SWIFT code CHASUS33

For credit to Cohen & Gresser LLP Account [REDACTED]

EFTA00617290