

Poe & Burton PLLC

EIN [REDACTED]

Invoice submitted to:
Mr. Jeffrey Epstein
c/o Darren K. Indyke, PLLC
[REDACTED]

June 09, 2015

In Reference To: Review Project

Our Matter No. 0510.1501

Invoice #12169

Professional Services

Hrs/Rate Amount

May 2015

5/1/2015	Draft and review correspondence; review pleadings. Gregory L. Poe	0.50 650.00/hr	325.00
5/4/2015	Draft and review correspondence. Gregory L. Poe	0.25 650.00/hr	162.50
5/5/2015	Draft and review correspondence; review 11th Circuit briefs; review district court pleadings and transcript regarding remedial and related issues. Gregory L. Poe	1.75 650.00/hr	1,137.50
5/7/2015	Draft correspondence; review case. Gregory L. Poe	0.25 650.00/hr	162.50
5/11/2015	Draft and review correspondence. Gregory L. Poe	0.50 650.00/hr	325.00
5/13/2015	Draft and review correspondence. Gregory L. Poe	0.25 650.00/hr	162.50
5/14/2015	Correspondence with M. Weinberg. Gregory L. Poe	0.25 650.00/hr	162.50
5/17/2015	Draft and review correspondence regarding amicus brief issues. Gregory L. Poe	0.75 650.00/hr	487.50
5/18/2015	Draft correspondence to and review correspondence from client, K. Ruemmler, M. Weinberg; conference call with K. Ruemmler and M. Weinberg. Gregory L. Poe	0.75 650.00/hr	487.50
5/19/2015	Draft memorandum to potential amici; review documents regarding same; draft and review correspondence. Gregory L. Poe	2.75 650.00/hr	1,787.50

www.poeburton.com

(202) 583-2500 (t); (202) 583-0565 (f)

EFTA00620095

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
5/20/2015 Teleconference with M. Stancil regarding U.S. Chamber of Commerce; teleconference with A. Alschuler regarding potential law professor brief; draft correspondence to A. Alschuler. Gregory L. Poe	1.25 650.00/hr	812.50
5/21/2015 Teleconference with A. Alschuler; telconference with T. Gaziano at Pacific Legal Foundation; teleconference with R. Samp at Washington Legal Foundation; teleconference with J. Elwood; review correspondence from other counsel regarding potential amici; revise memorandum. Gregory L. Poe	3.75 650.00/hr	2,437.50
5/22/2015 Teleconferences with representatives for potential amici; revise memorandum; update research. Gregory L. Poe	2.25 650.00/hr	1,462.50
5/25/2015 Revise legal research memorandum; draft summary memorandum; correspondence with M. Weinberg and K. Ruemmler. Gregory L. Poe	1.50 650.00/hr	975.00
5/26/2015 Review correspondence from M. Weinberg; draft and revise correspondence; draft correspondence to client. Gregory L. Poe	0.50 650.00/hr	325.00
5/27/2015 Teleconferences with M. Weinberg; revise summary memorandum. Gregory L. Poe	1.75 650.00/hr	1,137.50
5/28/2015 Revise summary memorandum; review cases; correspondence with M. Weinberg and K. Ruemmler. Gregory L. Poe	1.50 650.00/hr	975.00
5/29/2015 Correspondence with M. Weinberg and K. Ruemmler; draft and review correspondence with potential amici; conference with P. Burton; revise summary memorandum. Gregory L. Poe	1.75 650.00/hr	1,137.50
Confer with G. Poe regarding summary memorandum; review same. Preston Burton	0.25 650.00/hr	162.50
5/30/2015 Correspondence with client, M. Weinberg, and K. Ruemmler; review correspondence from A. Alschuler and respond to same; review additional legal research. Gregory L. Poe	1.75 650.00/hr	1,137.50
For professional services rendered	24.25	\$15,762.50

Additional Charges

May 2015

Westlaw Computer Research.

Amount

78.40

Total additional charges

\$78.40

Total amount of this bill

\$15,840.90

Previous balance

\$34,681.41

Balance due

\$50,522.31