Emad Hanﬂ

From: vonique Harr (S
Sent: Tuesday, July 27, !

To: Emad Hanna
Subject: Universal Foam Inc
Attachments: Universal Foam Inc Req 2.pdi

Good Morning Emad,

Attached for payment Universal Foam Inc Req 2 in the amonut of $1,748.93. Project 1009 Code 07-412.

Monigque
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LSJ CONSTRUCTION

Submitted Bill
Signed:

Date: me 2,35’531{;\ A }

W

Date: 5,

Approved by: Gary
Sioned: sze grmce))

Date: July 26, 2010

Approved by:

Signed:

Date;

Signed: @v
N

Subcontractor Payout
Project: Existing Compound Remodel #1009 July 26, 2010
Trade: EIFS Comnice
2
Subcontractor Universal Foam, Inc.
Insurance expiration: January 0, 1900
Invoice # 2 Partial Final
Phase#  |07-412 A
Original Contract Sum: $2,747.64
Change Orders Submitted & Approved: $375.11
New Change Orders: $0.00
Total Work Contracted to Date: $3,122.75
Total Work Completed to Date: 100% $3,122.75 /
Less Retainage: $0.00
Total Payments Made to Date: $1,373.82 -
Total Current Payment Due: $1,748.93
Balance to Finish including Retainage: $0.00
Sales Tax Liability:
a. Subcontractor/Supplier is liable, explaii ~ '"stall only / tax
included in contract
b. Non-resident Subcontractor/Supplier Bond Applicable:
c. Use Tax to be paid by our company:
d. Shipping None
Tutal Outlays for lhIS -::cmtract incl. Sales or Use Tax: $3,122.75
=T frma T s L
JEE approval attached Invoice Attached
YES NO YES NO
X X
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L5 CONSTRUCTION

Project Exisling Compound Remodal #1009

Supplior - Rull legal nama: Universal Foam, Inc. Data Revisod July 26, 2010
Phasa # 07-412
Trade: EIFS
Invoice #: 2
Insurance explration: Paymani
Partial Final
X
[InvocaiReq® Dale|ci0 Amount | Ralainage Due Paid Date Paid | Check#| Balance |
[P.O. Amount 07Mang 2,747 64
COom 071261 0|Freight asn|
coe 1 T
coea
Com
Coss
[Requisiton #1 posit 1.373 2 000 13738z Taraee| 1 0.00
Fequisilion #2 Balance | 174883 |  000| 174893 1,748.093
silion #: ] 000
ition 0.00
[Total [ 312275 ] 0.00] 312275 137382 - 1,748.93 |

Conlract Amownl - Phase

PO [EIF 5 Comine 2747 64
co# Freight — 375.11 | Descripbion
Comn2 - | Descripbian
COo#3 . - | Deserigtion
CO#sa Descrplian
Co#s Description
Contracted To Dale 312275
Balance of Contract wiHelainage .
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Invoice

[N
Dt Invoice #
17639 E Colomal [nve
; {,”k:l”l[ L 7132010 12344

Orlando. F1. 32820

H07-508-8914

Fax: 407-508-892 |

Bill To Job Mame, Bidg/Lot #

Brice Giordon/| 51 Brice Gordon/1.5)

Lattle 5¢. Jamcs Island Little 5t James Tsland

6100 Red ook Quarter 133 6100 Red Hook Quarter 133

| St Thomas. V1 (0K02 51 Thomns. V1 (0802
P.O. No. Tarmsa Due Date Ship Date Project Order Mumber
WIP - COHD I Mue on receipt T2 132010 10310
Descnption Qty Rata Amount

Comice @ 9511087 x96", LIVEPS., HARDCOAT/TRIMER 42 65.42 274764

MADE IN THLE UsA

Freight - Wilson Trucking w' FreightQuotc [ asn 37511

Thank you lor vour business
Subtotal £3.12275
Total $3.122.75
Balance Due $1.748.93
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From: Garv Kemey
To:
Date: Mon, July 26, 2010 6:55:23 PM
e

Subject: RE: Universal Foam

Approved Gary

From: William Rowles [mailt_'|

Sent: Mon 7/26/2010 3:52 PM
To: Gary Kerney

Subject: Universal Foam
Gary -

Please approve final payment to Universal Foam of $1,748.93 for comice at main compound.
Job #1009, cost code 07-412

Thanks
William Rowles

6100 Red Hook Quarter B3
St. Thomas, VI 00802

(Ph)
(Fax)
(Cell)
E-mail:

U Please consider the environment before printing this email

- 712712010
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