Emad Enna

— — =
From: Monique Harry [W
Sent: Monday, December 21, f
To: Gary Kerney
Ce: Emad Hanna
Subject: Little Buck Trucking
Attachments: Little Buck Mech Desal Invoice 1.pdf

Good Afternoon Gary,

Attached for your approval Little Buck Trucking in the amount of $2000.00 for Dump Truck Rental.
Project #1010 Code 02-200. Once approved a check request will be done.

Monique

Windows Live: Keep your friends up to date with what you do online.,

Gl 12T

EFTA00622549



Little Buck Trucking
Nadir #6A
St. Thomas, VI 00802

December 18, 2009
Requisition #1

Period 12/15 - 12/18

Payment requested for the rental of dump truck and operator for period listed above

4 days (@ $500.00 per day = $2,000.00

Thank you

EFTA00622550



Emad Hanna

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

From: GKerney
To: moniqueha

— _
Monique Harry [moniqueharry ]
Monday, December 21, 2008 12:22 PM
Emad Hanna

FW: Little Buck Trucking

e

Subject: Re: Little Buck Trucking
Date: Mon, 21 Dec 2009 12:20:51 -0500

Approved. Gary

Sent from my iPhone

On Dec 21, 2009, at 11:41 AM, "Monigue Harry" _:- wrote:

Good Afternoon Gary,

Attached for your approval Little Buck Trucking in the amount of $2000.00 for Dump Truck

Rental. Project #1010 Code 02-200. Once approved a check request will be done.

Monique

Windows Live: Keep your friends up to date with what you do online.

<Little Buck Mech Desal Invoice 1.pdf=

Keep your friends updated— even when you're not signed in.

EFTA00622551



