Little Buck Trucking
Nadir #6A
St. Thomas, VI 00802

March 22, 2010
Requisition #3
Period 3/8/10 - 3/19/10

Payment requested for the rental of dump truck and operator for period listed above.

4 days (@ $500.00 per day = $2,000.00

Thank you
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ADL Mail (2) 372410 11:08 AM

From: William Rowles [mailto:vv |INEEEEEENNN

Sent: Wednesday, March 24, 2010 10:45 AM
To: Emad Hanna
Subject: Fw: Little Buck

William Rowles

6100 Red Hook Quarter B3
St. Thomas, VI 00802

(Ph)
(Fax)
(Cell)
E-mail: w

Ul Please consider the environment before printing this email.

----- Forwarded Message ----
From: Monique Har
To: Emad Hanna
Cc: Bill Rowles <w_rowles(
Sent: Wed, March 24, 2010 10:39:06 AM
Subject: Little Buck

Emad,

Attached for payment via Check - Little Buck Trucking Reg# 3 in the amount of $2,000.00. Project 1010
Code 02-211.

Monique
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