
From: Philippe Laznowski 

To: "Jeffrey E." leevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Master Bedroom 

Date: Wed, 02 Jul 2014 13:19:34 +0000 

Attachments: PastedGraphic4liff 

Great 

Thank you 

Can i place the order for all the equipment, 

Can you please send me the signed estimate and how do you want to manage the deposit 

thank you 

Philippe 

Le 2 juil. 2014 a 15:17, jeffrey E. lccyacalion@gmailsin> a ecrit : 

Ok 

On Wednesday. July 2. 2014. Philippe Laznowski wrote: 
Dear Jeffrey. 

Please find attached the estimate to update the master bedroom (tv+crestron) 

If you give me your agreement we will do it as soon as the TV is available (should be in the coming days) 

just to let you know we are on site today to install a temporary solution to control the shades 

I am waiting for your feedback 

Thank you 

Philippe 
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